The Uttar Pradesh Taxation Laws Amendment Act, 1963
Act 14 of 1963

Keyword(s):
Court Fees Act, 1870, Indian Stamp Act, 1899, Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax Act,
1948

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




THE UTTAR PRADESH TAXATION LAWS AMENDMENT
ACT, 1963*

[U. P. AcT no. XIV oF 1963]

tAutharitathe Englisht text of the Uttar Pradesh Kar—Vidhi
Sanshodhan Adhiniyam, 1963}

AN
ACT
to amend certain taxation laws in Uttar Pradesh

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Court Fees Act,
1870 and the Indian Stamp Act, 1899, as amended in their ap-
plication to Uttar Pradesh and the Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax
Act, 1948, for purposes hereinafter appearing ;

IT is hereby enacted in the Fourteenth Year of the Republic
of India as follows

1. (1) This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Taxation
Laws Amendment Act, 1963.

(2) It shall extend to the whole of Uttar Pradesh.

(3) It shall come into force on such date as the State Govern-
ment may by notification in the Gazette appoint.

2. In the Court Fees Act, 1870, in Schedule II—

(@) in article no. 1—

(i) against clause (b) for the words ‘One rupee
and twenty-five naye paise’ wherever they occur,
the words, ‘One rupee and fifty naye paise’ shall
be substituted ;

(ii) against clause (c¢), for the words ‘Two
rupees and fifty naye paise’, the words ‘Three
rupees’ shall be substituted ; and

(iii) against clause (f), for the words ‘Two-

rupees and fifty naye paise’ and the words ‘Five
rupees’, the words ‘Five rupees” and the words
“Ten rupees”’ respectively, shall be substituted ;

(b) in article no. 10, for the words “One rupee and
twenty-five naye paise” and the words “Two rupees
and fifty naye paise,” the words “One rupee and fifty
naye paise” and the words “Three rupees™, respectively,
shall be substituted ;

'For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazette
Extraordinary, dated March 30, 1963.
passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on April 5,
1963 and by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on April 19, 1963.
Received the assentof the President on May 10, 1963, under Article 201
of the Constitution of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette
Extraordinary, dated May 13, 1963.

+Published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary, dated May 13,
1963. '

Act no. VII of
1870 Act no. 1I
of 1899,

U. P. Act no.
XV of 1948,

Short title, ex-
tent and com-

mencement.
Amendment of
Schedule I
of Act mo. VII
of 1870.

|




—_ v
2

(¢) in article no. 17, for the words “Twenty-five
rupees”’, the words “Thirty rupees” shall be substituted ;
and

(d) in article no. 22—
for clauses (a) and (b) the following shall be substituted:

“(@) As a President, Vice-President Two " hundred
or Adhyaksha, Upadhyaksha, rupees.
Nagar  Pramukh, or Up
Nagar Pramukh of a Muni-
cipal Board, Zila Parishad
or Nagar Mahapalika or any
other local body except those
mentioned in clause (c).

(b) As a Sadasya or Vishishta One hundred and
Sadasya of a Nagar Maha- fifty rupees.
palika or as a member of a A
Municipal Board or Zila
Parishad or any other local
body except those mentioned
in clause (d).”

Amendment of 3. In Schedule I-B of the Indian Stamp Act, 1899

Y
T e

B i B e

?
; Schedule  I-B (1) in article no. 5, clause (), under the head Exempii

| .5, , ptions,
I oo mo. I shall be deleted ;

(2) in article no. 24, for the words “two rupees’ the words
“three rupees” shall be substituted |

(3) in article no. 46, for the word and figure “Rs. 5,000”
thez1 word and figure “Rs. 4,000” shall be substituted
an

(4) in article no. 55 for the word and figure “Rs. 3,000”
the word and figure “Rs. 2,000 shall be substituted.

Amendment of 4. In the Uttar Pradesh Sales Tax Act, 1948—
ssctions 2 and .
3-A of U.P. (1) In section 2, after clause (@), the following new clause

Act XV of 1948, shall be inserted and shall be deemed always to have
: been inserted :— }

“(aa) ‘business of buying or selling’ includes such
business carried on without the motive of making profit”;

2) in sub-section (2) of section 3-A, for the words “seven
naye paise” the words ““ten naye paise” shall be substituted.;
and

(3) in section 10, after sub-section (@), the following
sub-section shall be added—

“(4-A) The Revising Authority may transfer any case

or class of cases pending before himself to any additional

"Revising  Authority and likewise transfer any case

pending before an additional Revising Auth Tty tg
another additional Revising Authority or to himself,”’

PSUP—A. P. 15 Genl. (Leg)—1963, 1,770 +32450,(M).




gEL &Y, udis

i i

;
b
;
e
i
i

b
i
t
]
t
i
i
2

TSI AR FAeA1T Fafer (Wt st &) sifafam, 1975
[S¥X s wfafraw e 11, 1978)

[39% waw faqmm awr F faviw 20mdw, 1978 Soawr www W3W famm
g 7 feiw 25 wdw, 1978 097 dov & whww o 1]
'@ #1 Gfqe ALBZ 200 & [T TR 7 fEAw 26 T,
1978 $0 FY ATART 0T T q9T ITT FRAT HATHTT To(E % faget afcfase &
W =T (F) 7 feaiw 27 wiw, 1978 S0 wwiuw gav 1)

SO FAW -, 1948 WX WA werew wfarfran, 1899 F1 AWAT
e 734 W Fhawr st o st @ e 53 9] 99 CIECIE
ar grag faval & fag  s9aew g9 # fag

wfafmaw .
W TIAUST & Sad | ad A Freafafuq statvow aamar o g —
FEAI-UFp
L bl e oo TR TR i b
1--7g afafrrn sa<sw svam fafy (ddaT =i TFT) fafraw, d@faa aw
1978 T STOAAT ) . . Piiee »gen. f

S [SREm At st § faaww § fad gear faaiw 12w, 1978 $0 5 g |

)
A

QAT AAE H Fagray afxface #1 wiw-3-dT (%) fad)




TaT ARy wfy-
fram et 1,
W 1948 %Y
aqqT 2 &
ki)

q1a 3 &1
gmEa

U 3-%F &7
SEICE

2

AATT—Y
IR s_W feRHT 4a, 1948 wUEWEA

2—IUT 7AW ffi-wx G, 1948 M (Ford st &7 wrsqrr o wfafmm |
wg oY) a7 27, wv (W) F, whwwr (2) A, Sv@vw (1) F vy |
‘SRS S wy %, o frgur sy qug sy fmn o @ % o s |
'AfASET & =T At frf O WA R ST agw 0 W gAahT srafir qar
& A7 gATfr g% s AT @ <@ fod wdd R W TAe, 1074 %
=g A, 1975 ' wafw %1 Sy T adq ¥ @ I3 AR T |

3—q& wifafras w7y a1 37/,

(%) smwr (2) &, w ‘vofiw gE @A & mwm‘mmt
' g e S AR s agelt st 1978 & @ @i o
(@) 9ETT (4) & vur 0% Prefafen seETa @ & SR 6% Pt |
ogelt s, 1978 ¥ & Wt awElr SmfY, srafq— ,

“( 4) s TTETY (2) % fafse, AT guE W R, sl
ot -t ad § afafaw #Tr oma, a9 fed srdrgTa @
qTa F N 37 FT AT A Frafafad xHre ¥ A srgey — 1

(%) wwaw afeada & o 1 wafy § qrafes feow-a7 <
wrl IogTr (2) A fafafese a1 9uF wdlw frfe gaofe
afafaa @ 7 it §Y; A< 1

(¥) & ox, 7t aRafed gaafe G araT At o
L

4——{aﬁfaﬁmaﬁm 3-% & gmrq (1) F=- ‘}
(%) e (%) & wa & wmargar W ‘o frmr o wm ;Wi S

() g (@) & o T freafafa gwe @ & aT W] featw oF ]
wiw, 1978 ¥ W@ T gAE T, HAT—
a(m) gt se e forz Wi foremm ww fed dangw sowRw
afeutaa § freq 3 woe_afife o § W) foed @gwa s AT

forz, o AR aqT wERIES (O Fua sfaf, 1939 Faar |

afewtfaa wage Y 781 &, & frva g7 ox frafar ar smarwal aro 1

faoft & o o< 1T sfm #Y a% 9% 1 g Sfhwe & wwiys T A

g3 s Ton g famfa gra difva 53

) wow s & frdva wgew & fafafess are @ aeag § fowr-
sra,srt,) wE & oW A § fafafese eawr 9, oy Showa & owfas
T qx 9%, ford o geeTe fmfi grar Nfed S AR SR AIEA A
fimhy whafee § s faw-faw aw s owra & Grafaw AW
YT Y 7 qAT G .

sty ag § fo— ‘,
| (1) o s & qeae § fratar a1 vmrwat § fear

T S75 Nfawa %Y T 9 47 weag Ahowa § wAfyw @ W wfod

g goRTR, famfer qr T w3, FE ;AWK

2) e qETS, fawfe @, SR SE @ e A
i’rqw(ﬁsr)aft% gfafee frerer @t & WX T9 TR Frrel ot
firelt sfafee 7 gy a<g qFaq <@ awa A< fod sfafes o
frTert a1 qdaq @ A a1 g fawfa § ard fed o



4 : 3

IF_ A, S9N (3) F U F qAA @F gU, TIAMC
dmifay  gwelt Strai E W
, S afafem & -5 FFFH, IR AW -FFF A Nw-TA
T % VAT WX AT HeFAT, WR o & FreAfafay sfraraters que, agr faar

oAt WX feaiw agelt sde, 1974 ¥ agTET TAT FWAT ST, uyfq :—
“sfrry 7 & fe aft o w% frufes wfastd & saqar og
i fE Wi AR ET R E e s vl 9gd A%

fear v g § 9 7w arer § wefh AYE S Fw A Qv

6—7e wiufraw Ft e 3-7 ¥,

(%) Swrw (1) #, o=vw 2 &, w1 Asin a1 Rdagws
et _femnfel s {fear w57, 19719 foaw 114 % wf” Frgta
fed qrad ;

(=) Sara (3%) &, wex “qIeg g T F e 9T wak ‘gure
g @ e s A sfqaeatcors que f, @ (3) fawmw far
wiaat #1T feia qgelt wde, 1978 A, awtfeafy, @ wat ar fywmar mn
qUAT FITT |

‘ - 71— wfafaaa & a7 3~8 fgta & araht, stz ada § frareft woft ot
y B ICLiaT '
8—Ta wfafaaa A a7 4—a &, Iourr (1) H,—-

(T#) we, sx M AT AT 3, 3%, 3-FF, 37 T 3-F & @
T weE, oF ACAAL AW 3, 3%, 3—%%, 3-pwwT AR 34 w@fad
T A feAiw ggel wdd, 1974 ¥ @ W a9F qidw;

() wes, wx "W 9T ~F'F WA I 0K, W 7AT

-

aHE ST, AT
(1) @ (%) & wwarq, featafad @ve qgrfaar s s feais
qeel wE, 1977 FAGIAT AAT THAT GTAAT, FATT—

“(w—1)afe g1 3—9 Y Ivgr (1) % g wqva F1E Nivg
ary fpet G8 sardy g, S SEET gAR %ar §), fret @R gl
saTaTr FY, 9T a1 gl fear ot fqus e S@s @ew |
SugTTr (2) & weltw qrd oot wan fafgaren Areaar 1 yaro-0m
1 a 3g smard, fqed 999 Fu frar, ¢ FaF wraeg & M
mal M frdedl & el @@ ge s faafta gro g fafaa
fafafasz 1 o1, w7 & qaa 0 a1 odt faradY aT av &3 &
T e St usy gomT g fawifag w a4

gfqerd ag @ fs g s @raeg § 39 @ & woftq fipet faafeg

FY faelt OF faais & Al 7090 o GFar § N qgAT WS, 19779
9 & feais 7 Y ¢ ‘ :
i : gua Sfaad ag 3w s@awe s w71 satfaasa @ fag
: frradl 51 WY forat @7 Favites ¥ T01ET 747 o qewar § o gzt wd,
1977 % & #1 faais @
9-—Tq wiufaam Y g7 7-%F &, Iar7 (1) &, we W wxw I (3)”
TN ¢ wee, HE Wi waAT “IuuTd (3—55%” @ fed srdit A< fawiz g9
B, 1972 ¥ T3 07 9AG FEH . ‘
105w sfafram &Y arg 7-9 § g, feafafes arod a@r @

STRAY, st
lf : u7-g (1) fraifca Ofa & st fsa-aq &Y gaufy w1, afs a4
’ fasa g, ®<  gaUlfw gy & [UF ¥ 781, fAFean g9 59q & o

st Mgl § quts frar ata, seiq—<@ ed 2 Q4 ww sy
AT qiw o ¥ &9 g, B¢ faar qtamr AT fed) sraawr

F1 38 TIAT FIAT STET | 58 TH1L Qs &7 94t gaafe
1 3y gfafaaw & ot 51 fraior & sosEl & fag swrar

fasa-ga7 ar="T qTaEE !

“OT0 s-waEw <@ el wrdd W featw qge T wta, 1974 ¥ @ W

T 3HFFT
w1 G

g 3-9 &I
|mas

g1 3% w1
fagrar  atar

g1 4-F &7
gaEa

q 7% &

- g

af gra 7%
N 7-9
XTAT ST

S R RIS

T e e T i g o S0




4

(2) 7@ sfufam & Seaet & sefla 2a =%, qew, satw, mh-ve ar
Fadlt s aa<fa ®Y av atew 5@ a9 gaafn #, afs odt gaafe F
U 7 F1 UM g, Frnean sod F quts far qro, sl O vl & 0d
AR FY, Y gwTE S8 E w9 ), Biw faar qra YT Bt mew A Ay
U §gl fasr ST ’ ‘ -
- 7-a—a wfafwam & fedtara & 3 gu o, afx fedt o frrtor ad # fg |
B gATTN FY geaved gA0fn qiw and ¥ w @) Q139 wtatrae & oqey
IGAT a1 AT WAL QA &R, FF, AT A1 w0 A AT A AT A

F 817 frat W cd aret & ww s v

ST |

UGS ) 11 wfafraa & a1 8- &, freafafew data 6 sdd st femis gl
g w39, 1978 8 53 w8 wwg wd, wafq —

(%) swara (1) F:—

(zF) @ve (7) &, wez WITHF “25,000 70 ¥ woar ¢t wiews
gaafn &, S G 3 FY99ERT ( 2) F wGAT GTU 39 F} J9Gq (3)
F, S off Tor Y, v el Y 913" 8 oo X wse, o W wE)

“30,000% ¥ I TN mfus wwafn ¥ Y, wfafs, oo 3 N
SeaTr(2) P AT G 3T H W (3-F) F AN Fwfvw S o
w feg amw; 9% ‘

(D) T (7) d, wer AT 4% “25,000%0F wuar §6Y wigw
gaqfir &, N1 3 FI99TA (2) B TA—T ATW 39 FH 907 (3) B,
St sy qar Y, e faafrg 7 g’ & T 9T AR, HE AT wER
“30,000 %0 F 71T mferw g S S, wfeafy, @i s & gwwT( 2)

 FATHTY 39 W S0 ( 3F) & wE fnfya £ s @ &K@ e

(f7) wex Y F A’ F v e s ‘o, e o
T & fre T e oiAd, AREA R A §U W Camd gy
ot 7 foag wrdar-aa se-fraftr af # fog a1 sax Geer ¥ ilenfen
mafy & faw, S ok q A S ae yafgs Sy g, farsw awarg )’

7 e % frfafag weg < fedr s, safq—

¢ frater a¥ 1978~79 ¥ TG a1 awww & frg
gEatag @i s faforad @ sefa s fag fan sdar st
FAEdt ARl & fag seara S3F O o § fog fen
ST Fd S GarTiees AT gy g
(=) zea § frfafes, sferaram ve i< s g1 fad
. ST, TE— '
o “gfvary ag & i F1€ STl S FR0E A, 1979 F G
Frelt g eI SO ST § At freret e a1 e
Sarfas FavEer 1 wafy wr auiia $ & Gt gwg gurea v
-%,ﬁﬁmmfa%miﬁf@ww,maﬁr,mm F feq
TR FLEFAT S Y O At A wmra g g S qwEng
ST I B TN HEHT JarieF qEAFn wifaa QA

s feaey a8 § BF agelt wdw, 1978 ¥ ST g9 ey
7 3% A ety & fg R & aHNww F fag g
30 S, 1978 T SR T ST aRa § | _

eqerETT—ave () at@ve () ® st & g freafarad st 0 G g
grr— | ~

| (1) gy 3 ) IeErT (1) F 9w ffo T & S H FI-GgA AT
‘ oy 7 Frr-ae S W wifEE g :

(2) aﬁaﬁw%%&ftw%'m%mmmwm F-99; "X
(3) weh s wrer & for o ferperer 1




5

g 1) ITNU( %)X, @93 (W) F ear a2 Freafafas arg <@ faon s,
ot~

“(w) frdt welaator ad ar ga® a & fag redsar & fag
ST FT THEAT AT FT g% 27 Qv 1 freft < Frarfeor ad a1 s

;mr : fag dfaedtaen F qfFTn R g e gra awg o9 51 G
g

() FTanar (2) &, @w (@) & wgh w40 ot wex “av w7 7T WA G,
fawrr i3 s

(%) g (4) ®,—

(Th) @ve (%) 7, wsx “geafvg gak w@d” & oA 9% Wee
“TIIE gAML A" MW LA AR AT, q@E A A, R
T QLW T gATT 7GR F aregd wn’’ v i o

(&) avz (@) &, wsz “wrar Pasa-w7 & oqr 9% wew Frma-

¢’ @ fad ;o
(=) Swarx (5) Frwrer & s
1 2—@ wialFaw M a7 9 ¥, famfafag quvyw frar sedn sk ga:t sta,
1978 & fiFar wr away sa, Aatq —

(%) I (1) ¥, wex ‘=T frd”’ F earr 0% weT AT A
15 staa 1 ST weg 9T At Q7 e T v A apem QY <@
fea smadt;
(@) 39 3F) § 2arwr qx Frrefirfary SouTer va & Sy, si-
“(3%) Tl G AT wrETE At # AT O, ST
fofr-Fe s A g &1 Sfaw wewx 3| F qvarq, WAt
I T &, CoF 91 4208 F  qfyr ) aget eofirg < g &
sfaeer ag § fF—

(1) 39379 & WA DS rfar-a F@or w9Y frar s
o % & I oy (1) # wfw ahw Faryr swqa  fer
w17, 1 o 7% f afieal 7 Soarq (1) & wAF e qra
st f5d o & fra mfe F1 a1 e w gaata § afafe,
aqr-feufq, 3, wew o wiewe N e gafr ey
mqe%ﬁﬁﬁ HATAT T ST HTFOANT THO G T T FT
fear &Y

(2) o gaq amar wfasrd, fade A agle wol §,
ﬁ%ufwﬁrﬁaaﬁmaﬁm,w,gwmamaﬁ@—fﬁrém-
flr &7 T F37 & qvag 7 qHad| gue Y siwel § g2l
qHAT § AT g (AT HT THAT 5

(3) =@ 399w # w9 F1E oW AR @ fow ¥ wfaw
S G RT, 9 O 6 wftwwat ], g5 sty Y wifa £ ¢,
g gl & o § frd faea agelt wfm Srad @ w7
frator afasrdt & aorEr sfagfe v 2 v s

(T)suar (8) %, wes “gm wfufr § o &Y o arelr e @
I 9% W 58 ur B w1 wAEt A sew weArga @ el s o
1 3—q& afafaw faw 107, e e ar Frden” gt A A A
% e e O @ fon s s aget s, 1978 & T wn @wmn
ATEAT | '

14—9e sfafard & 977 11 9R 115 % @ o faefafes g @ @
sradfl, feiq — '

“11-(1) xR =Afm ST gra 10# ITrw (2) & odlw fad T owRw

fadty Araet @ ¥ ofew ), IF wRW  fang, Q@ ARw ariE RRR o

39 AwEm F fiw Y aes fema Nax gvw A 7 5 SR )

T AR | AW & AU smdad #% awar & fF ama @ fafu-sw
R § ,

a9 WY
ELieEd

T 10 ¥/
gmya

g7 11 7
11-% & 1
AL UTU F'
TG AT




YT
LERE

18 H7

, 6 :
sfererea 7g } 5 afk tar wiw aeag =i qoos wiw woum fafe (daea

YT defiwor) wfafam, 1978 g1t auy shwwfia @ a<r ® g7 # fats
P (% s @ aru A gaw faaiw a1 w1 §) o fed e v e aa

g, oI sdw-9a 39 & faw g (1) &, q&@ Fagewm fawiw @

FS
€, fafte G v fw #i wafy saa favis 9 gwre 758 &1 ) gew wafe

9 feqis & i3 fem & gz prderr § g sndsw s amar

(2) #r ot S grdeorsifsrd an sfafor HUFTY & TR
& e g ara & wefim, Steft i g 9o fevi # 4% g ofY, w1 faa
3T g e R Y, g @), afe s (4) & wew, S fr ag 9w
ferts # 3% (F ), 959 AEwE § s @R @ fau i awe w@
g2, 97 feais & wed fa oY sy & ot gow e @ qrdew & fag
| WTAET T T £ | '

(3) afzgoary (1) 713997 (3) F Wi, ey o & 9o Femris & St
g4 o, ¥ srefr-aa e sfaw @ afefan grow sl gra fag
@mina@wmﬁmw@ﬁmﬁm@mm&wﬁmﬁ
st f5 o v (1) ¥ fafwiase , v §1wfy &, @ G it e 10 Y

I (2) & 7 fd T wRw & foreg g fmiw ¥ oA R & e

3% ArgTeg § e $ A0 58 ME 97 srieT #X aFarg 5 oame F
fafa-srer § 1
(4) o (1) @1 Swarq (2) F o e & fag A8 srdAr-
9 AW AL} T ST, o9 a% 5 SS9 gerd &1 A 7 gy fowd s
" 04 0—ff-F Ffm——Trsy faf-w7 fafaaw & miw miwai—(4) w77
sftgat”’ & seadta < &1 gHTE T8 9w ST et gy
sfaerg ag § Fr foefr-a sfaw g a1 ses MR § o a1 fafa
#, Y gt ST FAT FAIEE T g0 |

(5) Suara (1) av oy (3) & e, el f & ova RAiw R AF T

- o, 59 TSy § M (Reference) R & foF el wmden-aa, 9 o
 feats @ grder sty ar sifufo i st & aae feraia
g1, S g T EATAIE gt ST, W1 7% 959 gy 1 gHnn gy
s v e § fafraw § & 98 S¥ 5@ 9T & 99 AT § e

- ¥ T HEFAT § AT IAHT (AT FETETE FT AT
(6) afe s=% =y 7 9% famisw % Q& Qe afwrd a1 Afafea
gQeTr FieFT & ST ((4) B i, S ag g Rt F Awad @,
- qrRe 1 faaw g & e g e #Y 9 39 Y wie #Y &y av gur
. wfgsTdY, a9mier, G He &1 garEd ST M AAT gETT 9 6T A

| - ayefY QAT SHEAT ST X IwHT fazarer qggee e e

(7) grdmr sfasrd a1 afafe ey sfaFmd § qRaam 3y 5,
e a1 7d-208 T TgAY, ¥ g7 a0 & e grQfirg wF A wiw 7 afy
g), Traw FTEAT-99 7 freqrw G aF cafrg A @ arad, feeg afe
o qa e § fai 74 wiaw aiw & afonweasT O &7, gon a1 74-308

C & grafw F7 $T & S v sfus gaaf areg w8 S

(8)3= AT TUOGW & waf} F gRATE FTT F qEAR e fata-
g% FT forg S, AR afe T faofa & afvoraeasy #3, 6% F1 H9-T0€ A
gaafo #Y R & waefea foar st gafag §) &) 399 e gaata s
fipT & TEETRW HYF & fag favfa 1 o afs, guferfs, @ sfasd
sfafaa Qe afasTd F 47 avar d, o) qgoros @0 #fywrd 4@
STRW 3T S 99 AU B FARTC AU H1 (R 739 & g wraems g |

(o) ufceir wfufrga, 1963 # aT<r 5% Ivawy, TW ATV F AT T7-
Qan & fad fod 7 g d® NFF1-99 9T, I gfeadal afga awg v
TS FTN——IF G F TN F 10 vz “wrs sfra’ & seaa fahi-H

Ffggag W g\

1 5oy sifirfirar Y AT 18 , WAL HF 25,000 7T, S FY A A
&, & TqTA T MR ACHF 50,000 TN’ 7@ faF A AW fawAiw wgEd s,
1978 ¥ TG TG RA WG _

N o . Potag i S N o e e S G i e e e e e S R S AR S G
b e S S e e G L S i R s o i g i i e s e e s g e R s S S ki

i




, 7
1 6——e wfafan wY arw 22 &, 3vw1w (1) F s R freafafe soarad 4T 22 S
@ @ S 9 feAiw agelt A, 1973 & <@y A e S, gaiq-—- - daa

“(1) =% fagtes, adte gad ama, gadaw a1 gfafoaa g@adan ahiesrd,
gfaae & F@T ¥ &Y g5z §F ard) frdt ww &1 o 99 wRw &, faad gan
firar srar 2, faats @ e s & s, TawsarE § av s ar G e fgaag
safyd & srdAr-qd 9% FT 9FKIATE ¢

sfaaen ag & fr aft 3o ara & @i wrdar-ga 7 ad $ 997 wafy & H9T
et a7 & @) dag wfusrd IaFr AR d af F gvarg W9 5T aHAT |

graT sfagw ag & 5 dar $1% qarg, s gara fraifca st agrr

m, a9 g T4 fear s wa aw B gag wfesrd T G9r w9 & 999

gfrymg S gua §9g o ar afEr s a Qg A1 IR gAarg F
gfag wagw 7 2 frar g

17-—97 afafaa £ 97 A7EA q,— : 97 FAgaAY
(=) adama wfafsz 67 % gearm freafafea sfafte agr & i@y, safq— a1 dorga "

1 2 3

5 . Ye7-% : qIq ST fao wwmo:_-

’

(@) adwr afafsz 8o frwrar & straefy g faaris ool o, 1978 o
frrelt Tt qaaY Sy ) 4

18—(1) gy faafta dear q@wo Yo-N-334fzm~1012-71, Fam
15 AF¥aT, 1971 %\ fgaiw ag=l feavas, 1973 ¥ fagfeq anmr stgar )

(2) sewry fasifta e wao A 0-31-9060[38~11(2)-75, feaim 2 swady,
| . 1976 ¥ Wi “qIT AT I Y AN F £ATT T W “aqr A qret” @ feq
ﬁ Wik gda § <@ 10 qAd A o
' (3)W'Tfasrf_ra_if@m TH0 & 0-31~9957[78~11-( 2)-75, favix 6 HLa,
1978 1 59 oA & feais & & fagfea andt srgdy )

‘1 9——IAT IIW fashr-wt faw, 1948 % faw 25-% & — , faaw 25-% €1
(1) 89 fraw (1) &, wsg “ard S F TeaTg Wex “av wEAT afeqy  AOET
F' Tg feir I A feats aget wia, 1976 § 1@ 7 qw wnAT;
(2) =9 fmaw (1) % ovar feafafad ST fras sgr fear s it
feats Tgely snia, 1978 ¥ qgTAT 141 GAAT AAAT, Foafq~——

“(1-%) Fe-fagieor a9 1978~-79 ¥ wrwar F wATY-97 AT IOE
FAFE & fog srfT-ga &7 wx-fraton ast & fag fagr s
A ol ww & fag wdAed veAs v oad & fag faa
straat fod o & i advwTor F31 aar d

| sfrag ag § f6 F1E AQTQ SN 31 9419, 1979 & qesry frd gug
: STATL STXFY FIAT § At Foraalt araar ar adwey darfas qdrgor
a1 wafy A guilea F qd ot aua qara far , aarfeafy, wreaa
* SHO-0F AT I ANFW F faq o ww gty & fad ara
FLHFA G A TH fearw mr auvd Qdl ) fed avsrg swfa

sraeel & e s darfew adfwr gatay gar g

_saR iy a8 g 5 aget wdw, 1978 ¥ v Y Aot i
aq & watn & fag wremar & swArge & AdEw § o s
T& 30 S[7, 1978 A% Y& fFar o wwAT ¥ )]

(3) s fram (3) 7, 053 A AT “50 799 ' 5K “25 70 & oy 0%
FHA: TR AT HF 100370 #T_ “50 798" wq f&q q0AT ML frais
qgelt widw, 1978 ¥ 7@ WY g9 qAT; ‘ :

(4)39 faaw (5)% tarw 9 faeafafaa g7 fraw w@ far s, safg-—
() 99 fraw (1F) AR (12) F wew) & weiy gy

w1 suiv-aw, Jfeafs, 3qfaam (1) ar 99 faw (1
QIEAT-9d HEIT K3 F eqis § waraly grw ;-

.

faafeg W
gayas

8T, ATEAT
F) @ Adx




8

(5) S9fram(11)F qwar feafafaa 3o fraw aa1 fea sram, Y- ‘

“(12) 1989, 1976 % T wT Far war AT w1 yAM-9E 3@
femts & et 7 75 S, T weafe AT 9w A § frg
& 1A% & SuaEl & qaR wieT s awa §

.. Yfqwey ag § 5 < frafeor af 1976~77 31 197778 & vl |
& fog sTdaT-aw 30 97, 1978 &% far o wwar §, WK 99 FqT § -
HI0 #qg w< fraieon ad Y qgelt sster ¥ vy gy 1 1

AL 20—(1) fodl eraras an sfusrdt & faelt faota, feoft ar 3w 5 i gr o, |
“"Wﬂ"‘"f ERUTT & ITOH 5 7@ T IS 1 a1 H0dang), st g9 wearq g aqE@miag 9a |
LALIC wfafrn & swardi & wgared), 48 @ fafiarer o fafagt awet q@ s

wda & fafuarra aix fafage’ @Y @l o@N wize searg & Soew adt |

ATTHF TAA T T o

(2) aatfeafy, 5% faaies, odita gav atan; gadewr @1 sfafe grdeor
HHTLT H G127 o T et e & srrft fodlh [ 7 QTR %<\t 8, afx et 4
9 39 A4 g0 Ha wiufraw § fed @ g $ #1or Seaw g gy | QT gy 4
q0 F AT § TF 99 & wafd d Wiag, a1 @ wfafem g0 aqEng ga afd-

’ ffrzrq w1 T 22 ¥ fafafass safh & e, i qusmaadt @Y, fear o1 asat § :

stfcraeer ag & fir Qe 1€ QurT, Forert it et s &) Gt g1, a% an |
T\ fopat S g7 @F fr qag wfaarQ 3 3w £ S wod wfOTrT #) gear ang
_EanaT<Y ot sata A7 4 & Y gY AT SEnt gaens w Sfua A< A fan g

(3) wr&f, 3@ aTq & Sreew & qF oY rararery at sfgwrQ 7 fa srdardt &

To wiafaan & gt fEe w3 frator, sguge an 9ug fFar &), a1 Q& w3 fruia,

' IV AT §Hg B (U a1 gwq:) afsyq, wotey @ wivefed 9 &1 F1E www |
fear gY WY Tar H< fAaiaor a7 oo 1w, g0 qEATF QoIeHi H  qfOrHeEy, qW
qEITT T MGG To wfafaan & Sqal & w@wa ) 917 agh seara (2%

® ITAeHT F w1 @Q gy, TAAG! A A e a1 fwFT wfwaT Q¥ qrow R
feats & wrewrd & Aa F-fraton ar s o gafaesT o0 & QU afasrd

AT FATATRA Y AEAAT-TF & FFQAT G, HIT AGIVA QA wfoatq a sqraqy FAAET |

&1 gAfadTET F FFar § A1 T8 (64 79 Wy § af g a7 gaieTs % ge gar- |
TRy & AaT § S 59 wEATT | ITAHT H) AAE a1 & Fq¢ grawas g ;

el T —IaT (1), (2) W (3) F sorard, €rer 18 ST 19 F SAA
Y G wrfafam & d@aa @9« oT@T | :

(4) fst saranera at sty & felt frvota, et ar s & et ara 2 99 |
g W, —
| (%) 2faaray, 1976 & 10 faaz, 1976 #1 gafy &, —

(ur) wrars faed gare AT rd o afenfaa §, fae faed arat;
HIHT, T AT AALY afenfea 7€)}, W< 3

() %T wram & wrErd § fawo-aq o g @ gra fan @
e 7, AT fawa 1 3T T HT R goww; AT

(@) 1%, 1966 ¥ 30 famay, 1977 71 safy & &A1 FT1T 5 g7 |

(fared faat sar S gom, foal ararorqar “{E St wg7 arar g, W g
gfeafaa §) F weaey § fasva-g7 oz famtar a1 sratasal grar fasl 5 oo |
7T 3 Afema F1 T H FT RGN0

(5) g wlafraw =Y a7 8% & fpdt a1q & g1 gQ oY, 57 U7 &7 STV 4
(1) # @ (1)% (F) Fr e ag Iq TR A0 (ST NN §
wfafaas, 1976 %1 a1 9grw Sfwefo fad wi f, s friwrad 1976-77 9
graen § daelaar a1 YoEsw £ qdgn & fag adl seat-gel T |, §
w13 }aT TroAT-97 age whw, 1976 F T3 AT qwATq frat AT gV, AT THAT AT 4

a

e ————.
———
—————————.
S ————rr
e
P e—
"
E———.
B —
e Tre—
A———————-c.
e —
P —
———n—o .
AR
P —
e —
P T ———
S ——— -
P e—
e ——




9
TR w@rey sfafraw, 1899 W gwe
21~%8 wEATa & IR ) fedin 1 qwad, 1078 & wqw awHT Q137

22=-I9 W & gyt wqfir F araen F quienifag vty s sfaf,
1899 %Y (fa¥ wrt g weara & To wfufan wgraard) o 2 ¥ ave (27)
foreter fear smmm

23~w wfafman 8 arar 300 forptar Y st o
24—Tw wiafaws dt ara 11-% frwre ft aranft
25—7u sftfaaw st a1 6 4o frpte & sraft |

26—q% wfufrom o e 147 §, wqeda 250 frrey far v 1

T —TT
WIS

- FaT e 37——(1) IIT TR WA fafy (FWga oz Jvwor) worke, 1977
m' o ’:3 Qe fofa fipar et 0 }
o 1077 (2) 3 Frca 3 F gu W, I9a1 (1) ¥ el syomrher grer e
h wear 31 W1 v & el g wifafirrt & wellr g 98 wrdk a1 wrdat g -
Pt grar s cimfire g st & acears Seawt & gty o o or FRAT
T SR, Y g7 sfafiem & Sqaw q W@, gl AT G )

forao g0 No-go Mo 257 Wro (firar0)—6-10-78-( 2293)~1978~1834-+505 S (Vo) 1

wiafaan g
287 1899 %Y
LISUREE I
dnww

1T 3-T T o1
frrprar qTar
q1T 11-% &7
fasrar wrar
1T 64-% &7
fawtar o

" 1-
&7 gogq

faewmn  wlx

s T

o e e R




	1963UP14FirstPage.pdf
	1963UP14.pdf
	1978UP11



