The Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institutions (Prevention of

Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers) Amendment) Adhiniyam, 1965
Act 8 of 1965

Keyword(s):
Hindu Public Religious Institution, Transfer of Property

Amendments appended: 11 of 1971, 17 of 1973,11 of 1975, 31 of 2000

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




PRI .

o .Q_‘..‘,- k ’ \ :
Do oF :
[ " S

E UTTAR PRADESH HINDU PUBLIC RELIGIOUS
INSTITUTIONS (PREVENTION OF DISSIPATION OF
PROPERTIES) (TEMPORARY POWERS) (AMEND MENT)
ADHINIYAM, 1965.

(U. P. Act No. VIII oF 1965)

[* Authoritative English text of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Sarv-

janik Dharmik Sanstha (Sampatti Apvyaya Niwaran) (Asthai
Adhikar) (Saishodhan) Adhiniyarn 1965.) -

AN
ACT

to amend the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institutions
(Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
Act, 1962.

WHEeREAs the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institutions
(Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1964 was promulgated by the Governor

on December 14, 1964 to amend the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public

Religious Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties)
(Temporary Powers) Act, 1962;

AND WHEREAS it is expedient and necessary that the said
Ordinance be replaced by an enactment of the Legislature ;

It is hereby enacted in the Sixteenth Year of the Republic
of India as follows:

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public

Religious Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties)
(Temporary Powers) (Amendment) Adhiniyam, 1965.

2. In sub-section (3) of section 1 of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu
Public Religious Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Pro-
perties) (Temporary Powers) Act, 1962, hereinafter called the prin-
cipal Act, for the words “two years”, the words “four years”
shall be substituted.

3. In section 4 of the principal Act—

(i) in clause (a) of sub-section (1), for the words “A Com-
missioner” the word “Commissioners” shall be substitufed.

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words “the Commissioner”’
the words “a commissioner” shall be substituted.

{*For statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazette
(Extrao_rdinary), dated February 15, 1965 in Hindi and February 19, 1965
in English.]

{Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on February
16, 1965 and by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on March 5, 1965.]

[Received the Assent of the President on March 18, 1965 under Article 201,

of the Constitution of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette
Extraordinary, dated March 20, 19635.]

Short title,

Amendment of
section 1 of U. P,
Act no. XXII of
1962.

Amendment of
section 4. -



Amendment of
section 5.

Amendment of
section 6.

Amendment of
section 7,

Amendment of
section 185.

Repeal of U. P.
Ordinance no. 5
of 1964.

(1) in sub-section (4), for the words “The Commissioner™
the words “A Commissione:” shall be substituted ; and

(iv) in sub-section (5), for the words “The Commissioner,.
the Assistant Commissioner and the Investigation Officer”
the words “A Commissione:, an Assistant Commissioner
and an Investigation Officer” shall be substituted.

4. For section 5 of the principa! Act, the following shall be
substituted.

Only Hindus to 9. A Commissioner, an Assistant Commissioner
be Commissioners, and an Investigation Officer shall be appointed
ete. out of persons professing the- Hindu religion.”

S. In sub-section (2) of section 6 of the prii‘lc'ipal" Act, for the
words “the Commissioner” the words “A Commissioner” shall
be substiiuted.

6. For section 7 of the principal Act, the following shall be
substituted :

“7. (1) Notwithstanding anything in any other law for the
Previous appro- time being in force, no transfer of property
val necessary for belonging 0 a Hindu Public religious insti-
transfer of pro- tution shall be valid unless prior written
perty, sanction of the Commissioner or, where the
value of the property sought to be transferred does not exceed
rupees two hundred and fifty, of the Assistant Commissioner,
having jurisdiction over the institution, on the ground of the
transfer being necessary or beneficial to the institution, has
been obtained. )

Explanation—For the purposes of this section transfer does not
include the customary use or distribution of any movables as
Bhog, Prasad and the like. '

(2) Any person aggrieved by an order of a Commissioner
or an Assistant Commissioner may within thirty days from the date
thereof, appeal against that order to the District Judge within
whose jurisdiction the headquarter of the Hindu public religious
institution or the propsrty concerned lies and the order passed .
by the District Judge ia the appeal shall be final.”

7. For clause (ii) of sub-section (2) of section 15 of the principal
Act, the following shall be substituted :

“(ii) the procedure to be followed for seeking sanction
for the proposed transfer of property under section 7.”

8. The Utfar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institutions
(Prevention of Dissipztion of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
(Amendment) Ordinance, 1964 is hereby repealed and the pro-
visions of sections 6 and 24 of the U. P. General Clauses Act, .
1904 shall apply as if, it were an eractment repealed and re-enacted
by an Uttar Pradesh Act. : :

PSUP—AP. 87 Genl. (Leg.)—1965. 1.862 (M).



st s
RS

135571 T ARSI i

Cep2_
gaz waw frg adstas afas (meafa sasmm framor) ""%.
(e srfawre) (T @ W) sifafraw, 1970 T S

— . ‘_‘%{1 gﬁfﬁ{)
(e sRwr sfafre ger 11, 1971) (TS g, ane
. R AQW
(eatmﬁaﬁ«m%mm&am1970§oammsr%srfaaﬁq&w§ . Tt -
F faetiep 23 fravayg, 1970 £o 3 fo5 § Ty fwar 1) L
(‘wrE @ d@faaE’ § 6T 201 F sreapta et A fiw 10wy, 1971 Fo
1wy STE F aqr ST e FIETR SrETaTer a9 & frrew 12 g, 1971 %0
# wwrfed gaTl) ‘
mz&w%ﬁqﬁmmm(maqmm) (srearfy wfewT)  guw w3w wf-
1962

afgfaaw
ot orasT & e ot & Frefafaa sfafee s o g

I%mmm@mmm (wwfer srreqm dfer ™
firarar) (weardt wifivsTe) (Srd @ 1) sfafr, 1970 ST |

21— WX fgg  wnwte mfwe dear (W wead Fmon) e st wfe-
(weardt wgerL) sfafwr, 1962 e | A e (3) Fuk ‘s ak” T WA fraw der 22,

wx A g o 1962 &t g
(ﬁmmmﬁ%m*mmmlsmwmiommﬂ L o st
st e Afad i) Frice 95 Paise

Yo QHo Yo fowgo To—351 Fe (&“")""1971*1,830 (59) |



| g 304 7. A

°  THE UTTAR PRADESH HINDU PUBLIC RELIGIOUS INSTITUTIONS /57’72‘ /7
P (PREVENTION OF DISSIPATION OF PROPERTIES) (TEMPORARY ‘
POWERS) (CONTINUANCE) ACT, 1978. @b, 3

(U. P. Act No. 17 of 1973) e

[*Authoritative English Text of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Sarvajanik Dharmik ﬁ%ﬂ?{ Wc?.q
Sanstha (Sampatti Apvyaya Niwaran) (Asthai Adhikary (Jari Rakhne ka) ¢ :

Adhiniyam, 1973.] (maﬂz WeBTHA )
AN . o
ACT ‘ AL AW, et |
| SR - o
l;;o further to extend the life of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institu- "
of Zons g(é’zrevention of Dissipation of Properties)y (Temporary Powers)
ct, 1962.

It 1s HEREBY enacted in the Twenty-fourth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

1. This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious short title.
Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
(Continuance) Act, 1973.

2. In subsection (3) of section 1 of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Amendment — of
Religious Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary section 1 of U. P.
Powers) Act, 1962, for the words “ten years” the words “twelve years” shall be f;éz no. XXII of
substituted. :

(*For Statemént of Objects and Reascons, please see Uttar Pradeéesh Gazette
(Extraordinary) dated December 14,1972))

(Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Counci} on December 14, 1572, and
by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on Martch 7, 1973).

_ {Received the Assent of the President on May 19, 1973 under Article 201, of the
Constitution of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazette Extraordinary,
dated May 23, 1973).

Price .05 Paise

TR oW A

%u V R A
JP—A. P. 109 Li3A.~=1974— 1648+ 50 (M.)

TR



THE UTTAR PRADESH HINDU PUBLIC RELIGIOUS INSTITUTIONS
(PREVENTION OF DISSIPATION OF PROPERTIES) (TEMPORARY
POWERS) (CONTINUANCE) ACT, 1975.

[UTTaR PRADESH AcT No. 11 oF 1975]

[duthoritative English text of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Sarvajanik Dharmik
Sanstha  (Sampatti Apavyaya Niwaran) (Asthai Adhikar)  (Jari Rakhne
ka) Adhiniyam, 1975 ]

AN
\ ACT
:ct Px;a. further to extend the l:fe of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious Institu-
XXIl of tions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
1962. Act, 1962, -

IT 15 HEREBY enacted in the Twenty-sixth Year of the Republic of India
as follows :—

L. "This Act may be called the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public Religious  Short title.
Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers)
{Continuance) Act, 1975.

2. In subsection (3) of section 1 of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Public  Amendment of
Religious Institutions (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary section 1 of U. P.
Powers) Act, 1962 for the words “Twelve years”, the words “fourteen years” shall Act no. XXiI of
be substituted. . 1962.

3. The Uttar Pradesh Hindu Religious Institutions (Prevention Repealof U, p.
ot Dissipation of Properties) (Temporary Powers) (Continuance) Ordinance, g?‘lig}/ince ne. 22
1974 is hereby repealed. :

(For Statement of Objects and Reasons, please see Uttar Pradesh Gazetre Extraordinary,
dated December 28, 1975.)

(Passed in Hindi by the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Assembly on December 30, 1975 and by
the Uttar Pradesh Legislative Council on February 27, 1975.)

(Received the Assent of the President on March 25,1975 under article 201 of the Constitution
of India and was published in the Uttar Pradesh Gazetre Extraordirary, dated March 29, i575.)

PSUP.-A. P. 68 Samanya (Vidhayika) 985—1975—1,805 (M.)




Short title and
Commencement

Repea) of U, P,

. At no. 22 af

1962 as re enact=d
and modifieo by
. P, Actau. §5

of 1973

Rep=al ~ of.
Ordingrce

Elngngnq1 9-—godto 166 aTo faare--(2331) ==2000-~850 (R%0) 1

—-Ill-liln—!-

" No. 2449 {2}fK"¢'[I-\~"~1—-l (KA}-Z&-E{JI]{)
: - Dated Lucknow, N@pember 1, 2000
!N pursuance of the. prqmiom of clause {3) of Amu[& 348 of the

Coastitution, the Governor is pleased to order the publication of the
following English® translation of the Uttar Pradesh Hindu Sarvjanik

Dharaik Saystha (Apvyaya Ka Nivardap) (Nirsan) Adhiniyam, 2000 (Uttar
Pradesh Adhiniyam Sankhya 31 of 2000) as passed by the Uttar Pradesh
Legislature and assented to by the Goveraor on October 31, 2060 :—

THE UTTAR PRADESH HINDU RELIGIOUS INSTITUTIONS
{PREVENTIBH OF DISSIPATION OF PROPERTIES)
(REPEAL) ACT, 2000

(U: P. ACt 0. 31 oF 2000)
[As passed by ;Ite Uttar Prades}; Legislature]
- AN
ACT .
to repeal the Uttar Pradesh Hmdu Public Religious fmrrmnam
(Prevention of Dissipution of Properties) Act, 1962 _
1T 1s Herepy cnacled in the Fifty-first year of the ‘Republic of Iadia

. as Fﬂ[IﬂHs — .

(1) This Act ma},r be "called I:he Uttar PradLSh Hindu Relizious
In;t;tutmu (Prevention of Dissipation of Properties) (Repeal) Act, 2000,

(2) It shall be deemed to have come mtn force on August 26, 2000,

2. The Uttar Pmdesh Hindu Pubh" Religious [nstitutions {Pre-
vention ﬂfnlss;patmn of Properties) m:i 1962 is hereby h.deI»..d

3. The Uttar Fradesh Hindu Public Religious Ins £|tutlmts {Preventmn
of 1}1331{'&:1011 of Propertics) {Bepeal) Drdmancc, 2000 18 hor eby’ repealed,

By urd_f:r,-
Y. R. TRIPATHI,
Pramukh _Saﬂ:iv.

T




	1965UP8FirstPage.pdf
	1965UP8.pdf
	8 of 1965.pdf
	UP Act 11 of 1971.pdf
	UP Act 17 of 1973.pdf
	UP Act 11 of 1975.pdf
	UP Act 31 of 2000.pdf


