The Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Allowances and Pension
Act, 1991

Act 7 of 1992

Keyword(s):
Assembly, Speaker, MLA, Salary

Amendments appended: 9 of 1994, 16 of 1995, 5 of 1997, 12 of 1998, 12 of
1999, 4 of 2003

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




17

ORISSA ACT 7 OF 1992

*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS’ SALARY,
ALLOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1991

[Received the assent of the Govertior on the 23rd January, 1992 first published in an
extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, dated the 30th January 1992) '

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 1954,

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in the Forty-second
Year of the Republic of India as follows:i—

Short title 1. This Act may be called the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members® Salary,
Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1991,

Amendment 2, In the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members® Salary, Allowances and Pension Orissa A
of Act, 1954, in section 2, for clause (b-1), the following clause sball be substituted, g.orjoss
section 2, ely 1o b 190f 1954

* (b-1) “Leader of the Opposition” means that Member of the Assembly who is,
for the time being, the Leader in the Assembly of the party in Opposition to the
Governmcnt having the greatest numerical strength, not being less than one-tenth
of the total membership of the Assembly, and recognised as such by the Speaker.

Explanation—When there are two or more parties in opposition to the
Government in the Assembly having the same numerica]l strength, the Speaker
shall, haviog tegard to the status ol the parties, recognise any one of the Leaders
of such parties as the Leader of the Opposition for the purpose of this Act, and
such recognition shall be final and conclusive.’,

*For the Bill, sce Orissa Gozeite, Extraordinary, dated the 10h September 1991 (No. 1094)



28
ORISSA ACT 9 OF 19%4

*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS® SALARY,
- ALLOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1994

. |Received the oassent of the Governor on the 2nd May 1994, fipst pub]ished inan
extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, dated the 9th May 1994. ] , :

AN AcT FURTHBR To AMEND THB OR1ssA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBRRS
SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENsiON AcT, 1954.

E BE it cnacted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in  the Forty-fifth Year
of the Republic of India as follows:—

Short thtle, 1. This Act may becalled the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary,
Allowatces and Pension (Amcndment) Act; 1094,

Am"nﬂmm 2. Inthe Orissa Legislative Assembly Members, Salary, Allowances and Pensmn o aet

Sﬂ‘:ﬂnn €B  Act, 1954, in section 4-B3,— : 19 of 954,

"(a) for sub-section (1) excluding the Explanation thereto, the foliowing shall
be substituted, namcly: —

<*(1) With effect from the commencement of ‘the Orissa Legislative
Assembly Members® Salary, Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Act,
1994 thery shalt be paid a- pension of seven hundred rupees por mensem te
every person who has held office for a2  period of four years, Whether
continuous or not, as a member of the Assembly: )

Provided 1hat where any person has held office for a period cxcceding ﬁd\;(l:
years, there shall be paid to him an additional pensioa of one hundred
ropees per mensem for every yeur in excess of {ve years:

Provided further that where any pension has held office as a member of
Aszamdly twicr forits durction as provided in clause (1) of article 172
of the Constitution, whether cbnsccutivcly or not, and who is not entitled
to any pension under the foregoing provisions of this sub-section, he shall,
with ffrct from the commencement of the Orjssa Legislctive  Assembly
Members® Salary, Allowancesand Pension (Amendment) Act, 1994, He
entitled to a peneion of seven hundred ropees per mensem” :

(_b) in clause (ii) of tke Explanation to eub-section (1) in sub-clause (b) for the
words “Hve years,” ihe words ‘“four ycars” shall be substituted;

(c) for sub-section (35, the following sub-scction shall be substituted, namely:—

“(3) Wherc any peréon entitled to pemsion under sub-section (1) is
entitled lo any other pension, such person shall be eptitled to receive the
pension under sub-section (1) in addition to such other pension’; and

(d) in clause (b) of sub-section (5), forthe words ““five . years™, the words
“four years” shall be substituted.

* Fer the Bill see Orissa Gazetré, Extraordinary, dated the 5th April 1994 (No. 396)



59
Orassa ACT 16 oF 1995

THE ORIS_SA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND
| | PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1995

TABLE OF CONTENTS . .

PREAMBLES
SECTIONS
1. Short title and commencement’
2. Amengmens of section 3
3. Amendment of section 4
4. Amendment of sectiop 4-4
. 5 Amendment of section 4-AA . )




é0

ORISSA ACT 16 oF 1995

*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS® SALARY, 'ALLOW-
. . ANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1995

[ Received the assent of the President on the 27th August 1995 “first published
in an extraordinary issuc of the Orissa Gazeite, dated the 28th August 1995)

I
AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORIS6A LEGISLATIVE ASSEMPLY MEMBERS™ SALARY,
: ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 1954, :
- L.

BS it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in the Forty-sixth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:— . '

Short title” 1. () This Aet may be called the Orissa Legislative As<embly Members’ Salary,
and comme- Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1995, :

(2) It shail come int{o'force on the Istday of August, 1995,

‘:}” ;‘;;‘;‘;g“g, 2. In the Orissa Legislalive Assembly Members’ Salary, Allowances and Pension
Act, 1954 (hereinafter referred (o as the privcipal Act), in the third proviso to |
section 3, for the words “four bundred fifty rupees”, the words “six hundred and Om?ﬂ Aﬂ4
_ fifty rupees” shell be substituted. 190f 1954.

Amendment - 3- 1o section 4 of the principal Act,—
"of section 4 .
(D) in .clause (5), for the words *'seventy-five rupees”, the words “one hundred
and fifty rupees” shal] be substituted ; and

(iiyin clause (d). for the words “three hundred and "ﬁfty rupees”, the words
“seven hundred and filty rupees” shall be substituted. .

Ameﬂimm 4. In the principal Act, for section 4-A, the following section shall be substi-
‘;f_;m lon tuted, namely:——. ’
- A There shall be paid to cach Member a 61_1111 of rupees two thousand per -
mensem to defray the cost of travelling which is not connected with the busi-
ness of the Assembly or 2 Committee therenf or 2 Committee or Bo‘dy consti-
tuted by the State or Central Government by a Resolution or ar order.”,
Amﬂhd?""t_, 5, In the principal Act, in section 4-AA, for the words ¢‘eightcen thousand-
ﬁf :ﬁ‘t ON “rupees”, the words *thirty-five thousand rupces” shall be substituted.

*For tbe Bill, see Orissa Gazette, Extraotdidary, dated the 29th July 1995 (No. 882)



15

DR‘ISSA ACT 5 OF 1997

*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS’ SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1997 -

[Recefped the assent of the Governor on the 20th May 1997, first pubjished In an exiragrdinary
issue of the Qrissa Gazette, dared the 26th May 1997]

.. AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THB ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS™ SALARY,
ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 1954

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in the Forty-clghth
Year of the Republic'of India as followsi—

Short Htle. 1. This Act may ba called the Orissa Legislative Assemb]y Members’ Salary,
Allowances and Pensjon (Amendment) Act, 1997.

Amendment 2. In section 4 of the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members® Salary, Allowances
of and Pension Act,” 1954, in clause (¢),— OHrsa Ant
n 4. 15 of 1954,
(i) in sub-clause (7), for the words <“highest class available immediately
below the Air-conditioned class”, the words “Air-comditionred, Two
Tier"™ shall be subs'tituted' and

(i) in sub-clause (i), for the words “forty paige”, the words “fifty paise”
shall be substituted.

*For the Bill see Orissa Gazetre, Extraordinary, dated the 5th April 1997 (No. 430).



37.
CORIsSA ACT 12 oF 1998

" THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS’ SALARY, ALLOWANCES
AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998

TABLE OF CONTENTS

PREAMBLE
SecTIoNs
1. Short title and commencement
2. Amep.t;l_:nent of section 3
3. Amendment of section 4
4, Amendment of section 4-A
3, Amendment of section 4-AA

* 6, Amendment of section 4-B



38

4

ORIssa ACT 12 orF 1998

* THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND
PENSLON (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1998

[ Received the asseut of the Governor o1 the 28th September 1998, first published in an extraordinary 2

issie of the Otissa Gazatte, dated the 8t Qctober 1998 ]

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LESISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY,
ALIOWANCES aND Psxsionw acT, 1998

BE it _endcted by the Legislature of the State of Orissa in the Forty-ninth Year of
the Republic of India as follows:—

~ Short tci‘l]e 1.({) This Act may te called the Qrissa Legislative Asscmbly Members® Salary,
an L] 1
commane. Allowances and Pension (Amendment) Act, 1998.
meat,
: (2) It shall come into force on the 1st day of August, 1998,
A""“‘rimem 2. In the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members® Satary, Allowances and Pension gjgn Ag
section 3. Act, 1954 (hereinafier referred to as the principal Act),— 19 of 1954
(i) for section 3 excluding the provisos thereto, the following section shall
be subctituted, namely:— -
*3, There shall be paid and delivered a sajary—
(a) at the rate of two thousand and five hundred rupees toevery membefs
other than the Leader of the Opposition, the Chief Whip 2nd the Deputy
Chief Whip 3
(b)at the rate of five thousand rupees to the Leader of the Opposition and
the Chief Whip; and
(c) of four thousand rupces to the Deputy Chief Whip, net 2 month:”; &nd
(i) the second and third provisos to section 3 shall be omitted.
Amgndment 3. In the principal Act, in section 4,—
Q!
stetion 4, () for the opening portion, the following shall be substituted, nemely:—

“There shall be paid to every member the following allowances, except
the allowances mentioned in Clauses (2) apd (d) in ctase of the Leader
of the Opposition, the Chiel Whip and the Deputy Chief Whip, at the
rates specified against cach:—"

(i) in clause (a), for the words “nine hundred fupees”, the words “two
thousand rupaes’” shall be substituted;

(i) for clause (b), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(b) Daily allowance of—

(/) three hundred rupzes a day for cach day of actual residence at the
place where the Assembly or a Commitie¢ meefs or at a p'ace to
make an oath ot affirmation as required by Article 188 of the Consti-
tution of Igdias and

(i) four hundred rupees a day for going outside the State to attend
Conforences and Meetings and on Study Tours.”;

(iv) in sub-clayse (ii) of clause (¢), for the words <fifty paise”, the words
“one 1upee” shall be substituted;

(v) in the proviso to sub-clause (ii) of clause (c), for thc Words ¢at the sameg
rate us admissible to 2 Government servant of the first grade on tour™, the
words “at the rate of three rupees and fity paisc per kilomeire' shall be
substituted; and

{vi)in clause (d), for the words “seven hundred and fifty rupees®, the words
ssgne . .thousand and five hundred rupees”, shall be substituted. °

* For tho Bill, see Orissa Gozette Exlraordinary dated the Tid August, 1998 (1007)

L



39

Amendmcnt 4. In the principal Act, in section 4-A, for the words “a sum of rupees two
thousand”, the commas -and words other than the Leadse of the Qpposilion, the

"°“°“4'A Chief Whip and the' Deputy Chicf Whip, @ sum of rupees three thcusand™ shall be
substiluted.

Aw¢ndment 5.1n the principal Act, in section 4-AA, for the words sthirty-five thoucand
sect‘o:«l;- rupees”, the words "rupces cne lakh” shall be substituted.
1 AA.

Amcndrmcnt 6. In the principal Act, in section 4-B,—
0

vection 4-8. (i) for sub-section (1) excluding the second proviso and the Explanatmn
thereto, the following shall be substituted, namely -

4

(1) With effect from the commencement of the Onssa Legislative Asscmbly
Members’ Salary, Allowances agd Pensicn (Amendmrnt) Aét, 1998, -
there she]l be paid a pension of two thousand rupees per mensem
to every Pperson who has held office for a period of two years, whether
continuous or not, &8s 8 member of the Assembly:

Provided that where any person has held office for 8 period exceeding five
years, there shall be paid to him an additional pension of two huadred
rupees per mensem for every year in exczss of five years:”;

(il) in thc Explanation to sub-section (1), for clause (i), the following- ¢lause
shall be substituted, namely:— _

“(ii) Incompuling the aforcsaid Period, the pericd preceding the
26th day of January, 1950 for which a person has held such office,
shall not be taken into account.” ; and '

(m) in clause (b) of sub-section (5) for the words ‘four years” the words
“two years' shall be substituted.



77

ORISSA ACT 12 OF (999

*THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEVMBLY MEAIBERS® SALARY, ALLOWANCEFS AND
PENSION (AMENDMENT! ACT, 199%

[Receivd the assent of the (Governor on the 4th Oztober 1999 fiest publi:hed in an  exiraordinary
issue of the Orissi Gazette, daled the 3th Oclober, 1999

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS’
- SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 4954,

Br itenacted by the Legislature of the Sta'e of Qrissa in the Fiftieth Year
of the Republic of India as follows; —

Short title. 1. This Act may be called the Orissa Legislative Assembly Members, Salary,
Allowances and Pension {Amendment) Act, 1999.
Anmapdment 2. In section 4-B of the Orissa - Legisiative Assembly Members® Salary,
of seation Allowances and Pension Acts 1954,— : Qrissa Act
4-B. . 18 of 1954,

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words *“‘two ycars”, the words “on¢ year”
shall be substituted,

{(if)y in second proviso to sub-sccticn (1), for the figure *1994” apd
the words *seven hundred rupzes® the figure and words ©]1008*”
and “two thousand rupees” shall respect_ively be substiluted. and

(jii) in clause (b) of sub-section {3}, for theworls “two years” the
words “one year" shall be substituted. .

* For the Bill ss¢ Orissa Gazette, EXtaordinary, dated the (NoJ)



23

ORISSA ACT 4.OF 2003 _
THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES
AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2002

TABLE OF CONTENTS

PREAMBLE

SECTIONS

Short title.

" Amendment of section 3.

_ Amendment of sectian 4.
Amendment of section 4-A,
Amendment of section 4-B.

R I



Sherl tille.

Amendmeni
of seclion 3.

Amendment
of section 4.

-

25

* THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY MEMBERS' SALARY,
ALLOWANCES AND PENSION (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2002

[ Received the assent of the Governor on the 25th January, 2003, first
published in an extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazette, dated the 1st
February, 2003 {(No. 163) ]

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ORISSA LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
MEMBERS' SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND PENSION ACT, 1954,

Be it enacted by the Legisiature of the State of Orissa in the Fifty-Lhird
Year of the Republic of India as follows :— '

1. This Act may be called the QOrissa Legislalive Assembly Members'
Salary, Allowances and Pension {(Amendment) Act, 2002Z. '

2. In'section 3 of lhe Orissa Legislative Assembly Members' Salary, Al-
lowances and Pension Act, 1954 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act),—

(i} in clause (a), for the words “two thousand and five hundred
rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees” shall be substiluted ;

{ii) in clause (b}, for the words "five thousand rupees”, the words "six
thousand rupees" shall be subslituted ; and

(i) in clause {c), for the words "four thousand rupees”, the words "five
thousand rupees” shall be substituted,

3. In section 4 of the principal Act, —

(i) inthe opening portion, for the words, brackets and lellers “clauses
{a) and (d)", the words, brackets and letters "clauses (a), {(d), (e)
and (f)" shall be subsliluted ,

(i} in clause (a), for the words "two thousand rupees”, the words "three
‘thousand rupees” shall be substituted ;

(i) in ctause (c),—

(a) in sub-clause (ii), for lhe words "one rupee", the words “one
rupee and fifty paise” shall be subslituted ; and

{b} in the proviso 1o sub-clause (ii), for the words "three rupees and
fifty paise”, the words "four rupees and fifty paise" shall be
" subslituted ; ’

(iv) in clause (d}, for the words "one thousand and five hundred
’ rupees”, the words "two thousand rupees” shall be subslituted ;
and

* For the Bill, see Orissa Gazelte, Extraordinary daled the 24th December, 2002 [No, 2347).

Qrissa Act
19 of 1954

L
vl



26

(v) after clause {d), the following clauses shall be inserted, namely :—

"(s) Books, journals and periodicals allowance at (he rate of two
hundred rupees per month.

(f} Electricity consumption allowance at the rate of five hundred
rupees per month.”.

Amﬁndme:t of 4. In section 4-A of the principal Act, for the words “rupees three thou-
lion 4-A. ;
sectian sand”, the words "rupees four thousand" shall be substituted.

Amendment of S. In section 4-B of the pringipal Act, in sub-section (1} —
seclion 4-B,

{ii for the figure "1998" and lhe words "two thousand rupees”
occurring in the opening portion, the figure "2002" anq the words
"three theusand rupees” shall respectively be substituted ;

{ii} in the first pravise, for the words “"two hundred rupees per mensem
far every year in excess of five years", the words "four hundred
rupees per mensem for every year in excess of five years sq,
however, that, in no case, the total amount of the additional
pension together with (he pension, to be so paid, shall exceed ten
thousand rupees per mensem"” shall be substituted ; and

(iif} in the second proviso, for the ﬁgure'“1998" and the words “two
thousand rupees”, the figure "2002" and words “three thousand
rupees” shall respectively be substituted.



	1992OR7.pdf
	1994OR9.pdf
	1995OR16.pdf
	1997OR5.pdf
	1998OR12.pdf
	1999OR12.pdf
	2003OR4.pdf



