
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

Shri Jagannath Temple (Amendment) Act, 2003 
 

Act 16 of 2003 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Pilgrim, Temple 
 
Amendment appended: 12 of 2004
 



514 

ORISSA ACT 16 OF 2003 

SHRl JAGANNATH TEMPLE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2003 

PREAMBLE 

SECTIONS 

1. Short title and commencement 

2. Amendment of seclion 6 

3. Amendment of section 10 

4. Amendmenl of section 15-6 

5. Amendment of section 16 

6. Amendment of section 16-A 

7. Amendment of section 21 

8. Amendment of section 22 

9. Amendment of section 23 

10. Amendment of section 27 

11. Amendmenl of section 28-C 

12. Amendment of section 30-A 

13. Amendment of seclion 30-C 

14. Amendment of section 32 

15. Amendment of section 33 



[Received the assent of the Pres-idenl on the 2hIh August 2003: firsl published in an 
exlraordinary issue of lhe Orissa Gazefte, dated (he 161h September, 2003 ( No. 1451)] 

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND SHRl JAGANNATH TEMPLE ACT, 1954. 

BE i t  enacted by the Legislature of lhe State of Orissa in the Fifty-fourlh 
Year of Ihe Republic of India, as follows :- 

Short lilie and 3 .  (1 )  This Act may be called Shri Jagannath Temple (Amendment) 
commence- Acl. 2003. menl. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

Amendmenl of 2. In section 6 of Shri Jagannath Temple Act, 1954 (hereinafter referred to Or~ssa ~ c l  
Section '. as the principal Act), in sub-section (I),- 1101 1955. 

(a) in the opening porlion, for the word "twelve" the word "fourteen" shall 
be subsliluted ; 

(b) after clause (c) the following clauses shall be inserted. namely :- 

"(c- I )  Ihe Superinlendent of Police, Puri. ex officio member ; 
(c-2) the Superintending Archaeologist, Archaeological Survey of 
India, Bhubaneswar Circle. Bhubaneswar, ex officio member ; 

(c) afler clause (h) Ihe following proviso shall be inserted, namely :- 

" Provided that the Stale Government shall norninale persons for 
Ihe categories referred to in clauses (d). (e) and (g) out of a panel 
of names prepared by the Adminislralor for each such caiegory 

which shall consist of names iwice Ihe number of members 
required lo be nominated under Ih'e respective clause.". 

Amendmenl ol 3. In section 10 of the principal Act, in clause ( f )  of sub-seclion ( I ) .  the 
sec"on lo- words "more than" shall be ornilted. 

Amendmenlol 4, f n  section 15-B of the principal Act, in sub-section (I), after the words 
sec'iOn 15-'. '-the Administrator may", the comma and words. "either on his own rnolion or" 

shall be inserled. 

Amendment 5. In section 16 of the principal Act, afler sub-section-(2), Ihe roilawing 
of section 16. 

sub-sections shall be inserled, namely :- 

"(3) Any iransfer of immovable properly recorded in the name of Lord 
Jagannath of Puri by any person including any institution being the Madatdar 
of such property shall be absolutely null and void and of no force or effecl 

whatsoever, unless Ihe Administralor or any pfficer authorised by him in writing 
in lhis behall, execute the deed of such transfer as one of the exccutanl, 

'For rhe Bill. see Orissa Gazelle. Exlraordinary, dated the 121h March , 2003 (No. 304), 



Amendrnenl 
of seclion 
t6-A. 

*Amendmen1 
of seclion 21. 

Amendment 
ol seclion 22. 

Amendment 
of seclion 23. 

Arncndmenl 
of seclion 27. 

Amendment 
OI seclion 
28-C. 

Amendment 
ol section 
30-A. 

5q6 

(4) Notwithstanbiny anything conlained in the Regislration Acl, 1908 1 

no deed or lransfer of any immovable properly executed in contravenlion of 

the provisions of sub-section (3)  above shall 5e accepted for regislration.". 

6. In section 16-A of Ihe principal Act, in sub-seclion (1 ),- 

(i) Tor the word and figure "Act, 1954"- the word and figure ''Act, 
1972" shall be su bslilu ted ; and 

(iiJ in the margin lo sub-section (1 ),for Ihe wards and Lgures "Orisss 

Act 15 of 1954", the words and figures "Orissa Act G of 1972 

shall be suhslilu ted. 

7. In section 21 of the principal Acl, in sub-seclion (2). after clause (i) and 

before the proviso Ihe following clause shall be inserted, namely :- 

"0) to issue inslruclions or directions, from time to time, for controlling 
Ihe activilies, conduct and management of all inslitutions including Mukli 
Mandap and Pandil Sabha functioning within the premises of the temple.". 

8 .  In section 22 of Ihe principal Act, after Ihe words "in cases of emergency' 
appearing in opening portion, the words "or in cases of unforeseen circumslances" 
shall be inserted. 

9. In section 23 of the principal Act, In sub-seclion ( 4 ) ,  for Ihe words "two 

hundred rupees", lhe words "lhree thousand rupees" shall be subslituled. 

10. In sec(ion 27 of Ihe principal Act, in sub-section (1 ), the words "and fix 
his remuneration which shall be paid to such audilor from the runds thereof' shall 
be omitted and after the words "his report" and before the words "to Ihe Cornmiltee", 
the words "to the Administrator and il shall be Ihe duly of the Adminislralor to 

submit the audit report" shall be inserled. 

71. In section 28-C of the principal Act in sub-section (51,- 

(4 "clause'(a)" including the word "and" shall be ornilled ; and 

(ii) in clause (b), for Ihe word "five", Ihe word "ten" shall be 
subsliluted. 

12. In section 30-A of Ihe principal Act,- 

{a) in sub-seclion (1 ), for Ihe words "five hundred rupees", Ihe words 
"five lhousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) in sub-sectio~; (2), for the words "two hundred rupees", Ihe words 
"lwo (housand rupees" shall be subs(ituted ; 

(c) in sub-section (31, lor the words "one hundred rupees", Ihe words 
"one thousand rupees" shall be substituted : 

(d) in sub-seclion (4), for the words "fifty rupees", the wards "one 
thousand rupees" shall be subslituled ; and 

(e) ,in sub-section (5), for the woids "fifly rupees". the words "one 
Ihousand rupees" shall be subslituted. 



517 ' 

Amendment 13. In section 30-C of the principal Act, lor the wards 'Magistrate of the 
01 seclion 
30-C. Second Classn. the words 'Magislrale of the First Classm shall ie subslituled. 

Amendment q4. In section 32 of the piincipal Acl, in sub-section (2). the 'c\ause (I )" 
Or seccop 32. shall be ornilled. 

Amendmenl 15. In section 33 af the principal Act, in sub-section (Z), for the words 
r)'sec''On "Magistrate of the First Class", the words "Executive Magistrate" shall be 

substiruted. 



ORISSA ACT 72 OF 2004 

SHRl JAGANNATH TEMPLE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2004 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 

PREAMBLE 

SECTIONS 

7 .  -short title and commencement. 

2. Amendment of Section 6. 

3. Amendment of Section 6-A. ' 

4: Amendment of Section 4 3. 

5. ~ m i n d m e n t  of section 75-A. 

6. Inserfion of Section 15-AA: 

7. Amendment of Section 3 6. 

i 8. Deletion of Section 18-A. 
I 

I 9. Amendment of Section 19. 

40. Amendmentof Section2-I. 

- -  - l q .  Amendment of Section 241. - -  

12. Insertion of Section 21 -6. :# 

i 13. - Amendment of Section 24. 

14. Amendment of Section 28. 

.15. General Amendment. 



, , 

.... - 

57 

ORlSSA ACT 12 OF 2004 . 

*SHRI JAGANNATH TEMPLE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2004 

[ Received (he assent of the Governor on the 21st December, 2004, first published in an 
Extraordinary issue of the Orissa Gazefte dated the 27th December, 2004 (No. 1836)) 

AN ACT FURTHERTO AMEND SHRl JAGANNATHTEMPLE ACT, 1954. 

BE i t  enacted by Ihe Legislature of the State of Orissa in the FiHy-fiflhYear 
of the Republic of India as fol\ows :- 

shod tiue 1. (1) This Act may be called Shri ~ a ~ a n n a t h  Temple (Amendment) 
and . 

mrnmencernenl. Act, 2004. 

(2) It shall come inlo force on such date as the Slate Government may. 
by notification, appoint in this behalf. ' 

Arnerdment 2. In Shri Jaganath Temple Act, 1954 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Otissa Acl 
of Secrion 6. 

Act) for Section 6, folawing Section shall be substiluted, namely :- 11 of 1955. 

'Con: tilu lion 6. (I) The Committee c'onstituled under Section 5 shall consist of 18 
of h e  
Cmmirtee. members and shall be composed as follows :- 

(a) The Raja of Puri who shall be Ihe Chairman; 

(h) an officer not below the rank of Additional Chief &etary, ex officio . 
member, who shall be Ihe Working Chairman; 

(cJ h e  Chief Administrator appointed under sub-seclion (1) ol _st ion 
19, ex oHicio member, who shall be the Secretary; 

(q the Collector of Vle District of Puri-ex officio member; 

(e) \he Commissioner of Endowments appointed under the Orissa . 
Hindu Religious Endowments Act, 1951 -ex oMcb member; 

(0 the ~ d d i t i o n a l  Secretary, Law Department in-charge of  
Shri Jagannath Temple Aclminis(ratlon,%x ofmi0 member; 

(gJ the Superintendent of Police, Puri-ex officio member; 

(h) the Superinteridi~g Archaeolog~st, Archaeological Survey of India, 
Bhubaneswar Circle, Bhubaneswar-ex oficio member; 

[i) one person to be nominated by the State Government from among 
the persons enlilled to sit on the MukOrnandap-member; 

,$j five persons to be nominated by the State Government from among 

the Sevaks of the Temple- member; , 

(k) one person representing the Malhs and ofher lnstilutbns connected 
with the seva-puja or nitis of Ihe Temple or any Hindu religious1 
spir' .a1 organisation tdbe nominated by the State Government- 
member; and 

{I) three persons (one of whom shall be Chartered Accountant) from 
among the persons who'd0 not belong to any of lhe categories . 

referred to in clauses Ij) and (khrnembers : 

'For the Bill, See Orissa Gazette ,Extraordinary, dated lhe 27th December 2004 (No. 1836) 



Amendment 
of Seclion 
6-A. 

Amendment 
of Section 13. 

lnsedion 6f 
Seclion ISM, 

"Uuties ot ltie 
Working 
C h a i m n .  

Amendment 
of Seclion 16. 

Deletion of 
Section 18-A. 

Amendment 
of Seclion 19. 

I'Appointrnent 
of Chief 
Administralor 
and 0 f i ~ e r ~  to 
assist him. 

58 
Provided lhat the Staie Government shall nominate persons for the 

categories referred to in clauses (i), (i) and (k) out of a panel of names prepared 
by the Chief Adminiskator for each such category which shall consist of names 
twice the number of members required to be nominated under the respective 

clauses. 

(2) No person who does not profess the Hindu rellgion, shall be eligible 
for membership. 

(3) If Ihe officers mentioned under clauses (b), (d), (e), (f), (g) and (h) of 
sub-section ( 1 )  do not profess Ihe Hindu religion, an oFficeiof the Statelcentral 
Government of equivalent rank professing such religion may be norninaled by 
the SlatelCentral Government for the purpose. 

(4) The appointment or nominalion'of the members shall be notified in 
the Orissa Gazetie.". 

3. In Ihe principal Act, in sub-sedion (I) of Section 6-A, for the word, letters, 
comma and brackets "(e), fl and (g)". 1Re following word, letters and brackets " /j) 
and (k)" shall be substitted. 

4. In the principal Ac!, in sub-section (3) of Section 13, for the words "five 
members", [he words "nine members"shall be substituted. 

5. In Ihe principal Act, in Section 15-A. in sub-seclion' (1 ),- 

(0 the word "and" appearing against item (b) shall be deleled; 

(iiJ for the full stop appearing a1 h e  end of item (c), the following shall be 

subslituted, namely :-"; and"; 

(iii) the following item shall be inserted after item (c). namely :- 

"(d) any oth,er subject as may be decided by t h e  Committee.". 

6. In the principal Act, after Section 15-A, the following Section shall be 
inserted, namely :- 

15-,W. it shall be t h e  duty of (he working Chairman.- 

(a) to ensure that the Resolulions passed by the Cornmiltee are properly 
implemented by the Chief Administrator; . 

(6) to ensure proper co-ordination between the Temple Administration, 
Dislrict Administration and the Slate Government in the administralion 
of the affairs of the Temple; and 

(c) any other duty which the State Government may from time to time 
assign.". ' 

7. In the principal Act, in sub-section { I )  of section 16, for the words "one 
thousandrupees", the words "fifty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

8.  In the principal Act, Section 18-A shall be deleted. 

9. In the principal Act, for Section 19, the following Section shall be 

substituted, namely :- 

19. (1) There shall be a Chief Administrator for the Temple who shall be 
. . 

appob~ted by the Sta!c Government fram among members of  the Indian 
Adrninislrative Service noi below the rank OF Commissioner (equivalent lo Revenue 
Divisional Commissioncr) and professing Hindu religion. 



Amendment 
o: Section 
21-A. 

lnserlion 07 
Section 21-8 

'Suspension 
pending 
inquiry. 

Amendment 
of Section 24. 

5 9 

(2) The collector of the District of Puri or such person as may be nominated 
under sub-section (3) of Section 6 shall be ex officio Deputy Chief Administrator 
of the Temple and he shall, subject to the control of the Chief Administrator, 

such duties as the Chief Adrninistralor may from tirne to tirne assign. 

. (3) The State Government shall appoint the following officers from among 
persons in their active service and professing Hindu'religion to assist the Chief 
Adminislrator and the officers so appointed shall, perform such duiiea as the 
Chief Administrator may'from time to time assign,- 

(a) one oficer from among the members of the Indian Administrative 
Senrice or Orissa Administrative Service not below the rank of Joint 
Secretary as ~dministrabr (Development); 

/-- 

(b) one officer from among the members of Ihe Orissa Administrative 
Service (I) not below the rank of Joint Secretary as Administrator 
(Niti); . 

(c) one officer from among the members of the Indian Police Serviceor 
Orissa Polce Service not below the rank,of Additional Superintendent 
of Police as Adminislrator (Security); 

- {dJ m e  officer from among the members of the Orissa Administrative 
Service (I] (Jr. Br.) as Deputy Administrator (Revenue); 

(e) one officer from among the members of the Orissa Finance Service 
(I) (Jr. Br) as Deputy Administrahr (Finance); and . 

, (0 one officernot below the rankof Assistant Executive Engineer (Civil) 
as Deputy Administrator (Deue(oprnent]. 

. (4) The Slate Government may also appoint such other officers as it may 
deem fit, from among persons in heir aclive service and prolessing Hindu religion , 

to assist the Chief Adminislrator and the officer so appointed shall, perform such 
duties as Ihe Chief Admlnlslrator may from time to time assign.". 

10. In the principal Act, in sub-section (2) of Section 21, for the words "five 
thousand rupees" appearing in clause (c), the words "fifty thousand rupees" shall 
be substituted. 

11. In the principal Act, itl Secfion 21 -A, for the words "lwo hundred rupees" 
appearing against item (b), lhe words "two thousand rupeesw shall be substituted. 

12. In the principal Act, after Section 21-A, the following Section shall be. 
-inserted, namely ;- 

21-B. The Chief Administmtor may ~!ace any sevak, office holder or employee 
attached io theTernple under suspension,- 

(a) where a disciplinary proceeding against him is contemplated or is 
pending; or 

(bJ where a case against him in respec[ of any criminal offence is under 
investigation, inquiryor trial.". 

13. In the principal Act, in Section 24, - 

(i) for susb-section (I), Ihe following sub-seclion shall be subsvluted. 
namely :- 



60 . 
'(11 Any person aggrieved b@ny order passed-by the Chief 

Administrator under his Act, or rules, or Regulations made 
thereunder, may within 30 days of the communication of the 
order to him, prefer an appear before the Committee."; 

(iiJ for susb-section (3), the following sub-secfion shal ba substiluIed, 
namely :- 

'(3) The Appellate Sub-Committee shall consist ~f the Working 
Chairman who shall be its Chairman and two-&her members 
elected in the prescribed manner by the members of the 
Committee from among Vle nonirficial members thereof.'. 

Amendment 14. In the principal:~ct, clause (f) of sub-section (2) of Section 28 shall be 
28: deleted., 

. l 
Generat ' 15. in the principaJ Act, for the expressions 'the Administrator", 
Amendment "Servant" and " Vice-Chairman" wherever lhey occur, the expressions "Chief 

Administrator", 'Ernploye,em and 'Working Chairman" shall respectively be 
substituted, 


	2003OR16.pdf
	2004OR12.pdf



