The Andhra Pradesh Advocates Welfare Fund and The Andhra Pradesh
Advocates Clerks Welfare Fund Acts, (Amendment) Act, 1992

Act 19 of 1992

Keyword(s):

Bar Association, Bar Council, Cessation of Practice, Fund, Member of the
Fund, Stamp, society, Recognised Clerk, Retirement, Welfare Fund
committee, Vakalatnama

Amendments appended: 5 of 2000, 21 of 2001, 4 of 2003

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




THE ANDHRA PRADESH ADVOQCATES WELFARE FUND
AND THE ANDHRA PRADESH ADVOCATES' CLERKS’
WELFARE FUND ACTS (AMENDMENT) ACT, 1992,

ACT No. 19 OF 1992, [ 30th Sept. 1992, )

An Act further to am(;nd the Andhra Pradesh Adveocates’ Welfare
Fund Act, 1987 and the Andhra Pradesh Advocates’ Clerks’ Welfare
Fund Act, 1992,

Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State ¢f Andhra
Pradesh in the Forty-third Year of the Republic cf India, as follows:——

1. Shorr title.—This Act may be called the- Andhra Pradesh
Advecates® Welfpre Fund and the Andhra Pradesh Advocates’
Clerks® Welfare Fund Acts (Amendment) Act, 1992,

2. Amendment of Act 33 of 1987.—In the Andhra Pradesh Advocates’
Welfare Fund, Aect, 1987—

i

(1) after scction 12, the following section shall be imserted,
namely :—

12-A, Combined stamp for Advocates’ Welfare Fund and Advocate'
Clerks’ Welfare Fund ~—Notwithstanding anything contained
sectior 12, it shall be competent for the Government to priut
or caused to be printed 2 combined stmp superscribed in Telugu
langnage as ‘Nyaya Vadula Mariya Vari gumsthala Samlishema Nidhi.
for the Andhra Pradesh Advocates Welfare Fund and for the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates Clerks Weflare Fund constituted under the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates - Clerks, Welfare Fund Act, 1992 Act 13

Reccived  the assent of the Governor on the 27th Sepiember, 1992 For st:atcmcnr
objecls and Reasons Please Sec the dndira Fradesh  Gazette, Extraordinary
dated the 3rd Sept.J992. Part-JV-A at Page 4°

94



95

of 1992} of the wvalue of rupees eight out of which a sum of rupees
six shall be cradited to the Andhra Pradesh Advocates, Welfare-
- Fund and rtupezes two shall be credited to the Andhra Pradesh Advo-
catcs “Clorks® Welfare Fund and where such combined stamp is affixed
on the vukalatr the provisions of sub-section (2) of secction 12 shall
be deemed to have been complied with.

{2} In Section 15, alier sub-section (11) the foliowing sub-section
shall b: insarted namely :(—

(12} Where on raceipt of 2 complaint or otherwise the Com-
mitice has reason to believe that any advocate sccured admission as
a member of the Fund by misrepresentation, fraud or under influence,
it shall be compstent for the Committee to remove the name of such
Advoeate from the membershkip of the Fund:

rovided that no order under this sub-section shall be passed unless
the persoa likely to b2 adversely affected has had an opportunity os
being heard”—

3. Amendmeat of Act 13 of 1992.— In the Andhra Pradesh Advocates
Clerks, Welfare Fund Act, 1092,—

(1) afeer scction 12, the following sections shall be inserted,
namely :

(J2-AL Comhined  «taip for  Advocates’ Welfare Fund and
Advorstes’ Clerks' Weiflre Fend—Nolwithstanding anything contained
in seciion 12, it shsll be ‘compstent for the Goverament to print or
causcd (o be printed o combined stamp superscribed in  Telugu Ian- .
guag: 25 ‘Nyayavedula Bdarisu Vari “gumasthala  Samkshema Nidbi,,
for the Andhra Pradesh Advocatz? Clecks, Welfare Fund aad for
the Andhra Pradesh Advocates Welfare Fund constituted under the
Andh-a Fradesh Advocates, Welfare Fund Act, 1987 of the value of
Aet 35 of 1987rupees eight out of which a sum of rupees two shall he
credited to the Andhra Pradesh Advocates, Clerks, Welfare Fund and
- rupees six shall be credited to the Andhra Pradesh Advocates® Welfare
Fund , and where such a combined stamp is affixed on the vakalat
the provsions of sub-section (2) of section 12 shall be deemed to
have been, complied with.”. :



96

(2) in section 15, after sub-section (9), the following sub-section
shall bec inserted, namely

«(10) Where on receipt of a complaint or otherwise the Com-
mittee has reason to believe that any Advocates’ Clerk sccured
admission as a member of the Fund by misrepresentation, fraud or
undue influence, it shall be competent for the Committee to remove
the name of such Advocates,” Clerk from the membarship of the, Fond:

Provided that no order under this sub-section shall be passed ualess
the person likely to be adversely affected has had an opportunity of
being heard ..



ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND

" REGULATIONS Ete.

The following Act of the Andhra Pradesh
Legislative Assembly received the assent
of the Governcr on the 20th April, 2000
and the said assent is hereby Ffirst
published on the 22nd April, 2000 in the
Andhra Pradesh Gazette fcr General
information:-

ACT ROo. 5 OF 2000

A¥ ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDERA PRABESH

" ADVOCATES' WELFARE FUWD ACT, 1987 AND

THE ANDHRA PRADESH ADVOCATES® CLFRES'
WELFARE FUND ACT, 19920

Be it enacted hy the Legislative .
Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh
in the Pifty-first Year of Republic of
"India, as follows:i-

'[33]



© Shart.-
ritle.

of section

. Ret 33787,

Substitn-
tion of
SChedule -

Act 33/87.

34

1. This Act may ‘he calied the Andfrea
Pradesh Advocates' Welfare Fund and the
Andhra Pradesh . .Advocatest Clerks' He:l.fare
Fund {Amendnent) Act, 2000.

2. In the Andhra Pradesh Advocates®
Welfare Fund Act, 1987, in sectien 12,

_ for sub-section(2), the following shall

be substituted, namely:-—

*(2) Bvery wakalat filed before any
court, anthority, tribunal or person.,
except a vakalat filed by ony Law Officer
appointed by the Government, =shall be-
affived with a stamp as specified- in’
sub~section{l) apd no such wvakalat shall
be valld or accepted without such stamp:

Provided that the Goverrment. may
make a- grant 'of such sum of money in
every financial year as may be determined
by it from time to time by way of compen-
sation .for the exemption from: affixing
the stamp on the vakalats filed by any
Law Officer appointed by the Government:

Provided further that such grant
shall be apportioned bhetween the andhra
Pradesh Advocates' Welfare Fund and the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates’ Clerks'
Welfare Fund in the same manner as speci-
fied in section 12 A.°.

3. In the Andhra Pradesh Advocates'
Welfare Pund Act, 1987, for the Scheduie,
the following ' shall be substituted,
namely:-



35

"SCHEDUGLE .
(see sections ¢ and 16)

————

s1. Years of Standing . Amount
Ho., ) Payable
(1) (2) {3
1. 30 years standing Fs. 60,000
2. 29 years standing &. 58,000
3. 28 yearé standing . 56,000
4. 27 years standing 5. 54,000
5. 26 years standing ks. 32,000
8., 25 years stanaing . 50,000
7. 24 years standing Fs. 48,000
8. 23 years standing Rs. 46,000
9. 22 years standing ks, 44,000
10. 2] years standing Bs. 42,000
11. 20 ?ears standing Rs. 40,90a¢
12. 1% years standing’ ks. 38,000
13. 18 years standing Rs. 36,000
14. 17 years stending Bs. 34,000
.15. 16 years standing Ps. 32,0006
16. 15 years standing f. 30,000
-1%. 14 years standing R, 28,000
18. 13 years standing Rs. 2%,000
19. 12 years standing Bs. 24,000
20, 11 years standing p:. 22,000
2l. 10 years standing k. 20,000
22. 9 years standing Es. 18,000
23. B years standing . 16,000
24, 7 years standing Bs. 14,000
25. 6 years standing 5. 12,009
26, 5 years standing Es.

10,000




Anspdment:

36

4. In the Aﬁdhra’ Pradesh Advocates”

of saction12. Clerks'  Welfare Fund Act, 1992, in

Act 13/92.

Act 33/87.

section 12, for sub-section{2), the
following shall be substituted, nanely:-

®(2) Every vakalat filed before any
court, authority, tribunal or person,
except a vakalat filed by any LawQfficer
appeinted by the Government, shall be
affined with a stamp as specified in
sub~section(l) in additlon to the stamp
ko be affixed under section .l2 of the
Apndhra Pradesh Advecates' Walfare Fund
Act, 1987 and no such vakalat shall be
valid or accepted without such stanp:

Provided that' the Government may
make a2 grant of such aum of money in
every “inancial year as may be determined
by it Zrom time to time by way of compen-
sation- for the exemption from affixing
the stamp on the vakalats filed by any
Lav Oflicer appointed by the Governments

Provided further that such grant
shall 3e’ apportloned between the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates' Welfare Fund and the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Clerks’™ Welfare
Fund in the same manner as specified in
sectien:12a.",

G. BHAVANY PRASQD,
Secretary to Government,
Legislative Affaris & Justlce,

Law Department.

-



37

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

Dader sub-section {2} of section 12 of the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates Welfare Fund Act, 1987 every vakalat filed
before any Court, Muthority, Tribupal or person shall be
affixed with a Stamp of the value'of Rs.12/- and no Vkkalat
shall be valid or accepted by the Court, Authority, Tribunal
or person without such stamp. A similar provision exisks in
sub-section(2) cof section 12 of ‘the Andhra Pradesh Advocates
Clerks' HWelfare Fund Act, 1992.

The Bar Council of the. State of Aandhra Pradesh has
represented that the Law Officers appointed by &the State
Government also have to affix such stamp on the Vakalats
filed by them which is not being dong causing loss to the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates Welfare Fund and'the Andhra Pradesh
ddvorates Clerks Welfare Fund. Hence, they have represented
to provide for a lum sum grant by the Government to bhe said
funds to compensate the Loss cauvsed by non-affixixng of
stamps on their Vakalats by the Law Officers appointed by
the Government. They have alsa reguested to make spitable
anendments to the Acts and also reguested foo further
amendment of the Schedule of the Andhra Pradesh Advecates
Welfare Fund to enhance the retirement. benefit from
Rs.1000/= to Rs.2000/- per year of practice.

The Government after careful examinaticno of the proposal
have decided to amend the Andhra Pradesh Advocates Welfare
Fand Act, 1DB? and the #Andhra PFradesh Advocates Clerks!
Welfare Fund Act, 1992 suitably to exempt the Law Officers
appointed by the Govermment from affixing stamps on  the
vakalats filed by them and to provide £for an annual grant
by the State Government to the Funds in liew of the samz and
also to amend the Schedvle of A.P. Advocates ielfare Fund
Ret 33 of 1987 enhancing the retirement benefit for the
Member Adveocates from Rs5.1000/- to Rs.2000/- - per year of
practice.

This bill seeks to give effect to the above decision.

T, CORoRM SERDNR,
Minister for Law & Courus,



ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND

REGULATIONS, Etc.

The following Act of the &andhra
Pradesh Legislative BAssembly received
the assent of the Governor on the 22nd
April, 2001 a%d the said assent is here-
by first published on the 253th April,
2001 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for
general information:- '

ACT No. 21 oF 2001.

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDHRA
PRADESH ADVOCATES' WELFARE FUND ACT,
1987 AND THE ANDHRA PRADESH ADVOCATES
CLERKS' WELFARE FUND ACT, 1992.

Be it enacted by the Legislative
Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh
in the Fifty-second Year of Republic of
India as follows:-

1. (1) This Act may bhe called the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Welfare Fund
and the Andhra Pradésh Advocates' (Clerks
Welfare Fund (Amendment) act, 2001.

(2) It shall be Jdeemed to have
come into force with effect from the
29th Fehruary, 2d00,

2. In the Andhra_Pradesh Advocates'

Welfare Fund Act, 1987 in section 12,-

(1) In sub-section (1), for the

word, "Government", the words, "Commis-
sloner and Inspector General of Registra-
tion and Stamps, Andhra Pradesh,

Hyderabad" shall be substituted.

J.1114/7 (93]

Shont litke and
commencament.

Amendmenl of
section 12
Act 33 of 1887



Arpendment of
seclion 12,
Act 13 of 1992,

94

(2) In sub-section (4} for the
words, “The custody of the stamps
printed under this section shall be with
the, Government", the words, "“The work
relating to the printing, custody and
distribution of the 'Nyayavadula Mariyu
vari Gumasthala Samkshema Nidhi Stamps'
shall be with the Commissioner and
Inspector General of Registration and
Stamps, Ardhra Pradesh, Hyderabad",
shall be substituted.

1. In the Andhra Pradesh 2dvocates'
Clerks' Welfare Fund BAct, 1992, in
section 12,-

(1) In sub-section (1) for the
word, "Government", the words, "Commis-
sioner and Inspector General of Regis-
tration and Stamps, Andhra Pradesh,
Hyderabad", shall be suhstituted.

(2) In sub-section {4), for the
words ., "The custody of the stamps
printed under this section shall be with
the Govermment", the words, "The work
relating to the prirting, custody and
distribution of the 'Nyayavadula Mariyu
Vari Gumasthala Samkshema Nidhi Stamps'
shall bhe with +the Commissioner and
Inspector GCeneral of Registration and
Stamps Andhra Pradesh, Hyderabad", shall
be substituted.

K.G. SHANFAR,
Secretary to Government.
Legislative Affairs &
Justice, (F.A.C.),
Law Department.



95

STATEMENT OF OBJLECTS AND REASONS

According to sub-section (1) of section
12 of the Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Welfare
Fund &Act, 1987, there shall be printed or
cause to be printed by the Government in such
form and in such manner as may be prescribed
by rules, stamps and under sub-section (4) of
section 12 of the said Act, the custody cof
the stamps printed, shall be with the Govern-
ment and the supply and sale of stamps shall
be effected in such manner as may be
prescribed.

Jazossling to sub-smection (1) of section
12z orf the Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Clerks'
Welfare Fund Act, 1992, there shall be printed
or cause to be printed by the Government in
such form and in such manner as may be
prescribed by rules, stamps and under sub-
section (4) of section 12 of the said Aact,
the custody of the stamps printed shall be
with the Government and supply and sale of
stamps shall be effected in such manner as
may be prescribed.

While conducting auvdit in the law Depart-
ment, kthe audit party of Accountant General's
Office raised an objection with regard to
supply of stamps by referring to rules 6 and
7 of the Andhra Pradesh Aadvocates' Welfare
Fund Rules, 198% stating that the printing
and distribution of the Andhra Pradesh
Advocates' and their Clerks' Welfare Fund
Stamps shall be done by the Director of
Printing, Andhra Pradesh, Hyderabad and all
indents for supply of the stamps shall be
made to him. - However, it was observed that



96

the Law Department was receiving the stocks
of the stamps and distributing the stamps and
this was contrary to the above provisions in
rules 6 and 7 of the said rules. Further, the
said audit party has pointed out that no
specific arrangements for security of stamps
which sometimes run inte lakhs of rupees of
worth will be available in the Law Department
and also no security has been arranged under
Article 276 of A.P.F.C. Vol.I from the
persons incharge of the stamps. ’

In the light of the above observations
raised by  the audit party of Accountant
Generals' Office, after obtaining the orders
in eirculation, Government have issued orders
in G.0O.Ms.No. 40, Law dt. 29-2-2000 in which
Government have decided to entrust the work
relating to the printing, distribution of
"Nyayavadula Mariyu Vari Gumasthala Samkshema
Nidhi Stmps” to the Commissioner and Inspector
General of Registration and Stamps, AaAndhra
Pradesh, Hyderabad in public interest with
immediate effect pending awendments by under- -
taking Legislation to the relevant Acts by
the concerned.

The Government after careful examination
have decided to amend sub-sections (1) and (4)
of section 12 of the Andhra Pradesh Advocates
Welfare Act, 1987 and sub-sections{l) and {4)
of section 12 of Andhra Pradesh Clerks'
Welfare Fund Act, 1992 entrusting the work
relating to printing, custedy and distribu-
tion of the HNyayavadula Mariyu Vari Gumasthala
Samkshema Nidhi Stamps, to the Commissioner
and Inspecteor General of Registration and
Stamps Andhra Pradesh Hyderabad.

This Bill seeks to give effect to the
above decision.

P. CHANDRA SERHAR,
Minister for Law & Courts.



23 ¢

ANDHRA PRADESH ACTS, ORDINANCES AND
REGULATIONS Etc.

The following Act of the Andhra
Pradesh Legislative Assembly received
the assent of the Governor on the 7th
April, 2003 and the said assent is
hereby first published on the 9th April,
2003 in the Andhra Pradesh Gazette for
general information.

ACT No. 4, OF 2003

AN ACT FURTHER TO AMEND THE ANDERA
PRADESH ADVOCATES* WELFARE FUND ACT,
1987 AND THBE ANDHRA PRADESE ADVO—
CATES' 'CLERKS' WELFARE FUND ACT,
1992.

Be it , enacted by the Legislative

Assembly of the State of Andhra Pradesh

" in the Fifty-fourth Year of the Republic
of Indiaras follows:-



Short
title,.
extent
and ~
commpence—
mank .

Amepdmeat
of Act
33 of 1987.

24

1.(1} This Act may ke called the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates® Welfare Fund
and the Andhra Pradesh Advocates 'Clerks'
Welfare Fund (Admendment)} Act, 2003.

(2) it extends to the whole of .the

State of Andhra Pradesh.

{3} It shall come inte force on such
date as the Government may, by notifica-
tion, appoint.

2. In the andhra Pradesh Advocates®
Welfare Fund Act, 1987, (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act,-—

(1) in section 2 of the principal
Act, in <¢lauses {e), for the words "and
unmarried minor -children or such of them
as exist,", the words "and children or
legal heirs,", shall be substituted;

(2) in section 9 of the principal
Act, in sub-section (2), in clause (c),
for < the words "“legal representative”,
the word "dependent”, shall be substi-
tuted,

{3) in section 12 of the principal
Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
"the Ardhra Pradesh Advocates' Welfare
Fund, each of the value of six rupees.”,
the words "Nyayavadula Mariyu Vari
Gumasthala Samkshema Nidhi, cach of the
value of +twenty rupees.", shall be
substituted; '

~-{4) in section 12-A of the principal
Act, for the words "the value of" rupees
tvelve out of which a sum of rupees nine
shall be credited to the Andhra Pradesh
Advocates' Welfare Fund and rupees
three", the words "“the value of rupees
twenty out of which a sum of rupees



25

fifteen shall be credited to the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates' Welfare Fund and
rupees five", shall be substituted;

(5} in section 15 of the principal
ACt;_ ’

{i) sub-section (3) shall beomitted;

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the
words "the adnission fee", the words
"the amount™, shall be substituted;

{iii) in sub-section (5), for clause
{(a}), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:- -

"(a) Where an Advocate intends to
become the Member of the Fund shall pay
an amount of rupees one hundred towards
admission fee alony with an amount of
rupees one thousand towards the subhscrip-
tion for 1life-membership and on such
payment the. membership of the Advocate
concerned shall subject to the provisions
of sub-secticn (12) be a life member.";

{iv) in sub-section (8),- for the
word "dependants", the word "nominees',
shall be substituted;

(6] in section 16 of the principal
Act, in sub-section (2), .the "Bxplana-
‘tion", shall be omitted;

{(7) in section 17 of the principaih
ACt;‘-

(i) in sub-section (1}, for the
.words "or legal heirs", the words ‘Yor
dependants", shall be substituted; '

(ii) in’  sub-section (2), for the
words "“or legal heirs", the words "or
. dependants", shall bhe substituted..

GCP-5



Ampendrent
of Acr
13 of 1992.

26

3. In the Andhra Pradesh Advocates'
Clerks' Welfare Fund Act, 1992, (herein-
after referred to as the principal Act},

(1) in section-2 of the principal

Aet, in clause (f), for the words "and

unmarried minor children or such of them
as exist,", the words "or children or
legal heirs,", shall be substituted;

"(2) in section 4 of the principal
ACt,“

(i) in sub-section (3); for clause-
(f) the following clause shall be sub-
stituted, namely:-

" (f) three members from three
regions of the State to be nominated
from among the admitted members by such
aunthority and in such manner as may be
prescribed;";

(ii) in sub-section (4), for the
words “three years", the words "two
years", shall be substituted;

(3) in section 6 of the prinecipal
Act, in sub-section (1), for the words
"three months”, the words "one month"”,
shall be substituted;

(4) in. section 9 of the principal
Act, in sub-section (2]}, in clause (¢},
for the swords "legal representatives”,
the word "Dependents", shall be substi~
tuted:. :

(5) in section 11 of the principal
Act, in clause (d) for the word
"Treasurer,", the word "Chairman;",
shall be substituted;



27

(6] in section 12 of the principal
Ac‘tp— .

{i) in sub-section (1), £for the
wvords "the Andhra Pradesh Advocates
Clerks Welfare Fund, each of the value
of two rupces.", the words "Nyayavadula
Mariyu Vari Gumasthala Samkshema Nidhi.,
each of the wvalue of twenty rupees.",
shall be substituted;

{(ii) for - sub-section (2}, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"{2) Every vakalat filed before any
Court, authority, tribunal or person,
except a vakalat ~filed by any Law
Officer appointed by the Government
shall be affixed with a stamp as speci-
fied in sub-section (1) and no such
vakalat shall be wvalid or accepted
wvithout such stamp!

Provided that the Government may
make a grant of such sum of money in
every fimancial year as may be deter-
mined by it from time to time by way of
compensation for +the exemption from
affixing the stamp on the vakalats filed
by any Law Cfficer 39901nted by the
Government;

Provided further that such grant
shall be apportioned bhetween the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates! Welfare Fund and the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates! Clerks® Welfare
Fund in the same manner as specified in.
,sectipn 12-a.";

{7) in section 12-A of the principal
Act, for the words "the value of rupees
twelve out of which a sum of rupees



28

three shall be credited to the Andhra
Pradesh Advocates Clerks Welfare Fund
and rupees nine”, the words "the wvalue
of rupees twenty out of which & sum of
rupees five shall be credited to the
Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Clerks* Welfare
Fund and rupees fifteen", ' shall be
substituted;

{8) in section 15.of the principal
PLCt,- -

(i) for sub-section {1}, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"{l} Every recognised clerk of the.
Advocate in the State below the age of
65 years and being a member of any
Advocates* Clerks* Association recognised
by the Committee may apply to the
Committee for admissicn as a member of
the fund, in such form as may be pres-—
criked.";

(1.1} sub-section (3), shall be
omitted;

{(iii) in sub-section (4}, for the
viords "the admission fee", the words
"the amount” ‘shall be substituted;

{iv} for sub-seetion (5}, the
following shall be substituted, namely:-

"{5} Every recognised clerk of the
Advocate in the State shall pay to
the fund an admission fee of rupees
fifty along with an amount of rupees
five hundred towards subscription for
life membership.”;



29

(v} in sub-sec. on (6}, for the word
"dependents” the word "nominees", shall
be substituted;

(9) after section 15 of the princi-
pal Act, the following section shall ke
inserted namely:-

. "Retired 15-A. A person xetired ZIrom

person is any service and drawing
not eligible | pension shall not be admitted
for to the Membership of the

menbership. Fund.";

. (10} in section 16 of the principal
- Act,~ .

(1} in sub-section (2), "Explanation™
shall be omitted,

.
(ii) sub-section (5}, shall Dbe
omitted;

(11) after section 17 of the principal
Act, the following new section shall be
inserted, namely:-

“Restriction |)17-A. (1) The interest of any
on allepa- mernber in the fund, or the
tion, attach- |right of a member or his or
ment etc¢; her nominee or dependents to
of interest receive any amount from
of member funds, shall not be assigned,
in Fund, alienated or charged and

shall not be 1liable to
attachment under any decree or order of
any Court, Tribunal, Financial Institu-
tions or other authority.



30

(2) No creditor shall be entitled to
‘proceed against the fund or the interest -

therein of any member or hls or her
.nominee or dependents.":

K.G. SHANEAR,
Secretary to Government,
Leglslatlve Affairs & Justice {FAC),
Law Department.



3]
STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

In order to overcome the practical difficulty in implemeniation of the
provisions of the Andhra Pradesh Advocales, Welfare Fond Act, 1987 and
the Andhra Pradesh Advocates' Clerks® Welfare Fund Act, 1992 the Andhra
Pradesh Advacates Welfarc Committee and the Andhra Pradesh Advocates’
Clerks' Welfare Committec has requesicd to amend the respective Acts suit-
ably.

The Sa]icnl Features of the Bill are as [oliows -

(1) The definition of ‘dependent’ in the both the Acts are confined to
wife, husband, father, mother and children or legal heirs.

(2) In section 9(2) (c) of both the Acts for the words “legal rcprésen!n-
tive™ has been substituted by word “dependent™ as a consequential amend-
ment.

(3) The combined stamp for Advocates” Wellfare Fund and the Advo-
cates® clerks’ welfare fund has been enhanced from Rs. 12/- to Rs. 20/-, put
of which a sum of Rs. 15/- shall be credited 10 the Andhra Pradesh Advo-
cales” Welfare Fund and Rs. 5/- shall be credited to the Andhra Pradesh
Advocates® Clerks® Welfare fund by suitably amending the respective pro-
visions of both the Acls,

(4) If the Advocates intends to become the member of the Fund, he
shall Pay an amount of Rs. 100/~ (Rupees one hundred only) towards admis-
sion along with an amount of Rs. 1000/~ (Rupees anc thousand oniy) to-
wards the subscription of life membership.

(5) The consequential amendmenls (o sections 15(3), 15(4), 15(8), 16
and 17 have been made.

(6) In the Clerks” Welfare Committee, three members [rom the three
regions in the Stale are nominated [rom the recognised clerks.

(7} The afloresaid nominaled members will hald office for two years
instead of three years.



Ky

{8) The noninated members can resign their office by piving one month
notice insiead of Ihiree manibs.

(%) The Bank Account of the A.P. Advacates’ Clerks® Welfare Fund
Comumitiee shall be operated jointly with the Chairman instad of Treasurer.

(10) The stamp value has been enhanced from Rs. 12/-to Rs. 20/ asa
cansequential amendment by suilably amending section [2(1) of the Acl.

(11) The Governmenl may make grants for such sum of money in cv-
ery financial year by way of compensation in respect of the vakalats filed by
the Law Officers appointed by the Government and such grants are appor-
tioned between them.

(12) Every recognised clerk of the Advocate below the age of 65 years
recogmized by the committee shall apply to Lhe committee for admission and
he shall pay admission fee of Rs. 50/- along with an ampunt of Rs, 500/~
towards subscription of life membership.

(13) Retired person from service are not entitled for the membership.

(14) Similar to Advocates, 1he interests of the clerks ar their nominees
for dependent are protected [rom attachment and credilors are restricted to
proceed against the Fund or interest therein of any member or his ar her
nominee or dependents,

This Bill seeks to give efect to the above decisions.

- P. CHANDRASEKHAR,
Minister for Law and Courts.



	1992AP19.pdf
	1992AP19.pdf
	2000AP5.pdf
	2001AP21.pdf
	2003AP4.pdf




