
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Provincial Small Cause Courts (Tamil Nadu Amendment) Act, 1949 
 

Act 34 of 1949 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Central Act Amendment, The Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887 
 
Amendments appended: 32 of 1982, 49 of 1994, 26 of 1995



n 

i 

98 Ptovineigt  mall ~au;re ~ o v r t s  [i949: TeN. A d  
(Tnntil Nadu ninendnrent) 

'[TAMIL NAdU] ACT NO. & m V  OB 1949' 

s t  . [THE PROVINCIAL SMALL CAUSE COURTS 
2 
4" ; 

l[TAMI~ NADU] AIvSENDIVENT) ACT, 1949.1 

(Received the assent of the Govemur on the 20th 
1949 ; flrst publiqhd in the Fort St .  G~orge 
on the 27th December 1949.) 

to amend the Provinci'czl 
87, in its application to the 

, WHEREAS i t  is expedient further to amend the 
SmaU C ,use Ccurts Act, 1887, in its application to 
"State of Tamil Nadu], for the purpose hereina 

' appearing ; It is hereby enacted as follows :- 

1. (1) This Act may ba called the 
t s  ('[Tamil Nadu] Amendment) A 

tendsto the whole of the "[State 

(3) it sbll  be deemed to have come into force on 
the 1st day of April 1947. 

ction 28 of the Prcvincial Small C? 
1887, the fcll~wir~g section shrll be inser 

" 28 A. The High Ccurt may' pe 
1887. Small Causes to adjourn from t im to ti 

d ,  Vacatic1** exceeding in tL aggregate two months in each year." 
- P $ L  . 
'I# 
$:i 
.,# ' - 1 Tlzese wcrds werc substituted for the 
:$ Tamil Madu Adaptation of Laws Order, 19 
$. t - Tanil Nadu Adapt atic-n of I,i6ws (Second 
8 1969. 
@' i 4 2 For Statemofit of Objects and Reason 

; i.$' 
P 

Gazette, date .i tjle 6th & September 1949, Part IV-A 
4' 
. : 

8 This expiesaion was substituted for the expression " 
of Madras" by p:,ragraph 3(2) of the Tamil Nadu Adap 
Laws Order, 1970. 

4 This expression wcls substitntcd for the expre 
Madrlbs'' by 1 he T h l  Nadu A d q  t at ion of L ~ w s  
i i~~endcd  by the Til~nil Nadu Adapt ;irion of Laws (Seca~ 
ment) Crder, 1969, 

". 
I 

-3" 



-- - - -- - - - - - -. *- ..*.--.---A 4 - . - -. - - - -  - -- 

1 9 8 2 : ~ . ~ .  Act 321 The provincial~maN Cause 841 
Courts (TtimiZ Nadzi Amendment) . ,  

TAMIL NADU ACT Am. 32 0 F 1982." 

VHE PKOVINaIAL SMALL UAUSE COURTS 
(TAMIL NADU AMENDMENT) 14CT, 1982. r 

[Receivkd the as sa t  of the Prtsident on the 1st June 1982 
first published in the Tamil Nadu Government Gazette 
Extraordinary, on the 5th Junk 1982 (Vaikasi 22, 
nunthubi, Thiruvalluv~r Aundu-20 13 ).] 

An Act furthtr to amend the Prov~cial  Small Cause: Courts 
87 in its application to tht State: of Tamil 

BE it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Tamil 
Nadu in the Thirty-third Year of the Republic of India 
as fcJllows :- 

Short title, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Provjnciel &mill and 
a a u e  Courts (Tamil Nadu Amendment) Act, 1982. commence- 

ment. 
(2) It extends to the whcle of the Stzie of Tamil 

(3) It shall come into force on sach d?.te Pes the State 
Government may, by noti fiation, appoint. 

2. For section 25 of the Pro vineipl Small i; :qe Couxts Substitution new section of 
Act, 1887 (Central Act IX of 1887) (hereioafter referred 25, to as the prirtcipsl Act), the following section shall be Central Act 
substituted, namely :- IX of 1887. 

"25. Revision of decrees and orders of Courts of SmaN 
ict Judge, for the purpose of satisfying 

ree or order made in any cue decided 
all Causes is accortling to law, may of 
or on the application of an aggreived 
n thirty days from the date of such decree . 
he case and pass SUGJ order with respect 

thereto as he thinks fit : I 

Provided that ia relation to any case decided By a 
Distrj ct Judge c?r Additional District Judge exercising 
the jurisdiction of a Judge of a Court of Small Causes, 
the power of revision under this section shnil vest in the 
High Court ." . 

*For Statement ot Objects and Reasons, See Tamil Nadu Gove~ n- 
merit ~cizetfeExtraordinary, dated the 4th 14 arch 1982, part IV- 
SMion 1, page 116, 

.. 



__I_C_ . . -  

8 42 The Provincial Small Cause [I9821 T.N. Act3 
Courts (Tamil Nadu Amell dmen r ) 

the High Court under se 
at the commencement of thi 

red to the District Court concerned. 
urt sh?.ll have juriadictioc to he2r rand 

in accordance with the provisio~s 
cf ~eciion 25 of the principal Act as sub51ituted b> s c ~ i q n  
2 of thjs Act and the judgments end orders of thcHigh 
@urt delivered or mrde before the commencement of 
this Aot shall be enforceable cs if they h;td been deli- 
vered or made by the District  cob^. 

! 

i 

. . 

~ ~ 

I 
I 



33% - TAMIL ~ A D L  C&\-Er;s \{EST GAZETTE 
A ---- ----. 

. -- 
* * . I ! ;  ,,, 1,'- .-. ...,. 4 The tollow~~lg ,Act ol t l l ~  ' T a ~ l r i l  Nnll~r tg is lut i~c A N S ( J I I I I ) I ~ ' \ ~ ~ & ~ ~ ; ~ ~ ~ ( ' ~ \ \ ~  hl~drrr 

' I  li r l ' i  

I ,  of the president on the Ntl: A u g ~ s l  I ,011 I I I I~ is IICI.U()Y pllbl/ghOl( ( ~ r  ~ ~ j l l ~ r ~ l  
information :- 

! .__ .. - ._.*C.lr -.-. * _,..I. .. . ( . I ,. , . ,  ,,. . 
i{i , . 
.* ,! 

AC1' No. 49 01: I&. 
l $  
r' 
: I  An Aajurtlrher to omend the Provincial Small Caqe Courts Acb 1887, in ita 
,i application 10 the State of 7nt71il Nudu. I )  

31 ! 

/I 1, - .: Be it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in th-4 
. 1 ' ' 'Forty-fifth Year of the Republic of India as follows:- 

:; I .  L 
d .  

!Sh~rb title, 1. (1) This Act may be called the Provincial Small Cause Courts (Tam11 
extznt and Nadu Amendment) Act, 1994. j cornmenee- 

(2) It cxtellds to the whole of the Statc of Taqnil Nadu. 

(3) It shall come into force at once. 

2. In section I7 of the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887, in sub-secticx~ 
(I). for the proviso, the following proviso shall be substituted, namely :- 

"Provided that an applicant for a review of judgment shall, at the time of 
presentiug his application, pither deposit in the Court, the amount due from him 
in pursuance of the judgment or give such security for the compliance with the judg- 
ment as the Court nay 011 a previous application made by him in this behalf, have 
directed.", 

(By order of tl t; Governor) 

M. MUNIRAMAN, 
Secretury to Covern~?zent, L a ~ z  Departi?ier~l, 



IVIADRAS, WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 20: 1995 
Pural tasl 4, Yu~ra, Th:ruvalluv lr Aa~!du-2026 

- -  -- - -____ 
. . --IID-, 

-* A ,  

/ Part IVLSection 2 
iA N.& A- a d  2 

'k d- ..."..%" e n , ,  A d d -  J , \*. '  L- -. 
The following Act of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly rec ived. the o\;ent 

of ths President on the 14th Feptember 1995 and is hereby publishecl for 
general information':- 

ACT No. 26 OF 1995. i 
An ~ c t  further to amend the Presidency Small Cause Ccurts Ant, ! 882 and t h ~  

Provincial Small Cause Courtr Act, 1887, in its applicafion to the State 
of Tomil Nadic. 

BE i t .  enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tan~il  Nadu in the 
Forty-sixth Year of the Republic of Jndiaas follows:- I 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Presidency Small Cause Courts and the Short title, 
Provincial Small Cause Courts (Tarnil Nadu Amendmtrit) Act, 1995. extent and 

oommence- 
a e n t  , 

(2) It extends to  the wholeof the State of Tamil Nadu. I#; 

(3) It shall comeinto force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notification, appoint. 

2. 111 the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882,- Amendment 
of Central Act 
XV of 1802. 

(1) in section 14, for the words "twenty rupees", the words "ma burrotred 
rupees " shall be substituted ; 

(2) in section 18,- 
(a) in the opening portion, foi the words " two thousand rupees", the words 

"twenty thousandr~p,ees" shall be substituted; 

(b)' id the Explanation 1, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words 
"twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

. .--,....- *,.* * -4 

G~OUQ] . . .  ... ?,!Vw2, ,., Ex,, (456) - 1 , . . , . (  95 ) . I f  I ' ! L 7 r 
I ,  

, . . I .  - . 1 '  . - - . -  4 r 



, \ 

TAMIL NADU GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EXTRAORDINARY' 
. --- . , _,- ----. _- -- ---_- 

(3) ic sect~on 20, in the first paragraph, for tbe words "two thousand rupees" 
occurrhp in two places, the wordsc 'twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(4) in section 21, for the words ''013e thousand rupees", the words "ten tl-0x1- 
sand cupees" shall be substituted ; 

(5) in section 22,- 
mn (i) for che words "one thousand rupees", r the words " ten thousand 
rupee!: ' shall be substituted ; 

'I- (ii) for the words "three hundred rupees", tt-e words "three thousand 
rupees!" shall be substituted ; 

f.6) In section 39, in sub-section (I ) ,  for the words "one tllousand rupees", 
:he wrords "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(7) in section 41, for the words "two thousand rupees", the words "five 
thausand rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(8) in section 45, in the second paragraph, for th.e words "ten rupees", the 
words "one hundrcd rupees" shall he substituted ; 

t9) in section 63, in the first paragraph, for the words "one thousand 
npe&"' the words "two thousand and five hundred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

. (10) in section 69, in sub-sectio11 (I), for the words "five hundred rupees", 
the words <'two thousand and five hulldred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(11) in section 76, for the words "twenty rupees", the words "two hundrd 
rupees" shall be substituted. 

imendment ef 3. In the Provincial Small Cause Courts Act, 1887,- Central Ac 
Central Act q o f  I a 
LA of 1887. 

(1) in section 12, in sub-section (3), for the words ''twenty rupees", the 
W I B ~ S  "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted ; 

(2) in section 15,- 

(i) in sub-section (2), for the words '' five hundred rupees ", the-words 
''6~6, thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii) in sub-section (3). f o r  the words cGc ,~~c  rhousand rupecs", thc wo1.d~ "five 
thousard rupees" shall be subs:ituted ; 

1 ,  \ 

(3) in section 28, in sub-section (T), for the words "five thousand rupees", 
the tqords '<thirty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

?ransitory 4. (1) All suits a ~d proceedings of which the amount or value of the subject- 
provision. matter exceeds rupee two thousand but does not exceed rupees twenty thousand 

a d   ending in the adras City Civil Court, immediately before the date of the 
Commencement of t d is Act, shall be heard and disposed of by the Madras City Civil 
Con'", as if this A t had not becn passed. 4 

(2) All suits and proceedings of which the amount or value ofthe subject- 
glatfd!~ exceeds five hundred rupees but does not exceed five thousand rupees and 
penB:ng in any court of the District Munsif, immediately beforo the date of 
the cammencement of this Act, shall be heard and disposed of by such court of 
the J3istrici Munsif .is if this Act had not been passed. 

(By order of the Governor.) 

M. MUNIRAMAN. 
Secretary lo Government, Eaw Bcpartmzenf. 

v"-*r*rm"lv ---I. 11 C .  -,'P I-7ir..---warn* --.-y"ru---~ 4.- 

1- 

rumm AND WBCISIIED BY n l E  BIRICTQR QF STATIONaBY AND PLIM#NG,*~,&AS'' ' 
'd- aN )&HALLf 8 8  THE GQVEUHNeM OD ' t w L  ;YAPU - - .---+,a - 

- . -.. - -  - -  -- + .  


	1949TN34.pdf
	1949TN34.pdf
	1982TN32.pdf
	1994TN49.pdf

	1995TN26.pdf



