The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 1961

37 of 1961

Keyword(s):
Fees, Court

Amendments appended: 29 of 1962, 15 of 1965, 9 of 1977, 12 of 1995, 4 of
1996, 18 of 2003

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




Exirea No. 39 REGISTERED No. B-7551

Bots of the Cuiarst Lsgisiature and Ordingness promuigaied
and Hegulations mads by the Governes.

GUJARAT ACT o, XXXVII OF 1961.—An Act to amend the Bombay Court Fees

An Act to ament

1t is hereby enacted
follows e

o




P



Exira No. 29 REGISTERED No. G-448

The Gufarat Government Gasette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

L 1T s\u,nDAY~ ALEMBER 1, p‘,ﬁz';mxwx 10, 1881

Separate pagmg is piven {o this- Part in order thai it may he tiled as a separate
compilation,

PART IV

Aotz of the CGujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated
and Begualations made by the Governor

CONTENT = o
T PicEs
CUJARAT ACT NO, XXX OF (9562.--An Act further ta amend the Bnmb?y Ceurt-
fees Act, in §is application 1o the state of Gujarat B . 377-378

" Fhe fn]lowuw Act of the CJle”lI'"iI.LLgISidILITL, having been dsscnted to b) the
CGovernor on e 30th August 1962, is hereby publisked for general information.

M. G. MONANI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujaral,
i.egal Department.

GUIARAT ACT NO, XXIX OF 1962
(First published, after having received the wssent of the CGovernor in the
“Gujarat Government Gazette” on the st September 1962).
An Act further to amend the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1939 in its application
to the State of Gujarat.

It is hereby enacted in the Thirteenth Year of the Republic of India as
follows: —
Bem. 1. This Act may be called the Bombay Court-fees {Gujarat Amendment)
JNX- Act, 1962.
3 0
195% 3 In the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959 in its application to the State of Amendment
Gujarat (hercinafter referred to as ‘the principal Act’) in the heading below gg{h{;::;::]
Chapter TI, after the words “HIGH COURT” the words “AND IN THE COURT of Bem. XX

OF SMAILL CAUSES OF AHMEDABAD” <hall be inserted. ok of
7Y

Shurt tifle.

1V-Exfra- 63 (Lino)



STE U GOV GAZ, BXL T EMNDBEL 1 e DHALRA 16, tedd {Parr 1y

Swentment 3 Lnosection 3 of the principal Act, —
of zoction 3

i FEEHIN . . o T
NNXVL of (i) aficr the second paragiapiy, the foilowing paragraph shall be inserted,
1559,

namely - -—

“and the fees for the time being chargeable in the Court of Small Causes
of Atmedabad and iy Otlice,”s :

(i) in the nmareinad note afier tie words “original side™ the words ™ ang
in the Court of Small Causes of Alincdabad ™ shall be inserted.

Amentment & In section 4 of the iﬂ'in(:ipﬁl Act, after sub-section (I, the following sub-
Copmton doaction shall be inserted, namely :- -
XV of
I

“{2) When any such difurence arises in the Court of Small Causes of
Alinudabad the question shall be referred 1o the Registrar, whose decision
therzon shall be final, subject to revision, on un application, made within
sixty days frem the date of i decision, by the party concerned or such
olilcer a#s may be appainted in this behall by the State Governmeai, by the
Chi:f Judgz of the said Court of 3wl Cavscs or by such Judge of that Court
ay Ure Chiel Judes shell apnoint cither genersdly or wpzeially in this behalf”.

Amendment 5y goetion 5 of (e principal Act,

af zeeting

nf 13,

XXXV of o . S ) ) )
i ? (1) siter sub-secltion (23 the Followine sub-section shall be inserted. nanely .
1405, = -
“(3} Whon any such differesce srises in the Alunedabad Cily Civil Court,
the question shall be referred to the Regisurur of the Cuy Givil Court whaose
feoiston shall he final, subiect to vovision, on sa application, made within

sixty dars from the dale of the duzision, by the party concarazd or such
officer as may be anpainted in this hehali by the State Government, by the
Principal Judge or such other Judee of the said Court us the Principal Judee
chall appeint either ecnerally or specinlly in this bahlf”;

() after  sub-section (), the followine  sub-section  shall be  incerted,
namely 1---

U5 Nothing in this ssetion shal! affect the provisions of (he Presidency XV of
Smull Conve Courts Aot 1892 n its application to the State of Ciunjarat.”. e

Amendent 6. In <etien 34 of the princiral Act, after the words “every District Judes ™
nf zepsian Vet . . , ) ; E HA
af L. e Principal Jodie of s Ahmodahad City Civil Cacr(™ gl Lot
NNNVE of dnsered

LTS

3 the words

PRINTFD AT THE GOVIRNMEST CENTRAT PRISS, SIMERATAR



§

M.

. Ezira No, 16 : o REGISTERED No. G-448

hm

LY

‘The Gujarat Government 6;32&2"_
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. VI) MONDAY, MAY 17, 1965/VAISAKHA 27, 1887

v o Soparate paging is given to this part In order that it may be
¥ filed ns a separate compilation :

PART IV

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated
and Regulations made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been as;ented to by the
Governor on the 15th May 1965 is hereby published for general information.

SUMANT M. VIDYARTHI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legal Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 15 OF 1965.
( First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Gujarat Government Gazette” on the 17th May 1965.)
An Act further to amend the Bombay Court-fges Act, 1959 for certain purposes.
It is hereby enaéted in the Sixteenth Year of the Republic of India as follows : —
1. (I) This Act may be called the Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendment) ghors ﬁu,-

Act, 1965. and gommen.
. - cemont,
(2) Tt shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.
2. In Sch - Amendme
edule I to the Bombay Court-fess Act, 1959, o
of Sohedula

(@) in Article 1, in column 2, at the end the following shall be added, %m&
namely ; —

Lo o ) 43
IY‘EM_IB{»(@M)}SJ\‘:{‘Q ,mﬁ—". R S A T T ~'l'f‘$ TN



GUJ. GOVT. GAZ, BX,, MAY 17, 1965/ VAISAKHA 27, 1887 [Parr 1V

“Provided that the maximum fee leviable on a plaint or memorandum of
appeal or of cross-objection shall be fifteen thousand rupees.”;

{b) in the Table of rates of gd valorem fees leviable on the institution of suits,-

() for the words, letters and figures “and at the rate of Rs. 100 for every
Rs. 10,000 or part thereof, over Rs. 1,00,000 for example: —" the following
shall be substituted, namely:—

“and, over Rs. 1,00,000, at the rate of Rs. 100 for every Rs. 10,000 or
part thereof, upto a maximum of Rs. 15000, for example:—";

(37 for the last three entries, namely:—

“13,00,000 15,300-00
14,00,000 16,300-00
15,00,000 17,300-00”

the following shall be substituted, namely:—

*12,70,000 15,000-00".

of more
]

_mnmcovmumcm’mmm,mm



Exira No,13 REGISTERED No. LI/50/GNR/2

©

E’be Gujarat Government Saztty
- EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. XVIII] WEDNESDAY, JULY 13, 1977/ASADHA 22, 1899

Separate paging is given to this Pari in order tha¢ it may
be filed as a separate compilation,

PART IV

Acts of the Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promuigated and
Regulaticns made by the Governor,

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
Govemnor on the 6th July, 1977 is hereby published for general information.

S. L. TALATI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
L.egal Department,

GUJARAT ACT NO. % OF 1977,

( First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the
“Gujarat Government Gazettee” on the 13th July, 1977).

An Act further to amend the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959.

Tt is herehy enacted in the Twentv-eighth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-- -

1. This Aet may be ealled the Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act, Short title,
1977,

Bo 2. In the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959, section 37 shall be re-numbered as sub- Amendment
xx. section (I} of that seetion and after sub-scetion (Z) as so renumbered, the following °f seetion 87

) : f Bo
XfVI sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:— %KKHVLI of
N ‘ , , . L : 1959,
1959, “(&) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (I} where,---

(@) the State Government, in relation to any area in the State, or

(b) the Collector, in relation to any areain the district under his charge,

66
IV—Extra—18



67 QuJ. GOVT, GAZ, EX, JULY 13, 1977/ASADHA 22, 1809 [Part IV

is satisfied that on account of temporary shortage of stamps in any arca, fee
. cannot be paid, and payment of feo cannot bo indicated on documents, by means
of stamps, the State Government, or as the case may be, the Collector may, by noti-
fication in the Official Gazeite, direct that in such area and for such period as may be
specified in such notification, the fee may be paid in cash in any Government trea-
sury or sub-treasury, and tho officer-in-charge of such treasury or sub-treasury
shall, on production of a challan evidencing payment of fee in such treasury or sub-

~ treasury; certify such payment by endorscnent on the document in respect of which
foe has been so paid, and state in the said endorsement the amount of the fee so paid.,

{3) An endorsement made on any document under sub-section (2) shall have
the same effect asif the fee of an amount equal to the amount stated in the en-
dorsemont had been paid in respect of, and such payment had been indicaied
on, such dosument by means of stamps under sub-section (1).”.

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.



Extra No. 13

The éuiarat Government mgttte
EXTRAORDINARY

FUBLISHED BY AUTHOEITY

Vol. XXXVI) SATURDAY, JULY 29, 1995/SRAVANA 7, 1917

Separate paging is given to this Part in order thet §t
may be §led as a separate compliation,

Bom.
XXXV
of 1959

PART—IV

Asts of e Legislatare and Ordinances proussignied
and tons made by the Governer.

“ The following Act of the Gu-jarat Legislature, baving been assented to by the
overnor on the 29th July, 1995 is hereby published for general information.
. KUM. H. K JHAVERI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,

( First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the Gujarot
Government Gazette on the 29th July, 1995 ).

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959.

It is hereby enacted in the Forty-sixth Ycar of the Republic of India as
follows :(—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendment)

Act, 1995,

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by
notification in the Official Gazeite, appoint. :

2. In the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959 (hereinafter referred o as. “the principal
Act"}, in section 6, in cluase (iv), in sub-clause (j), for the words "thirty rupees”,
the words "two hundred rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In the principal Act, in Schedule [,—

(1) for Article 1, the following shall be substituted, pamely:——

13-3

Short title
and commence-
ment.

Amendment of
section 6 of
Bom. XXXVI]
of 1959,

Amendment of
Schedule I to
Bom. XXXVI
of 1959.



13-2)

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995

[ PART IV

1 2 3

“1. Plaint or memorandum . As per rate specified in
of appeal (not other- . the Table annexed at the
wise provided for - end of this Schedule.";

in this Act) or of cross
objection presented

to any Civil or Revenue
Court.

(2) in Article 15, in column 3, for the words "fifteen rupees”, the words "fifty
rupees” shall be substituted, ’ :

(3) in Article 16, in column 3, for the words "fifty rupees", the words "two
hundred rupees” shall be substituted,

" (4) in Article 17, in column 3, for the words "flfty rupees”, the words "two
hundred rupees" shall be substlmtcd

(5) for the existing Table appearing after Article 17, the following shall be
substituted, namely :—

TABLE
{See Article 1 of Scheduie 1)
Table of rates of ad valorem fces leviable on institution of suits, etfc.

.................................................................................................

When the amount or But does not Proper court
value of the subject exceed fee.
matter in dispute
excecds
(1) @ 3)

Rs Rs. Rs

15,000 2.5% On claim amount,
15,000 15,500 1135
15,500 16,000 - 1170
16,000 16,500 1205
16,500 17,000 1240
17,000 17,500 1275
17,500 18,000 1310
18,000 18,500 : 1345
18,500 19,060 1380
19,000 19,500 1415
19,500 20,000 1450
20,000 21,000 _ 1495
21,000 22,000 " 1540
22,000 23,000 1585
23,000 24,000 1630
24,000 25,000 ' 1675
25,000 26,000 1720
26,000 27,000 : 1765
27,000 28,000 1810
28,000 25,000 - 1855

29,000 30,000 1600



PARTIV]

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995

- @ @
30,000 32,000 1960
32,0600 34,000 2020
34,000 36,000 2080
36,000 38,000 2140
38,000 40,000 2200
40,000 42,000 2260
42,000 44,000 2320
44,000 46,000 2380
46,000 48,000 2440
48,000 50,000 2500
50,000 55,000 3300
55,000 - 60,000 3660
60,000 65,000 3900
65,000 70,000 4200
70,000 75,000 4500
75,000 80,000 5200
80,000 85,000 5525,
85,000 90,000 5850
90,000 95,000 6175
95,000 - 1,004,000 6500
1 lakb 2 lakhs 15,000
2 lakhs 3 Jakhs 22,500
3 lakhs 4 lakhs 30,900
4 lakbs 5 lakhs 37,500
5 lakhs 6 lakhs 45,000
6 lakhs 7 lakhs 52,500
7 lakhs 8 {akhs 60,000
8 lakhs 9 lakhs 67,500
9 lakhs 10 lakhs 75,000
10 lakhs 11 lakhs 77,000
11 lakhs 12 lakhs 84,000
12 lakhs 13 lakhs g1,000
13 lakhs 14 lakhs 98,000
14 lakhs 15 lakhs 1,065,000
15 takhs 16 lakhs 1,12,600
16 lakhs 17 iakhs 1,19,000
17 lakhs 18 lakhs 1,26,000
18 lukhs 19 lakhs 1,33,000
19 [akhs 20 lakhs 1,40,500
20 lakhs 21 lakhs 1,41,000
21 lakhs 22 lakhs 1,43,000
22 lakhs 23 lakhs 1,49,500
23 Jakhs 24 lakhs 1,56,000
24 lakhs 25 lakhs 1,62,500
25 lakhs 26 lakhs 1,69,000
26 lakhs 27 lakhs 1,75,500
27 lakhs 28 lakhs 1,82,000
28 takhs 29 lakhs 1,88,500
29 takhs 30 lakhs 1,95,000
30 lakhs 31 lakhs 1,95,300
31 lakhs 32 lakhs 1,96,800
32 lakhs 33 lakhs 1,98,000
33 lakhs 34 lakhs 2,04,000
34 lakhs' 35 lakhs - 2,10,000
35 lakhs 36 lakhs 2,16,000

[13-3



13-4} ' GUJ ARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX,, 29-7-1995 | PART 1V

@ @ | ©)
36 lakhs 37 lakhs 2,22,000
37 lakhs ' 38 lakhs o 2,28,600
38 iakhs 39 lakhs 2,34,000
39 lakhs 40 lakhs 2,40,000
40 lakhs 41 lakhs ' 2,41,900
41 lakhs 42 lakhs 2,43,600
42 lakbs : 43 lakhs : 2,45,100
43 Jakhs 44 lakhs : 2,46,400
44 lakhs 45 lakhs . 2,47,500
45 lakhs . - 46 lakhs 2,53,000
46 lakhs 47 lakhs 2,58,500
47 lakhs 48 lakhs 2,64,000
48 lakhs 49 lakhs 2,69,500
49 lakhs 50 lakhs 2,75,000
50 lakhs ' 51 lakhs “ 2,75,400
51 lakhs _ 52 Jakhs 2,75,600
52 takhs 53 lakhs ’ 2,78,250
53 lakhs 54 lakhs 2,80,800
54 hakhs 55 lakhs 2,83,250
55 lakhs 56 lakhs 2,85,600
56 lakhs 57 lakhs 2,87,850
57 lakhs 58 lakhs 2,90,000
58 lakhs 59 lakhs . 2.95,000
59 lakhs 60 lakhs 3,004,000
60 takhs 61 [akhs 3,01,950
61 lakhs 62 lakhs 3,03,800
62 lakhs 63 lakhs 3,05,550
63 lakhs 64 lakhs 3,07,200
64 lakhs 65 lakhs '3,08,750
65 lakhs 66 lakhs _ 3,10,200
66 lakhs 67 lakhs 3,11,550
67 lakhs 68 lakhs 3,12,800
68 lakhs 69 lakhs 3,13,950
69 lakhs 70 lakhs - 3,15,000
70 lakbs 71 lakhs 3,15,950
71 lakhs 72 lakhs ' 3,16,800
72 lakhs 73 lakhs 3,17,550
73 lakhs 74 lakhs ' 3,18,200
74 lakhs 75 lakhs 3,18,750
75 lakhs 76 lakhs 3,19,200.
76 lakhs. 77 lakhs 3,19,550
77 lakhs 78 1akhs 3,19,800
78 lakhs 79 {akhs 3,19,950
79 lakhs 80 lakhs 3,20,000
80 lakhs 81 lakhs : 3,22,380
81 lakhs 82 lakhs : 3,25,540
82 lakhs 83 lakhs 3,27,850
83 lakhs 84 lakhs 3,29,280
84 lakhs ' 85 lakhs 3,31,500
85 lakhs 86 lakhs : - 3,33,680
86 lakhs - 87 lakhs _ 3,35,820
87 lakhs : T 88 lakhs 3,37,040
88 lakhs 89 lakhs 3,38,200
89 lakhs 90 lakhs : 3,40,200

90 lakhs _ 91 lakhs 3,42,160



PART V]

§) | @ @
a1 lakhs 92 lakhs 3,44,080
92 lakhs 93 lakhs 3,45,%60
93 lakhs 94 lakhs 3,47,800
94 lakhs 95 lakhs 3,48,650
95 lakhs ' 96 lakhs 3,459,440
96 lakhs 97 lakhs 3,50,170
97 lakhs 98 lakks 3,52,800
98 lakhs 99 lakhs 3,53,430
99 lakhs QOne crore 3,55,000

............................................................... ——— - -

for every additional one lakh rupees or part thereof.

4. 1n the principal Act, in the schedule IT,—
- (1) in Article 1, in column 3,—

(a) for the words "Twenty naye paise", the words "One rupee” shall be
substiinted;

(b} for the words "Thirty-five nayc paise”, the words "One rupee” shall be
substituted; -

{¢) for the words "Sixty-five naye paise”, the words "Two rupees” shall be
substituted;

(d) for the words "One rupee”, the words "Five rupees” shall be substituted:

{e) for the words "Two rupees fiflly naye paise”, the words "Five rupecs”
shall be substituted;

{f) for the words "Fifty rupecs”, the words "Five hundred rupees” shail be
substitated;

(g) for the words "Twenty rupees”, the words "Two hundred rupees” shali
be substituted;

(h) for the words "Five rupees", the words "Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(2) in Article 2, in column 3, for the words "Ten rupees”, the words "Filty rupecs”
shall be substituted;

(3) in Asticle 3, in column 3, for the words "Two rupees”, the words "Five rupees”
shail be substituted;

(4) in Article 4, in column 3, for the words "Fifty naye paise”, the words "One
rupee” shall be substituted,

(5)  in Article 7, in column 3, for the words "One rupee”, the words "Five rupees”
shall be substituted;

GUIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995

13-5

Amendment of
Schedule 11 to
Bom. XXXVI
of 1959.



13-6]

Vv

1898.

2

1974,

of

of

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995 [ PART TV -

(6) in Article 9,—

(a) in column 1, for the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure,
1898", the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973" shail be
substituted;

(b} in column 3, for the words "One rupee twenty-five naye paise”, the words
"Two rupees" shall be substituted.

(7} in Article 10, in column 3, for the words "Twenty-five naye paise”, the words
"One rupee” shali be substituted;

(8) in Article 11, in column 3, for the words "One rupee twenty- five naye paise”,
the words "Three rupees” shall be substituted;

(9). in Article 12, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "One rupee”, the words "Two rupees” shall be substituted;

{(b) for the words "Two rupees”, the words "Three rupees" shall be sub-
stifuted;

(c) for the words "Four rupees”, the words "Five rupees” shall be substituted;

{10} in Article 13, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "One rupee”, ihe words “Two rupees” shall be substituted;

(b} for the words "Two rupees and [itty naye paisc”, the words "Ten rupecs”
shall be substituted:

(c) for the words "Five rupees”, the words "Fifteen rupees” shall be sub-
stituted; :

{11) in Article 14, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "Ten rupees”, the words "Twenty rupees” shall be sub-
stituted;

(b) for the wards "Twelve rupees fifty naye paise”, the words "Fifty rupees”
shal] be substituted;

(12) in Article 15, in column 3, for the words "Fifty naye paise”, the words "One
riapee” shall be substituted;

(13) in Article 16, in column 3,.-

(a) for the words "Five rupees”, the words "Ten rupees” shall be substituted;
(b) for the words "One rupee", the words “Five rupees"shall be substituted;

(14} in Article 17, in column 3, for the words "Thirty-seven rupees fifty naye paise”,
the words "Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

(15) in Article 18, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "Fifteen rupees”, the words “Fifty rupees”shall be sub-
stituted; :



PARTIV :
] GUIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995 13-7

(b) for the words "Two rupees fifty naye paise”, the words "Five rupees"
shall be substituted; Lo

(c) for the words "Six rupees twenty-five naye paise", the words “Ten rupees”
shall be substituted;

(d) for the words "Twelve rupees. fifty naye paise” occuring at three places,
{be words "Twenty rupees” shall be substituted;

(16) in Article 20, in column 3, for the words "Thirty-seven rupees fifty naye
paise”, the words "Forty rupees” shall be substituted;

(17) in  Anicle 21, in column 3, for the words "Thirty-seven rupees fifty naye
paise", the words "Forty rupees" shall be substituted;

(18) in Article 22, in columa 3, for the words "Two rupees”, the words "Five rupees”
shall be substituted; :

(19) in Atticle 23, in columa 3,--

(a) for the words “Thirty-seven rupecs fifty naye paise” pccuring at four
places, the words “Forty rupees” shali be substituted; '

{h) for thr winrda "Eightovn :apees m"venly-five naye paise“, the words -
»Twenty ropecs” shall be substituted;

(c} for the words “Thirty rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees” shall be
substituted;

(20) in Article 24, in column 3,--
(a) for the words "One rupee", the words "Two rupees” shall be substituted;
(b) for the words "Two rupees”, the words "Five rupees” shall be substituted;
(21) in Article 25, in column 3,
(a) for the words "Two rupees”, the words "Five rupees"‘ §]1all'be substituted;

(b) for the words “Three rupees”, the words "Five rupees” shall be sub-
stituted,;

(c) for the words "Six rupees”, the words "Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

{22) in Article 26, in column 3, for the words "One rupee twenty- five naye paise”,
the words "Two rupees” shall be substituted; - '

(23) in Article 27, in column 3, for the words "Sixty-five naye paise”, the words
"One rupee" shall be substituted;

(24) in Article 28, in cotumn 3, for the words "Two rupees®, the words "Five rupees”
shall be substituted; :

(25) in Article 29, in column 3, for the words "One rupee”, the words "Two rupees "
shall be substituted; .



13-8]

v
1939.
59
1988.

of

of

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995 {PART IV

(26) in Article 30, in column 3, for the words "One rupee”, the words “Two rupees”
shall be substituted;

(27) in Article 31, in column 3, for the words "One r{jpee", the words "Two rupees”
shall be substitnted;

(28) in Article 32,--
(a) in column 1, for the words, letters and figures "Chapter IV of the Motor
Vehicles Act, 1939" the words, letter and figures "Chapter V of the Motor
Vehictes Act, 1988" shall be substituted: :

(b) in column 3, for the words "Five rupees”, the words "Ten rupees” shal
be substituted;

(29) in Articlg 33,--
(a) in column 1, the brackets and words "(of Ahmedabad)” shall be deleted;
{b) in column 3,--
(i) for the words "Ten rupees”, the words "Fifty rupees” shall be substituted;

{ii) for the words "Fifty rupees”, the words "One hundr_ed rupees” shall be
substituted;

(iii) for the words "One hundred rupees”, the words "Five hundred rupees”
shall be substituted;

(30) in Article 34, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "Fifty rupees”, the words "One hundred rupees" shall be
subsfituted,

(b) tor the words "Ten rupees”, the words “Twenty rupees” shali be sub-
stituted;

(31) in Article 335, in column 3,--

(a) for the words "Two rupees fifty naye paisc" occuring at two places, the
wards "Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

(b} for the words "Five rupees", the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted;
(c} for the words "One rupee", the words "Ten rupecs'; shall be substituted;

(32) in Article 36, in column 3, for the words "Five rupees", the words "Twenty
rupees” shall be substituted;

(33) in Article 37,—

(a) in column 1, for the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure
Code, 1898*, the words and figures "Criminal Procedure Code, 1973" shall
be substituted;

(b) in column 3, for the words "One rupee”, the words "Ten rupees” shall be
substituted;

V of 1898,
20f 1974,



[PART WV GIJARAS (roVERGMENT beAveTTE, BA, 29-7-45 139

(34) after Article 38, the following new Article shail be added, namely :(—

1 2 3
"39, Application for adjournment - Five rupees”.
presented to the Court in any

proceedings.

................................................................................................

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL. PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.



ook

- ﬁﬁ?.

. The Bujarat Goncenment Gasette

EXTRACRUINARY

“JEILIRHLD o AUTHO: ITY

VOL XXXVII |

Tl R T

o .

o TUESI}F’LY MARCH 2!5 IQ%FCAITRA o, 1918

Swmhgvmmﬁhi'mh&mfm&
may Be Siad as w wparate compBlation.

Acts o e

- FPART—IV

wmmw
nﬂebyﬁeﬁam

The following Act of'tl_:-:: Gujarat Legislaturc having been assented to by the Governor .
on the 26th March, 1996 is hereby publi,shcd for general information. :

SMT. K. R. TRIVEDI,

- Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs D{:parlmcnt

GUJARAT ACT NO. 4 OF 1996

( First published, afler-having received the assent of the Governor in the
Gavernmem Gazeite™ on the 26th March, 1996). ;

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Courl-feas [G‘Ll]arai Amendment) Act, 1995.

£

Ttis hereby enacted in the Forty-seventh Year of the Republic of Iadia as {ollows :—

1. (1) Thls Act may be called the Enml:ray Court-fees {Gujaral Arhendment) Amending
Act, 1996. ;

(2) I shall be deemed to have coniic into fprre on the 281h August, 1995.

2. The Government Notitication in the Legal Dopariment No. GK/19/95/CFA/1002/1205/1

; dated the 3rd August, 1995 issucd under sub-section (2) of section 1 of the Bombay Couri-fees
(Gujarat Amendment) Act, 1995 (hereinafter referred to as "the amending Act") shall be and 2

. shall be deemed always to have been rescinded and on such rescission, the cxprcss‘inscl't'rﬂll
and substitution made in the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959 (bereinalier referred to as "the
principal Act") by the amending Act shall cease to have effect and the provisions of the
principal Act existing :mmcdi‘am!y before such insertion or substitution shall stand revived
and shall have the same force and effect as they had immediately before such amendments.

3. In the amending Act, in section 1, fﬂr sub-section (2), the fﬁllawmg Sllb-’im. tion shall - Amen

bc subqtnluu,d namely :—

“(2) It shall'come into fnrre on such date as the Staic Governmeni may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, appoint.”. :

IV-Ex—4—1

4._‘1 i

“Gujarar

Short title and
com-

menoe-
menk.

ﬁ;s.c-rsulcrn of
otification

ia“ usi.. 1&&

revival o

nﬁmﬁwl ﬂtiﬂv






. Extra No. 19 | KKGISTERED NO. G/GNR/%

"

Gﬂa R R SR

The @u;arat (ﬁnuzrnmmt @agntt:w
EXTRAORDINARY' "

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol XLIV] MONDAY, MARCH 31, 2003/CATTRA 10, 1925

' Separatepagmglsghentoﬁmhrtinorderﬂmtit
’ may be ﬁled as a Separate Compllaﬂon

PA R T.- IV 5
Acts of the Gujarat Legistature and Ordmances promulgated
- and Regulations made by the Governor. .-

‘The foltowmg Act of the Gujarat Legisiature, having been assented

to by the Governor on the 29‘ March, 2003 is hereby published for
general information. o

V.M. KOTHARE,

Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,

Legislative and Parilamentary Affairs Department
GUJARAT ACT NO. 'IB OF 2003

(Ftrst pubhshed aﬂer havmg received the assent of the Governor in
the "Gujarat Govemment Gazette on the 31% March, 2003)

AN ACT

further to amend th¢ Bombay Court fees Act 1959

_ ItisherebyemcwdmﬂleFlﬂy-fomm Year of the Republic of India

1. (l) Th.ls Act may be called the Bombay Couri-fees (Gugarat Short title apé

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Goveinment may,
by notification in the Officia! Gazette, appoint. _

v Ex I 19



192 GUIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZE'ITE, EX,3132008 [PARTIV
m;:":,i* 2 IntheBombayComt feesAa. 1959(hmnaﬁumfemdtoas“ﬂ1e r
AXKVLo! 1999. PﬂmlpalAct"), msectlon6 -

O mdmeg,

@ .'msub-clause(a),foﬂhcwmds ﬁﬁeenmpees mewmas“mmy :
L rupees” shsllbealbsntuted, .

® inimb-clause 0)

.'(i) forwords eighteenmpeesandsevmty ﬁvenayepaise, P
ﬁaewords“forlynq:ees shallbespbshmted, . '

o "(u) 'mthepmuso,forthewords ﬁﬂeenmpem" thewords"_',

©  in subeclause (¢), for the e)nstmg Table, the followmg Table shau'
o :besubstlt\uednamely- - LT : o

AREA | R 'FEES

O S N

" (a)  The area within the limitsof One fom‘th ofthc advalarem fee
' the Municipal Corpotation -~ - leviable for a suit for possession: of
. T '-I__-.thesementtenementorthe '
. 'dominant fenement, whichever is-
- less subjecttoamlmmam fee of
o Rs30-

o Areamthmthehmltsefﬂle qne-sixthof-thead@ofemfee -
Mumclpahty ~ . leviable fora suit for pogsession of -
- thepervicnt tenemggit or the .

dominant tenement, whichever.is -
- le&l.subjacttogmmmmnfeeof
o) 'AnyotherareamﬂzeStateof nmyw T
. Gujamt. . Frer e

@ msub-clm(t).

LI ,)J".',

- .(i) forﬁnewords“ﬂ:ﬂynq:ees ﬂ:ewmds“mxtympees shallbe ,

,'.



PARTIV]  GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX 31-3 2003 | 19-3

| ‘(ii')' ‘ "m the provmo, for the words ﬁﬁy rupees the words “one hundred

@ .

)

©
.Fo.r avoidance of
sale, contract for
saleete.
for avnidalrce of
acquisition -
proceediags.
¥y
®
@
(©)
(3)

-

nipees” shall be substm:ted,

h aﬁersub-clause (h),iimfollowingsub-clamesshallbemserted

n.amely -

-. ‘_.._ W5

. f"(ha) In Suits for declaration that any sale or contract for sale or
 termination of the contract for sale, of any moveable or immoveable

property- ls vold one halfof ad va]orem fee leviable on the valuc of

. (1b). In suits for declaranon that any proceedmgs for compulsory
“acquisition of any moveable or immoveable property are voxd one
- 'halfof ad valorem fee lewable on the va]ue of the property

in: sub-clause i), for the words “twenty rupees”, the. word.; “one

_ hundred rupees shall be substltuted

ip sub-c]ause G, for the words ‘tl:urty rupees”, the words “one |
- hundred mpecs” shallbcsubstltuted

" in clause (v), =

in sub-clause (a), for the words “twelve and a b,alf times” , the words .
* twenty times” shall be substlmted

in sub-clause (b) for the words “twenty nmes” the words “ forty

times “ shail be substitutcd

in sub-clause «©), for the words “twenty times”, the words “forty_

times” shall be substltutod

in clause- (vm) for th_e words*“ ﬁﬁoen times”, the words “thrrty

times” shall be substltuted

(M

InthepnncipalAct,mSchedillel -

for Article I, the followmg shall be substituted, namely -

- Anendutent of

Schedule I to
Bom. XXXVI of
1959,



194

| GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX. 31-3-2003

[PARTIV

e
|- | of appeal (nat. -

(2)

Plaint ormmnormdmn
othe:mseprowdedfor

- | in this Act) or, of cross

. .} objection, presented 10, .
g anyleowRevame
Court. |

Whentheamomtorvalue-

the . mb;ect matte; m
dup\m .
doeamtexoeed
wm

'Whmsmhamountorvaluc.:: -

.therqof,mmmssofom
: hlmdradmpees,uptoom

rupees, for every hundmd

| rupees, orpartthereof,m

- | excess of one thousand -

rupees. .

Wﬁeﬁ mwiiﬁiﬁbﬁnt or va.lue
.exceeds ten thousand
rupees, for every onc -
thousand rupees, or part -

| thereof, inexoessoften

| thousand rupees, upto
: onalakhnfrupws

o .When such amountorvalue
exceeds one lakh of rupees, |

for every ten thousand. .

o ,mpees,orpartt]meof,m
: :aoeasofonelakhmpws

..mtmfeelewableontlw

plaint or memorandum of

npmalorofcmssohe_chop

thm
ﬂ:mmndmpees.

mpws,tq:totenthousand |

: Whm smhmnomt or valuut:.i .

_exceeds oné thousand. : Twenty mpees

'Oﬁehundmd_ '
-_mntympws

Two hundred

foramclaelo ﬂnﬁﬂlowmgdullbembsumed,nmely




PART 8% GUJARAT GOVFRNMENT GAZEITE EX 31-3- 2003

“10. - Probate of a wxll or

-__When the amount or vaiue

- “of the property in respect -
or, oPwhich the grant of

ed, - viprobate or letters is made

. "exceeds one thousand,
e mbew onthepartofthe
" ‘amount or value in excess
i of one thousand rupees,
S "‘upto ﬁftythousand Tupees.

(¥ When the amount or value
“of itte property in respect

of which the grant of

... probate or letters is made |
e;xcaeds fifty thousand .

rupees, on the part of the"

- . amount or valye in excess. -

e of fifty thopsand rupees,

" upto two lakhs rupees.

o When the amount or va]ue .

- of the property in respect

XXIX of 1925,

of which the grant of

. -probate or letters is made

exceeds two Takh rupees, on

thepart of the amount or - '

value in . excess of two
lakhs mpees, unto three

s __lakhs of rupees.

" ‘When the amount or value

* of the property in respect of |
- :wbmhthegrant of probate -

or letters is made exceeds

~ three lakhs rupees, on the
.~ part of the amount or value
~ in excess of three lakhs of

rupess:

ﬁwgran:ofaoemﬁwe
.5 under Part X of the Indian
" Succession Act, 1925, or

unduBombayRegulzmon

;';;ﬁ___ VIl of 1827 orany

19-5 -



19-6 GUJIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 31-3-2003 [PARTIV |

",."tlmebemgmforoem '
_.respect of any property
_ . mcludedmmestate,a_ -
.. ° . grentof probete or leiters of
. administration ismadein
. o respect of the same estate,
" . the fee payable in respect of
by the amount of the fee
S pajd in respect of the

(3)  inAfticle I3, in column 3; for the words “thirty rupees”, the words “
" ity ropoes” shall bo substtted;

(4)  in Article 15 in colunm 3, for the words ‘ﬁﬁeen rupees” the words |
‘thm:y shall be subshmted _

: (S) in Arhcle 16 in column 3 for the words “ﬁﬁy rupees" the words
“one hundmd rupees” shall be substituted;

- (6) in Artwle 17, in column 3 for the words “fifty rupees” the words
“one hundred rupees” shall be substltuted ' '

(1) for the exlstmg Table appeanng after Article 17, the fcllomng shall -
: be substttutcd namely <

“Table of rateg of ad valorem feeg lev:able on the mstltution of suits.

‘When the amount Bu@ “does R Proper fee
ofvalueofthe =~ .~ not exceed - -
'subject matter exceeds R
1 Lo 1000 10
1000 | 2000 200
2000 . .. 3000 S 300
3000:, - ... . 4000 400
4000 .- . 5000 C 500
5000 ., - 6000 600
6000 . .. .7 7000 . 700
7000 .. .. 8000 2 800 .



PARTIV]  GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 31-3-2003 -~ 197

10000 - - - 15080 .o 250
15000 - 200000 1500
20000 7L 0 21000 b 1525,
:2 1()(){} ._j{.: : N :212()()(} "3 _t;. . . 1‘5(){}
22000 - 23000 - uvR 1675
23000 - - 24000 1750
24000 - . 25000 o 1825
25000 C26000 e - 1900
27000 - 28000 .. 2050 -
28000 - - 29000 - 2125
29000 - - 30000 v 2200
30000 -+ " F- - 32000 et - 2375
32000 - - 34000 e 2500
34000~ 36000 ¢ . 2650
360000 - 38000 - . . 2800
38000 . ... . 40000 .. . . 2950
40000 - 42000 - 3109
42000 - . 44000 - 3250 -
44000 - - - 460000 . . .- 3400
46000 48000 3550
~ 48000 - 500000 - - e 3700
- 50000 . 55000 o 4000
‘55000 - . 060000 0 T 4300
60000 65000 .. - 4600
| 65000 - 70000 R - 4900

and the fees increases at the rate of Rs. 150 for every Rs.5,000 or part
" theréof upto’ Rs1;00,000 and over'Rs/'1,00,000 at'the rates of Rs. 200 for
every rupees 10,000 or part thereof, upto-Rs,10,00,000.'and over Rs. -
~ . 10,00,000 at the rate of Rs. 1,200 for every Rs.1,00,000 or part thereof,
- " upto R¥20,00,000 and ‘over Rs. 20;00;000 at the rate of Rs.500 for every
Rs.1,00,000 or part thereof, upto a maximum fee of Rs.75,000, for example

SN B

R, ks

Cea Tal

100000 - 5950
300000 - 9950 .- -
L 400000 - 195G
S 6000000 T 15950



19-8

- Amendment of -

Schedule Il te

Bom, XXXV1 of

1959,

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX,, 31-3-2003 = [PARTIV

®
©

(€)

T
@

: ._ ®

700000 0 - 17950
800000 . 19950 .
900000 - - 21950 - .
10000000 . 23950 -

100000 . - 25150 .

00000 - T 26350
1300000 . 27550 . -
1400000 . 28750 -
1500000 #.- - 29950 .-
1600000 . - 31150,

. 1700000 - - 32350 .-

1800000 33550 -
1960000 - 34750
2000000 . 35950
2100000 - 36450
2200000 © .- - 369507 .

In the principal Act, iﬁ"sehédme-ir -

" in Aticle ], mcolumn3 .

for the words « Twenty naye pa:se” the words “ Ten rupees” shall. -

. be substituted;

for the words “’I'hlrty ﬁve naye paise “, the words “T en rupees”

shall be substmﬁed

for the words “Slxty- ﬁve naye pawe ; the words s Twcnty rupees"

'-for the - words “One rupee” the words - F1ft)g rupoes shall be
.~ substituted; S > Y

for the words “ Two rupees fifty naye pmse the words “One

hundred :upees” shall be substituted; -

for the words Fxﬁy rupees”, the words “ One hundred rupees”
shallbesubstttuted

forthewords“’Ichtympm thewords“Flﬁyrupees shall be
substituted,; '

fortheworda“Fwempew thewords“'l'wenlynq:ew shallbe

substituted;.



PARTIV]  GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX,, 31-3-2003 199

(2)__;' ~ in Article 2, in column 3 for the words “ Ten rupees” the words |
-7 “Fifty rupees” shall bé substltuted,

(3), in Article 3 in column 3, for the words “Two rupees the words
“Frve rupees” shall be substituted; - o K

' (4) in Artwle 4 in colunm 3, for the words “Frﬁy naye pa:se” the
words “Two rupees” shall-be substltuted

(5) in Artigle 5, in column 3 , for the words “One mpee the words “
Five rupees” shall be substituted; :

(6) in Article 6, in column'3 ;-

(a)  for the words Two rupees the words “Ten rupees” shall be
- substituted; - ' R : ]
(b)  for the words “Five rupee the words “Twenty rupees”_shaﬂ be -
~ substituted; . o ' S :

(7Y  in Article 7, in column 3, for the words « One rupee the words
“Ten rupees” shall be substituted; :

" (8) in Atticle 8, in column 3, for the words “ One rupee , the words
“Ten myees” shall b“ substituted;

(9) Tn Artlcle 9, in co}umn 3, for. the words “One rupee twenty ﬁve_-
naye paise”, the words “Fwe rupees”shall ‘be substituted;

(10) ~‘in Article-10, in column 3 , for the words “Twenty -ﬁve naye parse
the words “Two rupees” shall be substltuted : :

:(11) in Artlole 1, in column 3, for the words “One rupee twenty-ﬁve _
naye pazse” the words “Fwe rupees shall be subst:tuted '

(12) mArtwle 12 mcolumn3 -

@ *for the words “ Ons- mpee" the words “Two rupees” 'shall be
o subsututed _

@) - for the words Two mpees" the words ‘Three rupees' “ shall be

(‘e).' for the words “Foyr rupees the words “Five rispees” shall be
: . substltuted :



© PARTIV]  GUIARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 31-3-2003 1210
3)  in Asticle 13, mcolumn3 .

(-a)'- forthewords'“()nerupee thewords“’l‘wompees sha]lbe_

) for tho words _“Two rupees ﬁfty naye parse” t"h}o:_"fvords-_“}‘ive
' . Impoes”shall be substituted; - '

©  for the words “Five rupees \ the Worc__ls “Ten inpeq_o" shall be
subsntuted : ' _ '

(14) mArtlclc14 moolumn3 -

(@  for the words “'I‘en rupoes . the words “Twenty rupoos”shaji be
. substltuted

(b) . for the words “Twelve rupees ﬁﬁy naye par.s*e” ) the words “F1ﬂy
rupoes” shall be substltuted _

(15). in Artrcle 15 in column 3 for the words “Frﬁy naye parse tho
words “Flve rupees” shall be substltuted _

(16) in Artlcle 16, in column 3 y -

(a) _for the ‘words “ Frve rupees”, : the words. “Ten rupees” shall bo'. '

-
3 I.I.Ub uuuw s

| _ .(b). -for -thc words “One rupue”, the words “ Five n.pees” shall bﬂ
substituted; _

{I7) -in Arucle 17 in column 3, for the words “Thirty -seven rupoes ﬁﬁy
naye paise”, the words “Flﬁy mpoos” shall be substltutod _ '

(18) mArﬁclclS moolumn3 -

(a) for the - words “F1ﬁoen mpeos” the words “One hundred rupees
_' shallbesubstmned, R

(b)_'  for the words “T'wo . mpees nm»epmse ” ,thc words »” Twenty
: ﬁvempees”shaﬂbesubstl

(c) - forthewords"Smmpees twenty-ﬁve myepaise, tbewords
R “Flﬁympees sha]lbesubshuned, . -



s GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EXA,31—3-20(‘)3 [PART IV

- {d) for the words “Twelve mpees ﬁﬁy naye paise”, ocourting” at two
~ places against items (c) and (d) the words “One hundted rupees
- shall be substititted; :

() for the words “Twelve rupees ﬁfty naye pazse“ agamst 1tem (e) the
-~ words ”Fxﬂympees” ,haﬂbesubsntuted _

(19 i Artlcle 19 in coluom 3, for the words “Twenty- ﬁve rupees”, the .
 words “Fifly rupees” shallbe substlmted v '

(20) in Article 20 in column 3 , for the words “Thlrty-seven ﬁﬂy naye'
 paise”, the words “Flfty rupees" shail be su'bstltlrted

(2I)  in Article 2}, in column 3 , for the words ‘Thlrty ~seven rupees ﬁﬁy
naye patse” the words “Flfty rupees “shall 'oe subsntuted

(22) in Article 22, in column 3, for the words “ Two rupees”, the words
“Fifly rupees” shall be substituted;

(23) mAmele 23 m column3 -

- (a). for the words ‘Thlrty -seven rupees ﬁﬁy naye pazse oeem'i'ing at
- .- four places the words “Flﬁy rupees” shall be substltuted

(b)y . forthe words “Elghteen rupees seventy- ﬁve naye patse” the words
“Turpn‘hf ﬂlnPPq t‘.‘.“\n" he s]_bstlm[ﬂd

¢}  forthe words “’Ifhlrtv rupees”, the words “One hundred rupees” shall |
< be substituted;

(24) - m Article 24, m eolumn 3,-

@ for the words ' One mpee the wiords, “Two rupees” shall be

-'(b)'- ) Ifor the ‘words “Two rupees” the words‘ “Fwe rupees sha]l be .
-subsnuned : '

C@8): mArue‘}eZS meolumn3 - '_

(a) for the words “'I‘wo rupeee the words “Fwe mpees shall be
_substltuted, CoL T T T s

HIby™  for- the ‘'words “Three ﬂews” “the- words “Ten Tupoos” shall be
| mbetivied,



- PART IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 31-3-2003 1g-te

© - fOT the words “er rupees” the words “FMn rupees" shall bé
- subsututed

_ ”(26) in Artwle 26 in oolumn 3 for the words “One rupee Menty five
naye parse s the words “Ten rupees” shall be substituted;

27 in Art;cle 2’7 in oolunm 3 for the words “erty -ﬁve naye patse
. the words “Two rupees” shall be substrtuted

| (28) in Artrcle 28 A column 3, for the words “Two rupees”, -ihe words
“Ten rupees” shall be substrtuted

a (29) in Arfrcle 29 in column 3, for the words “ One rupee” , the words
: “Frve rupees * shall be substltuted

'(30) in Arucle 30, in- column 3, for the words “One rupee’ the words
~ “Five rupees” shall be substrtuted

(3 in Article 3], in column 3 for the words “One rupee the erds
“Five rupees“ shall be substltuted g -

(32) in Art1c1e 32, in column 3 for the words « Fwe rupees , the words
- “Ten rupees” shall be substltuted - :

(33) in Article 33, -

@ “in colums | the words and brackets “(of Ahmedabad)” shall be
“deleted;

(o)_ '_mcolumnB- _ _

L (1) for the words «“ Ten rupee tire words “_Ei_ﬁy-'_r__upecs” sh_all be.
" substituted,; .

- (ii).for the words “Fifty rupees ) ;-the.words-‘.‘ -One hundred

. rupees”shall be substlmted '

_(m) for the words “ One hundred rupees”, the words “Frve hundred |
. rupees” shall be substltuted '

_(?;4). mArtlcle34 mcolumn3 -‘ o

.!.(a)_ '.-:forﬂaevmrds“&ﬁympees .ﬂzewo:ds“auehunﬂwdrupw silll
) _beSUbStltUted. S .- L

- (b)' ..forthewords“’l‘enmpees thewords“Fl.ﬂympees Mbe '
'substrta.rted, _ _ :



Guj. 12 of
1995,

PARTIV]  GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 31-3-2003 13

'@é)- mAihP1¢*35 m‘i"l“'ilm3+ -.--..l;':fi-_; .

b ?."_"l W e by

’ 5 E"“ It b ‘ Finizas .
(a) for the words “Two rupees ﬁﬁy naye paise ooq rring at two | 'J}

the words “Ten rupocs” shall be substltuted

- {b). ~ for the words “ Five rupoes - the words “ Ten rupoes” shall be -

(g __sql%sntuteda e Evy

(p)_:\j;._';;..,_fgr the WOId!i “0n,e rupec the words - “Ten rupoes : shal '
) substltutod o B

-(36) in Article 36, -in column 3 for the words “Five rupees” the words |
“Twenty mpecs” shail be substxtutod _

(37)  in Article 37, in column 3, for _tl_xe words “One rupee”, the words

- “Twenty rupees” shall be substttutod

- (38)  after Article 38, the followimg new Article shall bc added, namely :-

1 s -2 3
“39. Application for adjournment presented v Twao rupees. ”.
to the court in any proceedings :

5. The Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendmcnt) Act, 1995 is hereby
repealed.

Government Central Pres's, Gandhinagar.

Ta

; ;;?
or



	1961GUJARAT37.pdf
	Guj-1961-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-37.pdf
	Guj-1962-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-29.pdf
	Guj-1965-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-15.pdf
	Guj-1977-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-9.pdf
	Guj-1995-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-12.pdf
	Guj-1996-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Amending Act-4.pdf
	Guj-2003-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-18.pdf




