
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 1961 
 

37 of 1961 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Fees, Court 
 
Amendments appended: 29 of 1962, 15 of 1965, 9 of 1977, 12 of 1995, 4 of 
1996, 18 of 2003



PART IV 
a$*Q& DO the Fn-war L~~sk-ura  an, Ord~nancas p t e m a l ~ c i ~  

=;ad i",sgnlst;n* ri m d e  by the Ooveraor. 

- 
XXXVE 3F 1961 --An Aoc to amend :he Bomiab;y Car i t  Fees 1"~  - 

16*-?03 





EXTRAORDINARY 

---.. . . -- - -- 
-1L. YFw.-'-Yr_---- - -.-.. 

Separate paging la given to thisUPart iu ordcr [bat it ulay be filed as a separate 

PART IV 
Lett of the Gujarat Ledslature and Ortlit~ances promulpaW 

mil &egnlations made br t h e  Oovsrnor. 

-- 
.r(-lZ'f1's'l 5 -. . .. - 

l'.~ ES 
Ci iJAnhT ACT KO. XXIX OF 19137.- - A H  Act fu!tlicr to  a m c r ~ d  the Bcrnhy Ccurl- 

fees Act,  in its application to the stalp oI Gvjarat . , 377-378 
_ _ . - - - -  ----.,r------- _ 

'r\:c Inlluwi~lq Act of the Gujarrtt Lcgisi;~turc, hav i~ ig  been asscnled to by thc 
Ciu~crour on 1112 30th Aup:" 1962. is h:!.cby j~itblisl:-d for g e ~ ~ c r a l  infurmation. 

An Act furt]lcr to amend the notnbay Court-fees Acl, 1959 io its applicatioll 
to the State of Gujarat. 

It is hcreby ennctcd in the Tl~ir tctnth Ye:ir uf t l ~c  Republic o f  India as 

1. This Act may bc called the l301nbay Court-fccs (Gujarat Amendment) Sll , ,rt  ti,.c 

2s;- Act, 1962. 
I r 
'!'590 2. In the Hornbay Court-fees Act, 1959 in its application to the State of An,entlmcnh 

Gujamt (herei~~aftcr referred to as  'the principal Act') in the heading helow :'$:if:: I 

Chapter 11, after tbe words "HIGf? COURT" the words ''AND I N  THE COURT nf 1Jt.m. xx 
OF sMA1.L ClAUSES OF AHMEDABAn" &all be inserted. XVI >f 

1136!l 

377 
Ijr-Extra - 83 ( T h o )  



. ,  l l , j l , ,  3. 11) S C C I ( ~ O I )  3 01 (hi7 ~>rincip:il Act, - 
c J C  svrti I[! 3 
1 . i  ! : : I I I ,  

1 i '  ( i )  aricr thc srcor~d ;::\rng,;:;~;~, the ioiluniog p:~r;igr;rpl~ shull bz inscrtctl, 
I !?5!l. 

~ l i i l ~ l c ~ y  : -- 

" all(] tl:c lets for tl:c t i l l ~ ~  beirlg chargeable i n  t l~e Court of Srllrtll Uauscs 
or :',,iin!cJabr;d and i ~ s  Oilice,"; 

( i i )  i r ~  tli; mu~gi1:al rto!i: n f ~ c r  t l i ~  \turt!s " ~' : i r i~i . i l  side " th2 i:.ords " 311Q 

i r l  tlie Cuurt oC Small C;II~>CS of )\;1111~(Iitb;l(l !' S I ; ~ I I  bc ~ I I S ~ : ! C ~ .  

- 1  ! : I  4. II! secti011 -4 of Ik.: 1;riric:i!)31 Act, i ~ r l ; l .  s~~t)-stct ioli  ( I ) ,  the foIlorvir:; sub- 
*>.- * ( > ,  l i ( 3 l l  4 
,,, s:(;liu~~ s11~iIl bc i~~srr icd, 1~!111tly : - - 

X I , \ \  1 uf 
I ' , : , ' . ! J .  

.*(:I \\:I:?!, :illy s i l ~ h  clilf3:lznc; ;~ri:,:s iri rhc Co:!rt of S!n:ill Cnilszs of 
Al,i;l,:tIai,nrI rlrlestio:l s!ifiil bl: rzf-rr.cd to t ! ~ e  Re:ist:'nr, ! V ~ O S C  riccisioll 
fl-lc,:,.:~>:l $hilll LC ~ : ~ b j ~ ~ t  10 re\-ision. ,JII an api.,lic:\lion, m;!de ci!I:ir~ 
G L ~ ; ;  LI:\;;S frt,,:il 11:t (]:I!: of 1:;: ( l ~ r i ? i o ! ~ ~  1 ) ~  t!l? !);l~ty C O I I C C ~ ' I I ; L ~  01 ?!.:h 
niiic::. ;:s nlab :,pp:;i:~(:.r! i l l  tilis hcllzl1 :>y tkr: Slatr: (;,)vcrnn!cili, by t i i f  

<:I::. f juris: r;t' t!ic s a id  CO:li t of 51;1:!11 Gal: -k .s  or b; :~:-h .lurI:!;. ot 1l:ai Cr)!::t 
tr> til:: Cl~ict' J:ldqc sh;:ll :,p!~c?int c i t h  r ;jc!i<:-::lly 0:. t.;::ci:~!I: ill hehnlf.". 

~ ~ 1 t l : ~ l l ~ I  1,W:lt 

1):- s [ > r + i ,  5 5. In  scc!i:lri 5 of 1l.r ;~rir!ciprrl Act. - 

wr I J , * l j l .  

""~' 1 C I ~ .  ' i f  i i )  ::;icr <:IF>- , cc l iui~ ; ? ) ,  f:>!!::?lvi!lg s~~h-!:cctio:~ ~ l l ~ i ! !  LIC i r ~ s t ~ ~ ~ : ~ I .  ~ ~ a ~ i e l j y  

i I s~: l ) -s t .c : ic~~~ (4)-  t l l l  f ~ 1 I o . 1  suh-scctio:~ shall he i ~ ~ ~ e r ! c c i .  
na r l~c ly  : 



-<' 

., Extra No. 16 REZmRF? No. G - 4 1  

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY 

Vol. VII MONDAY, MAY 17, ~~BS/VIITSAKHA 27, 1887 

PART fV 
Acts of the Gojarat Legislature and Ordiosnees promulgated 

and Regulations made by the Governor, 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented to by the 
Governor on the 15th May 1965 is hereby published for general inforn~ation. 

SUMANT M. VIDYARTHI, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legal Department. 

GUJARAT A(3T NO. 15 OR 1965. 

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor ir. the 
"Glriarnt Governmetzt ~azelfe" on the 17th May 1965,) 

At1 Act further to amend the Bombay Court-fws Act, 1959 for certain prqmses. 

It is hereby enazted in the Sixteenth Year of the Republic of hdia as follows : - 
1. (I) This Act may be called the Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendment) short +J& 

Act, 1965, and oommm- 
/ oement. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by 
notification in the Oflcial Gazeiie, appoint, 

2. In Schedule I to the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959, 
i b d ' m n 6  
of HQhdnle 
X t o h m  [a) in Article 1, in column 2, at the end the following sban be added, x m  d f  

namely : - IW@. 



44 GUJ. GOVT. GAZ., EX., MAy 17, lBGJ/VAISAKHX 27, 1887 PART Iv 
, 

"Provided that the maximum fee leviable on a plaint or memorandum ol 
appeal or of cross-objection shall be fifteen thousand rupees."; 

(b) in the Table of rates of ad valorem fees leviable on the institution of suits,- 

(9 for the words, letters and figures "and at the rate of Rs. 100 for every 
Rs. 10,000 or part thereof, over Rs. 1,00,000 for example:-" the following 
shall be substituted, namely : - 

"and, over Rs. 1,00,000, at the rate of Rs. 100 for every Rs. 10,000 or 
part thereof, upto a maximum of Rs. 15,000, for example : -"; 

(ig for the last three entries, namely:- 

" 13,00,000 15,300-00 

the following shall be substituted, namely : - 
" 12,70,000 15,000-00". 
or more 



Extra No. 13 REGISTERED No. LII5O)GNR/l 

EXTRAORDINARY 

Vol. XVIII] .1I115D SESDAY, JULY 13, 19771XSADHA 2-2, 1899 
- -.- - - - 

Separate paging is given to tht Part in order that it may 
be filed as a separate cornpila~on. 

PART IV 
Acts of the Gujarat LegisIature and Ordinances promulgafed and 

Regulations made by the Gevemor. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having beell asserltcd to by the 
Governor on the 6th July, 1977 is hereby published for general information. 

S. L. 'I'ALATI, 
Secretary to the Governnlent of Gujarat, 

1.egal Depiirtment. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 9 OF 1977. 

(First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the 
"Gujarat Government Gazettee" on i hc 13th July, 1977). 

An Act further to amend the Bombay Court-fees .Act, 1959. 

T t  is h c r r l ~ ~  e~lactecl in  Ihr Tn-cnty-right h Yrnr of thc Repul~lic of India as 
follo\vs:- . 

1. This Act, may bc callcrl t,lle Bombn y Court- fwr; (Chjamt Amendment) Act, Short title. - 

1977. 

2, I u  the Bombay Court-fees Act. 1959, scction 37 s1i:ill bc r~-i~umbercrl as sub- Amendment 
sectiorl ( I )  of that section t u ~ d  nfter snh-srdion ( I )  as  so rcnui~hcrrd, thc following of seotion 37 

of Born. sub-sections shall bc inserted, nsnlely :- XXX- of 
1960. 

"(2) Notwithstanding anything contained ~ I I  sub-section (I), where,- 
(a) the Statc Govcrr~inc~~t,, in rclst,ion to any area in the State, or 
(6) thc Collector, in relation to any rut:n, in the district ur~der his charge, 

GO 
IV-Extra-18 



67 GUJ. GOVT. GAZ., EX,, JULY 13, 19771ASADE.4 22, 1809 [PART IV 

is satisfied that on accouut of temporary shortage of stamps in any area, fee 
. cannot be paid, and payment of fco cannot bo indicated on dooument.~, by means 
of stamps, the State Government, or as the case may be, the Collector may, by noti- 
fication in the Officiul Gazelle, direct that in such area and for such pcriod as IIlRy be 
specified in such notification, the fee imy bo paid in cash in any Govcr~lmellt trca- 
sury or sub-treasury, and-tho officer-in-charge of such treasury or sub-treasury 
shall, on production of a ch l la?~  evidencing payment of fee in such treasury or sub- 
treasury, certify such payment by endorsomefit on the documont in respect of which 
foe has been so ptaid, and st.ate in the said ondordomont the amount of the fee so paid. 

(3) An endorsement made on any documcnt under sub-section (2) shall have 
the sarnc effoct a3 if the fee of an amount oqual to  the amount dated in the en- 
dorsemont had been paid in respect of, and such payment had becil i~:clic:itcd 
on, such doournent by means of sta~nps under sub-sectioll (I).". 

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENI CENIRAL PRESS, GANDIILNACARI 



Extra No. 13 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED iriY AUT:~I#Z:'~!TY 

. - -. - - - . . -- 001. XKX-TIJ SATURDAY, JULY 29, 19951SRAVANA 7, 1917 
--- 

~ p l L I h d v & t o ~ ~ ~ h r ~ , ~ ~  
m y  le ilkd as a sepamte e o m t b a  - - . - - - - - - .  -- -- -- -- - 

- The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented to by the 
Governor on the 29th July, 1995 is he~eby published for general information. 

#UM. H. K JFL4VER1, 
Secretary to tbe Govcrnmenl of Gujarat, 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Departlnent. . 
GUJARAT ACT NO. 12 OF 1995, 

( First published after having received the assent o f  the Governor in the Gujarat 
Government Gazerre on lbe 29lh July, 1995 ), 

N ACT 

further to amend the Bombay Court-fces Act, 1959. 

It is  hereby enackd in the Forty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as 
follows :- 

I. (1) This Act may be called the Bombay Court-fees (Gujarat Amendment) 
Short title 

Act, 1995. and commence- ment. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the Slate Government may, by 
notification in the Oficial Gazette: appoint. 

B 0 m . 2. In the Bombay Court-fees Act, 1959 (bereinafter referred to asMthe principal Amendmmt of 
XXXV[ Act"), in section 6, in cluase (iv), in sub-clause (i), for the words "thirty rupecs", section 6 of 
of 1959 the words "two hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

Born. XXXVI  
of 1959. 

3. In the principal Act, in Schedule I,- 

(1) for Article 1, the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

Amendment of 
Schedule 1 to 

Born. X X X V I  
01 1959. 



GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995 
[ PART IV 

-_- ---------*-*+*------"**-----**--*------------"-*-------------------------"*-*----------*--* 

1 2 3 
~ _ _ _ - C _ - - - ~ ~ ~ ~ - * * - * - - * - - + * - ~ * - - - - - - - - - - - - " - - - - " " - - - - - - - - - - - - " * - - * - - - - - - - - - - - - - ~ - ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ ~ * ~ ~ ~ ~ b ~ ~ ~  

"I. Plaint or memorandum As per rate specified in 
of appeal (not other- the Table annexed at the 
wise provided for - end of this ~chedulo."; * 

in this Act) or of cross 
objection presented 
to any Civil or Revenue 
Court. 

(2) in Article 15, in column 3, for the words "fifteen rupees", the words "fifty 
rupees" shall be substituted; 

(3) in Article 16, in column 3, for the words "fifty rupees", the words "two 
hundred rupeest1 shall be substituted; 

- (4) in Article 17, in column 3, for the words "fifty rupees", the wards "two 
hundred rupees" shall be substituted; 

(5 )  for the existing Table appearing a f k r  Article 17, the followjng shalI be 
substituted, namely :- 

TABLE 
(See Article 1 of ScheduIe 1) 

Table of rates of ad valorent fees leviable on institution of suits, etc. 
--- - - - - - - - - -"*--***+- . -d.<+h---- - - - - - - - -+--- -+--- -*- - - - - - - - - - -"-- -*+-*-"- . - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -  

When the amount or But does not Proper court 
value of tbe subject exceed fee. 
matter in dispute 
exceeds 

(1) (2 )  (31 

Rs. Rs. Rs. 

2.55% On claim amount, 
1135 
1170 
1205 
1240 
1275 
1310 
1345 
1380 
1415 
1450 
1495 

' 1540 
1585 
1630 
1675 
1720 
1765 
1810 
1855 
1900 



PART IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 29-7-1995 113-3 

so,aoo 
32,000 
34,000 ' 

36,000 
38,000 
40,000 
42,000 
44,000 
4 6,000 
48,000 
5o,oM3 
55,000 
60,000 
65,000 
70,000 
75,000 
80,000 
85,000 
90,000 
95,000 
1 lakb 
2 lakhs 
3 lakbs 
4 lakhs 
5 lakhs 
6 Iakhs 
7 l a a s  
8 lakhs 
Y lakhs 
10 lakhs 
Il lakhs 
12 lakhs 
13 lakhs 
14 lakhs 
15 lakhs 
16 lakhs 
f 7 lakhs 
18 lakbs 
19 lakbs 
20 lakhs 
21 lakhs 
22 la khs 
23 lakhs 
24 lakhs 
25 lakhs 
26 lakhs 
27 lakhs 
28 lakhs 
29 la khs 
30 lakhs 
31 lakhs 
32 lakhs 
33 lakhs 
34 lakhs 
35 lakhs 

32,000 
34,000 
36,000 
38,000 
40,000 
42,000 
44,000 
46,000 
48,000 
50,000 
55,000 
60,000 
65,000 
70,000 
75,000 
80,000 
85,000 
90,000 
95,000 

1,00,000 
2 lakhs 
3 Iakhs 
4 Lakhs 
5 lskhs 
6 IakSts 
7 lakhs 
8 iakhs 
9 lakhs 
10 lakhs 
11 lakhs 
12 lakhs 
13 lakhs 
14 lakhs 
15 la!& 
16 lakhs 
17 iakhs 
18 lrtkhs 
19 lakhs 
20 lakhs 
21 lakhs 
22 lakhs 
23 lakhs 
24 lakhs 
25 lakhs 
26 lakhs 
27 lakhs 
28 lakhs 
29 1akhs 
30 lakhs 
31 lakhs 
32 lakhs 
33 lakhs 
34 lakhs 
35 lakhs . 
36 lams 



GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETIT, EX., 29-7- 1995 

36 lakhs 
37 lam 
38 Iakhs 
39 Iakhs 
40 lam 
41 Iakhs 
42 lam 
43 Iskhs 
44 lakhs 
45 lakhs 
46 lakhs 
47 lakhs 
48 lakhs 
49 lakhs 
50 l a b  
51 l a b  
52 iakhs 
53 Iakhs 
54 iakhs 
55 lakhs 
56 Iakhs 
57 l a b  
58 Iakhs 
59 lakhs 
60 lakhs 
6 1  lakhs 
62 lakhs 
63 lakhs 
64 lakhs 
65 l a k h  
66 lakhs 
67 lakhs 
68 Iakhs 
69 lakhs 
70 lakhs 
71 lakhs 
72 lakhs 
73 lakhs 
74 lakhs 
75 lakhs 
76 lakbs. 
77 Iakhs 
78 Iakhs 
79 lakhs 
80 lakbs 
81 lakhs 
82 iakhs 
83 lakhs 
84 lakhs 
85 lakhs 
86 lakhs 
87 lakbs 
88 lakhs 
89 Iakhs 
90 lakhs 

37 lalchs 
38 lakhs 
39 lakhs 
40 lakhs 
41 lakhs 
42 lakhs 
43 lakbs 
44 lakbs 
45 lakhs 
46 Iakhs 
47 lakhs 
48 lakbs 
49 lakhs 
50 lakbs 
51 lakhs 
52 labs 
53 Iakhs 
54 lakhs 
55 lakbs 
56 lakbs 
57 lakbs 
58 lakhs 
59 lakhs 
60 Iakhs 
61 Iakhs 
62 Iakhs 
63 jabs 
64 labs 
65 lakhs 
66 lakhs 
67 laus 
68 lakbs 
69 lakhs 
70 l a b s  
71 lakhs 
72 lakbs 
73 lakhs 
74 lakhs 
75 lakhs 
76 lakhs 
77 Iakhs 
78 lakhs 
79 Iakhs 
80 lakhs 
81 labs 
82 lakhs 
83 lakbs 
84 lakhs 
85 laws 
86 lakhs 
87 lakhs 
88 lakbs 
89 lakhs 
90 iakhs 
91 lakhs 

PART IV 



PART IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE,-EX., 29-7-1995 

91 l a b  
92 lakhs 
93 l a b  
94 fa!& 
95 1akhs 
96 lakhs 
97 lakhs 
98 lakbs 
99 lakhs 

92 1akhs 
93 lakhs 
94 lakhs 
95 lam 
96 lakbs 
97 lakhs 
98 lakhs 
99 l a k b  

One crore 

___l__l_r._________-*---------.----------------~.----.--------*-*-*m-----d*-----*-.--*--.--.---- 

and thereafter the court fees shall be increased at the rate of rupees two tbomand 
for-every additional one lakh rupees or part tbcreof. 

4, in the principal Act, in the schedule 11,- 

(1) in Article 1, in column 3,- 

(a) for the words "Twenty naye paise", the words "Onc rupee" shall be 
substituted; 

@) for thc u~ords "Thirty-five nayc paise". the words "Onc rupee" shall be 
substituted; 

(c) for the words "Sixty-five naye paise", the words ''Two rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(d) for the \$*nrds "One rilpee", the words "Fivc rupees" sha!l be substituted: 

(e) for the words "Two rupees fiily nave paise", the words "Five rupecs" 
shall be substituted; 

(f) for the words "Fifty rupecs", the words "Five hundrcd rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(g) for the words "Twenty rupees", the words "Two hundred rupees" shall 
be subs~ituted; 

(h) for the words "Five rupecs", the words "Fifty rupees" shall be substituted; 

(2) in Article 2, in column 3, for the wurds "Ten rupees", the words "Fifty rupecs" 
shall bc substituted; 

(3) in Article 3, in column 3, for the words "Two rupees", the words "Fivc rupees" 
shall be substituted; 

(4) in Article 4, in column 3, for the words "Fifty naye paise", the words "One 
rupee" shall be substituted; 

Amendment of 
Schedule I I  to 

Born. X X X V I  
of  1959. 

(5) - in Article 7, in column 3, for the words "One rupee", the words "Five rupees" 
shall be substituted; 



GUJARAT GOVERNMENT G A Z E m ,  EX., 29- 7- 1995 [ PART IV 

v of (6)inArticle9,- 
1898. 
2 o f  (a) in column 1, for the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure, 
1974. 1898", the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure, 1973" shall be 

substituted; 

(b) in column 3, for the words "One rupee twenty-five naye paise", the words 
"Two rupees" shall be substituted. 

(7) in Article 1.0, in column 3, for the words "Twenty-five naye paise", the words 
"One rupee" shall be substituted; 

(8) in Article t 1, in column 3, far the words "One rupee twenty- five naye paise", 
the words "Three rupees" shall be substituted; 

(9) in Article 12, in column 3,-- 

(a) for the words "One rupee", the words "Tw3 rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) for the words "Two rupees", the words "Three rupees" shall be sub- 
stituted; 

(c) for the words "Four rupees", the words "Five rupees" shall be substituted; 

(10) in Article 13, in column 3,-- 

(a) for the words "One rupee'', ihe words ''Two rupees" sball be subslililtcd; 

(b) for the words "Two rupees and fifty naye pisc": rhe words '"Ten rupecs" 
shall be substitutcd; 

(c) for the words "Five rupe-es", the wnrds "Fifteen rupees" shall be sub- 
sti tutcd; 

(11) in Article 14: in column 3,- 

(a) for the words "Ten rupees", the words "Twenty rupees" shall bc sub- 
stituted; 

(b) for the words "Twelve rupees fifty nay c paise", the words ''Fifty rupees" 
shall be substituted; 

(12) in Article 15, in column 3, for the words "Fifty naye  paise", the words "One 
rupeet1 shall be substituted; 

(1 3) in Article 16, in column 3,"- 

(a) for the words "Five rupees", the words "Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 
(b) for the words "One rupee", the words "Five rupees"shal1 be substituted; 

(14) in Article 17, in column 3, for the words "Thirty-seven rupees fifv nay e paise", 
the words "Fifty rupees" shall be substituted; 

(IS) in Article 18, in column 3,-- 

(a) for the words "Fifteen rupees", h e  words "Fifty rupeesMshalI be sub- 
stituted; 





GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZElTE, EX., 29-7-1995 [PART IV 

(26) in Article 30, in column 3, for the words "One rupee", the words "Two rupees" 
shall be substituted; 

(27) in Article 31, in column 3, for the words "One rupee", the words "Two rupees" 
shal! be substituted; 

(28) in Article 32;- 

I V  of (a) in column 1, for the words, letters and figures "Chapter IV of the Motor 
1939. Vehicles Act, 1939" the words, letter and figures "Chapter V of the Motor 
59 of Vehicles Act, 1988" sttat1 be substituted: 
1988. 

(b) in column 3, for the words "Five rupees", the words "Ten rupees" shall 
be substituted; 

(29) in Article 33,-- 

(a) in column I, the brackets and words "(of Ahmedabad)" shall be deleted; 

(b) in column 3,-- 

(i) for the wards "Ten rupees", the words "Fifty rupees" shall be substituted; 

(ii) for the words "Fifiy rupees", the words "One hundred rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(iii) for the words "One hundrcd rupees", the words "Five hundred rupees" 
shall be substituted; 

(30) in Articie 34, in column 3,- 

(a) for the words "Fifty rupees", the words "One hundred rupees" shall bc 
substituted; 

(b) for the words "Tcn rupees", the words "Twenty rupees" shall be sub- 
stituted; 

(31) in Article 35, in column 3,-- 

(a) for the words "Two rupees fifty nayc paise" occuring at two places, the 
wards "Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 

(b) for the words "Five rupees", the words "Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 

(c) for the words "One rupee", the words "Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 

(32) in Article 36, in culurnn 3, for the words "Five rupees", the words "Twenty 
rupees" shall be substituted; 

(33) in Article 37,- 1 

(a) in column 1, for the words and figures "Code of Criminal Procedure v ~ f 1 8 9 8 -  

Cade, 1898", the words and figures "Criminal Procedure Code, 1973n shall 2 of 1974. 

be substituted; 

@) in column 3, for the words "One rupee", the words "Ten rupees" shall be 
substituted; 



\r 

(34) after Article 38, the following new Article shafl be added, namely :- 
___***r--*------__---d----*--------*---*+--**-----------------*----------d--*----***------------ 

1 2 3 
r*-*-----"-.--*--------------d-**+-.--------------+*--*---------d---w"--"----------d-----+---**- 

"39. Application for adjournment .. Five rupees". 
presented to the Court in any 
proceedings. 
" _ - _ - _ - _ - - - - - - - - - * _ - - * - . - - - - - - - - - ~ - - - - * - * - - ~ - - - - - - - - - - - - - - w - - - - - - - - - - - - - - + - - + - + * - - - - - - - - - - - - - - - -  

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PKESS, GANDHINAGAK. 







Extra No. 19 Ir:F;GISTERED NO. G I G W i  

PUBLISHED BY AUTEIO- 

Vol. XLJVl MONDAY, Ik@XRCq 31, 20 

~ , p . & p & ' ~ ( o i h i . ~ i . o r d e . m o t i t  + 
may bi hled as a Sepamte' CompilatIoa. 

PART.- IV . , 

Acts of the  har rat Legislature and 0d-a promulgated 
and Regulations made by the Goveyoor:. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented 
to by the Governor on the 2gth   arch, 2003 is hereby published for 
general information. 

V. M. KOTHARE, 
Secretaly to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Depaltment. 

/ -  &JAW ACT NO. 18 OF 2M)3! . 

(First published, awr having received the assent of the Governor in 
the "~ujamf Government Gazette: on the 31" March, 2003). 

AN ACT 
. .. - I . -  r 

further to amend the Bombay Court - fees Act, 1959. > ' 
- 

* - -1 ' . 

- I t  is he&y: in Fifty-fourth Year of the Rrpublic of India 
. L a s f o W : ~  ! . . I  %, 

1. (1) This Act be called the Bombay Court-* (Gyarat s r r t a a o 4  
Amendment) Act, 2003. c m w ~  

(2) It shall comc into force on such date ss the State Govehnent may, 
by mtiiication in the mid Gazette, sppoint. 



. (a). . in nibclause (a), fq& wrd~* m,-h, .b-wordr w, 
. r-n-sm be . . , - 

., - . . - . .  . , . . , . 

-. - - .  . . - 

(iij in the ~n,-, for &.words fiftan mpeests, the words . 
"thirtyrup&"'bedstitut&' 

. . .. ' 1 

fc) , in sub-&use (e), f& tbe e x M q  Tab14 the fibwing Table shall 
be mbslhted, ?lamely .:- 

AREA 
(1) 

(a) The m a  within the limits of One founb of the advalorem fee 
tha Municipal Cowtation ieviabIc fof p guit f0pmssion of 

. . 
. the Servient tenement or the 
dominant fenement, whichever is 
less subject to a minimum fee of 
RSJ 301- ; 

(b) Area within fie Limits of the One-sixth of the ad valorem fee 
Municipality leviable for a suit for pogsession of 

t b e s e r v i e n t w o r t h e  . 
dmhmt tmcment, whichever is 
-1- mb$mt.to q.&imum fse of 
tfdaynrpets* . . . ; .L I 

- ,  , . , - ,  
. .. - - .  . .  , .  i ! . . L l  - . -... :- 

' (a) , insuaclause@,-,- ,.:.,-!.-. - .  -., . '  - <  .!.' ;, 2.L . . .  . - .  . - .  
.I - . 

; a .  , . 
. 'n 



PART GU JARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1 -3 -2003 - 19-3 
1 ' .  

J .  - , - -  - '  - '  .,... . - - ' . - -  . . 
. . . . . .  +-  . A,: - .  -. ,. 

, - -  . . 

(@ 'in the prOi&b, for t& ":fifty mpd"'~the words "one hundred 
~ ~ ~ s ~ b e s l $ s t i t u t e d ; - . : -  , , - . .  

.. ' . . >  '1 . . . . :, . , 

For avoidance of 
sak, COllfirCt for 
sale ctc. 

For avoMan# of 
acquisition 
proceodlaga. 

'*(ha) m W kf dec l i ibn  that any sale or contract for sde or 
t m t i o n  of thh &W f& &, of any moveable or hoveab le  
property is void - one W o f  td valorem fee Ieviable on the vdue of 
the p m m ;  , I .  

@b), In-suits for declaration that any promdings for compulsory 
acquisition of arry moveable or immovable property are void - one 
half of ad valorem fee leviable on the value of the property ;"; 

( f )  in sub-clause (i), for the wbrds Ywenty rupees", the words "one 
hundred rupeet! s M  be substitutqd; 

(g) in subclause Cj) , for the words ''tbky rupees", the words "one 
hundred rupees" shall be substituted; 

(2) in clause (v), 

(a) in sub-clause (a), fdr-the words "elve and a haif time?'' , the words . 
" twenty times" MI be substituted., 

(b) in sub-clause (b), for the words, ''twenty times" , the words " forty 
times " shail be substituted; 

(c) in sub-clausi (6 ) , f& the words 'kenty timesM, the words cLforty 
times" shall be'substituted; 

(3) in clause (vki), for the &ls~'' fifteen times", the words %thirty 
times" shall be substihted. 

3. htheprhcipalAct,inSc~I,- ~ m e m d ~ a t  of 
I Schsdak 1 C 

BmLXlEXYIof 
(1) for Article I, the following shaIl be substituted, namely:- 1959. 



194 WJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1-3-2003 WT IV 
I.. .- .-. . . . . _. -. _. . _ _ - - - - A -  --_ _ -- . .-- -- . - . ,  . - --.- . . 

. , -  . ' 

. , - I.. . -  
. . 

~ m a t y .  
in:.?gup&L - - 

- ' :  

.. 

;. - :. - .  
, , . . 

, ' . .- . , .  - 

w n r p c e s  - , 

: . ' . -  

, 

. . 
. 

. 

, - . 
.-'< 

t .-: 
. , .. . . 

. 

. 

- .  , . 

. . 

clmo-mviw 
.me ;:<a@a: .- - 

, . -diapdo,!!,.;i --:. , . '. . -  r . , - . A '  ! 

~ e s n d ~ A o a e  :, . 

'M-' . :..:2,.z :.: 
, . . . . - 

* . . . a  h . . . .  
'--'suoh Q * 

- 

4. 
. , . I .  - -  . 

- - 

. 

- . - 

. -  

-Iw==; . ' 

. , 

~ ~ a i n t a m e m d  
ofspDOal4*; . .  
&&q,&d&to; 
emis~ct)g,.~f~oss 
- . @ ~ ; ~ ; m . '  . . 
anyCivilotRnuerme' 
COWL . . , '  , 

. -  ; , .  

-.' - 

. - 1 ,  

. 

- 3 -  . 

- 

. 

.;- " 
, 

- 

. 
- 

. :-, - 1 . -  - . . ; 
" '  , '.. . .. : . ' ' - '  . , , -  . . 

+ . . - . 
, : - .  

' . .  
1. , 

,,i ,. + - ' . - - *. - :. , 

. I , .  . , . . 
, .- . . 

- . , . . . 

- ' 

, . .  - - .  
, - .  

. , . . 

- 4 
: , . . .  .: - - ... 

: -  

, . I  

. - l i  . 

- - 

. , , ; -. . , , - 
, - : ; . .  , 

,, - . C '  

. . . . - - - -  
, . - , .  

..../-:*,-.-, 
:fQFcq.tmm*m 

..:":t8aqe2~sxoessof.onc ; < 

h a n r p k s ,  uptom;, - 

h d n i p c e s *  .- 
- . .  
, - : ,  . I '  ., . . - . .  . . 

, . . . : ~ ~  m m t *  value: 
. .  ex&sone.lhwMi <.! - .  

rupes,fmeveryhumhd 
~ ~ ~ ~ 0 r p w t ~ i n . -  
.ex&.ofoa~*~d . '.: 

nrpeesuptom-, 
v: ' , -  - - .  
.. - - . . .  . 

, , . - .  .&en& amount or value 
e x c d s t e n t h o d  
m p q  for eveq one 
w m d W m , ' ~ p a r t  -: ' 

thews h&xaWoffm ; 
-rupeesupto 
owiakh@ffnlperes.- - 

. -  - -, - 

.~hensuchamountgrval~ 
e x ~ ~ n e l a k b ~ f r u p e w , ~  
f o r e v e a y t m ~ . .  . 

, n r p e e s , o r p a r t ~ ~ i n  
a - ~ - o f g n e h k h ~ :  , . - 

.j . -,. ~ : ~ c : ~ . .  ;--' 

MdedW-tkd- .  - .  

: 
. - , - , - 

.,. 

Xweqtyrqm 

- - 
. . 

. ,  - 

+ 

One hundred , 

twe~tyrupees 

, .  

~wohUndred 
rupees,. 

. . 

. - 

mipnfeeItviab1eon'the 
p4imormmronodumof 
rppeat,orofcrosso@~m 
& g l , b . ~ h  :- - .  - : 

. . 

. . 

- . .  

. 



PART IV] GUlkRAT G O m M E N T  GAZE'I'TE, EX., 3 1-3-2003 19-5 
'I 

"1Ih Probate qf a wi11 or ' -When the amount or vahe 
.oflhe property in respect ' 

bk$ich the grant of 
pmbpte or letters is made 

1 

., ::&;: r ,.: . 
' exceeds one thousand, 

. . ., I ' 
I>' . .. +,on the pact ofthe 

, . .  , . . . '&oynt or vdue in excess . . ,  . . 
? . : * - v - , '  , 

': &f &e t b a m d  nips ,  
' - . A ,  

-. upt6 i B y  thousand rupees. 

, 1 .  
. "Hthentbeamountorvslue . . . I 

of die pmpaty in r q m t  
of which the pant of 

. . .  , pbate  or letters is made 
nx* ptY *P-d 
rupees, on tbe parl of the 

. , .. > 
amount or vdw in excess 

. , of,fi$y t h o e d  lupees, 
upto two l&s rupees. 

' .  . . r . : I '  .. . . .  . 
-_ r when the mount or, value 

of the properly in respect 
of which &e grant of 
probate ur letten is made 
exceeds two I& m p s ,  on 

I . . the part ofthe amount or 
value in excess of two 
lakbs rupees, ~ $ 0  three 

> '  ' I 

' . - f . lakbs ofrupees, 
, < .. . . 

% - When the amouot or vdue 
of the p p e Q  in re- of 
which tbc grant of probate, 

L - . ,  . or letters is mdc e x a d s  

three lakhs npm, on the 
., part of the amomt or value 

in excess of three 1ak-h of 

I 
' *  nrpees: 



19-6 G U J M  GO=-NT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1-3-2003 ~ A R T ~ v  . 
. . 

< -  - . 
: tirnebeinginKmcc,in 

rrspddofaqypmm. 
iwItuIedingkbtqa 
g r a m t o f ~ c l r l ~ b f  

. m  4 m u s W o n i s d i n  
~ o f t b e s a m s ~ ,  
thefkp@lc intespectof 
lam-Wbered@ 
by the amount of the fee 
p@in mpea of the 

* formergraot;". 

(3) h ~ d e I 3 , h c o ~ ~ 3 , - ~ t h e w o r d s ' ~ ~ ~ ,  thewords" 
sixty ~ ' '  d@l be suMtirted; 

(4) in M c l e  15, in a l u m  3, for ihe words ''fdken nrpees7', the words 
' ' tmy rupees" sbsll be subst iw,  

( 5 )  in M c l e  16, in coiu~ll 3, for the words "fifty rupees", the words 
"one hmdxed rupees1' shall be substitut& 

(6) in Article 17, in column 3, for the words "fifty nrpees'' , the words 
"one hu4dred'rtpxs" sMl be substiMed; 

(7) for the existing Table appearing af&r ArticIe 17, the fallowing shdl 
be substitrrted, namely :; 

"Table of rates of ad3aIorem fees leviable on the institution of suits. 

When the amoint But does Proper fee 
of value of die ' not n eitceed + 

subject m a 6  &&,' ,"' ,, 

< . , I  



' 

1MlOO - . 150r30 ' .- , 1250 
35000 - .  ,. 20000 I .  

>" ' 
1500 

20000 21000 ' . V  1525 
21000 -. 22000 .. * 1600 
22800 * 23000 $:A 1675 
23000 ' - -  24000 ::.:. 1750 
24000 25000 1825 
25000 L '  , 2 6 m  ' I . ,  * I!m 
26000 t ' .  . 27000 " 1975 
27000 " : 28000 2050 
28000 29000 2225 
2mo . 30000 : 7  ' 

- I 

2200 
30000 . . ..- ' - +  32000 .I ,, I . 2575 
32000 ' - ' -  - 34000 a : 2500 
34000' .. 36000 -: 2650 

,36000 ' 38000 A 2800 
3 8000 40000 2950 
40000 42000 3 130 
42000 44000 3250 
44000 ' 46000' ' 3400 . , 

46000 48000 3550 > .  

48000 50000 3700 
50000 55000 4000 

. 's'jo()(j & . m ' 4300 
6000 65000 - - 4600 
65000 70000 4900 

1 7W30 75008' 52M 

and the fees increases at the rate of Rs. 150 for every Rs.5;000, or p a t  , 

themf,'upto' Rs:1;00;000 and oirer ~s::1,00,0(j0 at Yhe rates of Rs. 200 for 
every rupees 10,000 or part thereof, up&. Zis.l@,oO,OUO and over Rs. 
10,00,000 at the rate of Rs. 1,200 for every Rs.1,00,000 or part thereof, 
$to w20,00,000' a& :over Rs. 209Q0;000 at the frtte of Rs.500 for every 
Rs. 1,00,000 or psrt thereof, upto a maximum fee of Rs.79,000, for example 



19-8 G U J W  GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1-3-2003 [PART IV 
- .-. . - -. 

700000 17950 
800000 ' 1WO 
m . . 21950 
1- 23950 
IIm ,25150 .. 
1200000 28350 
1300000 27550 
1400000 28750 
1500000 4.  29950 
1600000 . - 31150 : 

1700000 32350 .. 

t8OOOOO 33550 
1900000 34750 
2000000 35950 
2100000 36450 
2200000 36950" 

Amendment of - 4. 
Sehsdsrlsnto . 
Born. XXXVI of 
1959. (1) 

, Id) 
I . ?  

. . 

In the principd Act, in Schedule II , - 
in Article I, in column 3 , - 
for the words " ~wenty &w paise", the words'" Ten rupees" shall 
be substituted; 

for the words Thirty - five  ye poise ", the wo&"~en rupees" 
shall be substiw; 

for the words *Sixty- five yve paire " , the words T m t y  rupees" 
W b e ~ W ;  . . + .  . I  

for the Grds y ~ n e  rupee'', the wo& -" ~ i f t ) c  'kpesw shail be 
substiw, : ' .  . 

(e) for the words " Two rupees fifty naye paise" , the words "One 
hwrdred npcs'' &dl be substituted; 

, . . .' 

(t) for the words " Fifty rupeess1, the . words . ;~lle h u d d  -" 
W&*; 

for the wonh m t y  m@"' the words *Fifty w'' shall be 
substitut& 

* 

@) for the wo&ny~ive ripsn, ~h words:'%* mn shall be 



PART IVI G U J W  GOVERNME'NTT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1 -3 -2003 19-9 

, , 

2 in Article 2, in column 3, for the words " Ten rupees", the words , 

"Fifty rqxx~'~ shall bk substituted; . 

(31, in Article 3 ,  in column 3 , for the words "Two rupees", the words 
"Five rupees" shall bb substituted; 

(4) in Article 4, in column 3, for the words "Fifty ~ y e  paise", the 
words "Two hpees" shall be sub,stituted;. 

(5)  in Article 5 , in c o b  3 , for the words "One rupee",. the words " 
Five rupees" shall be substituted; 

(6 )  in Artide 6, in c o I m -  3 , - 

(a) for the words "Two rupees", the words "Ten rupees" shall be 
substituted; -- 

-1 

@) for the words "Five rupees", the words "Twenty rupees" shall be 
substituted; 

(7) in APticle 7, in column 3 , for the words " One rupee", the words 
"Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 

(8) in Article 8, in column 3, for the words " Onc rupee", the words 
~ W A ,  , ,,, ,+ees" , shd! be scbg!i~~ted; 

(9) In Aicle 9, in column 3, for the words "One rupee WenQ -five 
nuye paise", the words "Five rupees"shall.be substituted; 

00) .in Article 1 0, in column 3 ;for the words "Twenty -five naye paise", 
the words T w o  r u p i "  shalLbe substitue, 

(1 1) in Article II, in column 3, for the words "One rupee twenty-five 
naye paise" , the words "Five rupeesn shall be substituted; . 

. . . .  

(12) in Artide 12, in column 3 , r 

(a) for' the words, " Ona rtqke", the WO& "Two rupees" shall be 
s u b s t i w ,  . . . , 

% ($1 for 6 wads " Two rupk", the words "ThW rupees " shall be 
suww, . . 

(c) for the words 'Tow rupes" , the words "Five r b p s "  shall be 
substiw; 



PART GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1-3-2003 14+lO 
- ' -. ,- J 

(13) hArti~fR 13, inc0I~mfl3 , -  
. .  . 

(a) forthewords'"Onempeen,, t h e w d " T w 0 ~ " s h a l l b e  
Subitituted; 

(b) for the words Two ~upees fifty ~ ) l e  paiseq, & words "Five 
rupees" shalI be substituted; 

(c) for the words "Five rupees", the words "Ten mpq' '  shall be 
substituted; 

(14) in Article 14, in column 3 , - 

(a) for the words "Ten rupees" , the words "Twenty rupees"shal1 be 
' 

substituted, 

@) for the words "Twelve rupees fifty Mye paise" , the words "Fifty 
rupeesy' shall be substituted; 

(1 5)  in Article 15, in column 3 ,  for the words "Fifty mye paise" , the 
words "Five rupees" shall be substituted; 

(1 6 )  h' Article 16, in column 3 , - 

(a) for the words " Five rupees", : the words "Ten rupees" shall be 
" . .LA:L.A~~ .  
3UUDULUtFN) 

(b) for -the words "One rupee", the wore " Five npees" shall be 
substituted, ' 

(17) in Article 17, in column 3, for the words 'Thirty -seven rupees fifty 
w e  paise", the words "Fifty v ' t  &d be substiwed., 

(a) for the words "Fifteen mpea", the'words "One h&dred kpn 
shall be substi* 9 - *  . . - : , . .  - .  :.. 

(b) fur the words "Two  ye paisen,. ,the wofi " T ~ Y  
f i ~ ~ ' ' W b e S U b r r t i  



\q.r#M GUJARATGOV'ERNMENTGAZETTE,EX.,31-3-2003 [PART IV 

(d) for the words 'Twelve rupees fifty nqve poise", occ- at two 
places against items (c) and (d) , the words "One hundred rupew " 
shall be 8 u W ; -  . 3 .  . . ' 3  

(e) for the words 'Twelve rupees fitty ~ y e  paise" agaidst item (e), the 
words **Fiftjtmpees?' -$aii be sub&W; 

09) in Article 1 9, in column 3, for the words 'Twenty- five rupees", the 
words "Fifty rupees" sW1:be substituted; 

(20) in Article 20, in column 3 , for the words "Thirty-seven fifty we' 
paise", the words "Fifty rupees*' shall be . su?&W; , 

. ' ' .  

(21) in Article 21, in column 3 , for the words ' W y  -seven rupees fifty 
naye paise", the words "Fifty rupees "shall&e substituted; 

(22) in Article 22, in column 3, for the words " Two rupees", the words 
"Fifty rupees'' shall be substituted; 

(23) in Article 23, in column 3 ,- 

(a) for the words 'Thirty -seven mpees fiw naye paise" , occurring at 
four places, the words "Fifty rupees" shaH be substituted; 

@) for.the words "Eighteen rupees seventy- five naye poise" the words 
"F?:e~ty rt?pes" shd! hp subsiitutd, 

( c  f ~ r  the words "Thirt;.,ntpees", the ~ . o r d s  "One hundred rupees" shall 
? besubstituted; 

(24) in Article 24, in column 3, - 
. ' ., 

\ 

(a) for the words " One m p m ,  the words "Two rupees" shall be 
. -s&&&+.d; , 

@) for the words "Two rirpees", tbe words "Five nqxxis'' shall be . 

subs ti^; , , , ., 

(2Sj. in Ad& 25, in G O ~ M ~  3, - .f 

9 4 , I ,  

(a) for th words "Two rupd"' .the words "Five mps" shall be 
substi- 1 .  L ' 

& 

. fit@)' h r - t h e ' w t h a s ' T b e * ~ ,  b h t v a d s " T e n q n W b e  
3ubaMfa 



PART IV] GUJARAl" GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1-3 -2003 Iq-tE 

(c) for ;he words "Six &*v, l i e  words p& rUpes;$ shall be 
substiwed; 

I ' 

(26) in ~rticlk.26, in w1urrm.i .,,for thq wo& $:9ne rupee' twenty -five . . 

. . ~yepaise:'  , the words "Ten rupees" shall be substituted; 
'. . 

(27) in Article 27, in c o l h n  3, for the words "Sixty -five  ye paise", 
the words "Two rupees" shall be substituted; 
. . . .  , 

(28) in Article 28, in col- 3, for the words "Two ~pees",  t h ~  words 
"Ten rupees'' sball be substituted; 

1 

(29) in _M-icle 29, in column 3 , for the words " One rupee" , the words 
"Five rupees" shall be substituted; 

(30) in Micle 30 , in c&nm 3, for the words "one rupee" the words 
"Five rupees" shall be substituted; 

(31) in Article 31, in column 3 , for the words "One rupee", the words 
"Five rupees" shall be substituted; ' , . 

(32) in Article 32, in column 3, for the words " Five rupees", the words 
"Ten rupees'.' shall be substituted., 

(3 3) in Article 33,  - 

(a) in column 1, the words and brackets "(of Ahmedabad)" shall be 
- deleted; 

(b) in column 3, - 
- .  . . , . ... . . ,- 

, . J ,  . , - , . 

(i) for the words " Ten rupees", the words "Fifly.nrpees3' shall be 
substituted, 

.@for  the words. ':I&@ .rupees", the wards " One hundred 
rupees"shal1 be substituted; . . .  . - 

(iii) for ihe words " One hundred nrpees'f, the wprds "Five bpdred 
rupees" shall be substituted; 

. I 4 .  
. - 

I. . 
, I  

(34) in Xaicle 34, in column 3 , - I ,  , 

(a) for the words Ten mpd"' the words " Fifty m" ## bc . . 
s w d  



.- 
PART IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 3 1 -3 -2003 'rq - Cs - . 

- - 

. . < > . .  , I - - ,  - . h~tk: '.+;!!< ,; '>*;c;:>jr - ,:, : : b - ~ , : , ~ ~ ~  +. ;.$a>--, j : .  - - b  ; - , m i 4 -  -2 - , r i ; f i ' y i - , * . :  

(a) f?r the words "Two rupees fifty t q e  
, - . . .  -. . . / .  6 :- d Q ~ f l # e s  -! ,! !S 1 , 

the -words "Ten rupees" shall be substituted ; 

0) for the words " Five rupeesyy, the words " Ten rupees" shall 'be 
' \ -  ~ y ~ f U w $ ~ : +  , .  --.-*. #d ' . . ?&,,+ 

j:,.; . < < I , > .  !,-:.- , -.<; -..-- 
(3) ,;. . -.-?fg? the ,Wo~dq ..-l-... "Oqe - . . .  . imp*', the words - "Ten @&es: ,,mi be 

. sl;bstit;i&;. . -. . , !  , , ,  - ->A :!, *.--.Q.&5, 

- (36) in Article 36, in column 3, for the words "Five rupees", the words 
"Twenty rupees" shall be substituted, 

(37) in Article 37, in column 3, for the words "One rupee", the words 
'Twenty m p "  shall be substituted; 

(38) after Article 38, the followjng new Artide ghall be added, namely :- 

"39. Application for adjournment presented . . . . . . Two rupees. ". 
to the court in any proceedings 

Guj. 12 of 5. The Bombay Court-fees (Gujmt Amendment) Act, 1995 is hereby b p w l  
1995. repealed. 

Government Central Press, Gmdhioagar. 


	1961GUJARAT37.pdf
	Guj-1961-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-37.pdf
	Guj-1962-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-29.pdf
	Guj-1965-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-15.pdf
	Guj-1977-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-9.pdf
	Guj-1995-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-12.pdf
	Guj-1996-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Amending Act-4.pdf
	Guj-2003-The Bombay Court-Fees (Gujarat Amendment) Act-18.pdf




