The Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 1962

Act 16 of 1962

Keyword(s):
Local Authority, Laws, Reservation, Women, Municipal Corporation, Child

Amendments appended: 13 of 1980, 5 of 1990, 17 of 2005, 21 of 2011, 21 of 2014, 23
of 2014, 15 of 2015

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




Extra No. 16 REGISTERED No. G-448

The Sufavat Gobernment Sasette
EXTRAORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY :

=

Vol. 111} WisDNESDAY, JULY 23,

1962 SRAVANA 5, 1884

[

Separate paging Is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate

compilation.

PART IV

Acts of the Oniaral Leglslvtace and

) . Urdinances promaulgats,
wui. B ocaidtions cade

by the  tjavernot.
CONTEXTS

Paars
GUJARAT ACT NOQ. XVI OF {362—An Acl to provide for the continuance for a

further period of eight years, of reservation of seats for wormen and for the Sched-

uled Castes and Scheduled Tribes in lecal authorities in the Siale of Gujarat and

for that purpose further to amend the laws relaling to such local authurllms

The following Act of

302—304

the ¢ ll_]dldf L v!rh! timc‘ having  hieen assented to by
the Governor on the 186h July 1062, is lwu'h\ published for veneral mforination.

M. G. MONANTI,
Secretary o the Government of Gujarat

Legal Departiment.
GUJARAT ACT NO. XVI QF 1962

{First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in
the * Gujarat Governmont Gazetfe ” on the 25th July [662)

An Act to provide for the continnance for a further period of eight years,
of reservation of seuts for women and for the Scheduled Castes and
Scheduled Tribes in local authorities in the State of Gujarat and
for that purpose further 1o amend the laws relating to such
focal authoritics.

It is hereby enacted in the Thirteenth Year of the Republic of India, as follows:—

1. () This Act may be ealled the Gtujarat Local Authorities Taws (Amend- Short tit
ment) Act, 19862.

and com
509 cement,
A -t

IV~Extra-46 {Mono)



hntent
zin
ons of

303 CUT. GOV GAZ, BXL, JULY 25 1062 [ SRAVANA 3, 1881 [ Pavr IV

(23 1t slall come into foree at once.

A 1lch 01" tho laws specifind in the second cohunn of the Schedule shall he

amended 2l shall be deemed alwoyvs to have heen amended with effcet on and

elating (tom the 25th .Tammy o2 in the manner, and to the extent, speeified against
doans gt in tho third column therout.

o,

anil
don of
1 acki-

3. () Nothing in this Aet shall affect the vight of any councillor or member
clected, sclested, dppnmiml or novtinated to fill any seat resorved for women

cenand and oy Scheduled Casres or Schednled Tribes o continue a5 o councillur ov

dane,

booef
il M.
1962,

menter of 2 local anthority duving vhe vernn of the office for which he was duly
elecrod, selected, appointed or nominated before this Act  comes into {oree.

(2) Any action taken ox any thing dene before the commencement of this
Act, which bt Loy provisions of this JAet, wonld Lave heen mwvalid, shall be
valtd as il the provisions of this Act had been n force  whon such action was
taken or thing dome,

& The Gjavat Loeal  Awthorities  Laws (Amendment) Ordinance, 1962 isGuj.
hereby repezled and the provisions of sections 7 and 23 of the Bombay vam]o

1[[
Clanses Ak, 1801 shall appdy 1o suelt tepeal as it that Ordinancs vere an on- Uf
actment. 1,96;"
SCIEDULIS %’0(];';
1904,
{br’c seelion 2)
;}L;a'[ﬁ_l Shorl title Txtent of amendment
Numiber
1 2 3

?_ a'-) _.-Bm-ﬂj Wy Dbmft \Inm{ ipal Aet,) |
1501 {Bom. III of 1901); and

(¢4)  that Act #5 in foree in the Saura-
ahtra area of the Btate of Gujarat M sub-section (7Y of seetion 11, in
by virtue of the Stare of Saura-|  clause (@), for the words “rwelve
shtra (Application of Centyal and | years” the words “‘Uwenty years”
Bombay Acts) Ordinance, 19481 shall Le substituled.

(San, Ord, XXV of 1948).

A

2 Bombay Loeal DBoards Act, 1923 In section 6A ag also in the marginal
(Bom. VI of 1923). nole to that '«m’rum for ihe words
“twelve years” tho words “lwenly

vears”  shall be substituted.
3 (i) DBombay Munieipal Boroughs Act,)
1925 (Bom. XVIII of 1925); (md

(z7) that Act as in force in the Saura-
shtra area of the State of Gujavat yIn snb-scction (7) of seetion 10, in
by vivtue of the State of Saurash-{  clouse (d), for the words “‘twelve
tra (Application of Central and!  years” the words “twenty years”
Bombay Acts) Ordinance, 1943 |  shall be substituted.

(Sau, Ord. XXV of 1948).




Pary IV] GUT, GOVT. GA%, BX., JULY

Serial Sihort title
Nuwher
i _ 2

25, 1962 [ SRAVANA 3, 184 304

Extent of amendment

3

4 Bombay Mwunicipal  DBoroughs Act,
1923 ( Bom., XVIII of 1925} as in
force in the Kutels ares of the State
of Gujarat by virtue of the Part ©
Brates Laws  Act, 1950 (XXX of
1950).

3 Bombay Provineial  Munieipal Corpo-
rabions Act, 1989 (Bony, TIX ot 1919),

6 DBombay Village Panchavats
1958 (BDom. IIT of 1459).

Aot

¥

In sub-scetion (I4) of section 10, for
the words “twelve  years” the
words “lwenty years” shall  be

substituted.

In section 5, in the second proviso,
for the portion beginning with the
words “for the purpose” and ending

with the words  “so held”, the
following  shall  bs  substituted,

namely :—

“for the purpose of any gencral
election held before the expiration
of the period for the time heing
spocified in arricle 334 of the
Constitution of India, and for Dy-
elections (if any) before the next
genoral election after the expira-
tion of such poriod, so held.”

In sub-gection (2) of section 10, for
the words  “twelve  yoars’” ihe
words  “twenty years” shall  be
substituted,

PRINTED AT THE GOVERNMENT CEMIRA), PRESS, AUMCDABAD.



,Estra No. .30 ' REGISTERED NO. G/GNR/2

LXTR}_XORDINARY

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

R TR A S TR ke

Vol. XXI] | WED;‘IZLéijAY, SEPTKMBER 3, 1980/BHADRA 12, 1902

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it m_ay be fled as a
separate Compilation.

PART 1V

Acts of the Gujarai Legistature and Ordinances promulgaled and
: Regulatlous made by the Governor.

—————— —— e

- The fullowmg Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by the
Governor on the st September, 1980 is hereby published for general information.

- ‘ N B, PATEL,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, .
Legal Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 13 OF 1980.

{First published after having received the assent of the Governor in the. “Gujarat
QGovernment Gazette” on the. 3rd S_eptember, 1980;. '

An Act to provide for the continuance for a period of ten years, of reservation of
seats for. women and for the Scheduled Castes and the Scheduled Tribes
in ceriain local authorities in the State of Gujarat and ‘for that purpose
to amend the ]aws relating fo such local authorities

It is hereby enacted in the Thirty-first Year of the Republic of India as
follows: — : .

. () This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Mhord tile

(Amendmen:; Act, 1980. ' _ C snd emue

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 29th April, 1980.

30-1
_I\?-;Fﬂra—ﬁ"! . -



s - 304 OTF O0VT, QAZ. - BX., SEPTEMBER 3, HSOfYHADRA 12, 1802 - [Parr IV

oarmo;:ﬁ:;t 2. I the ‘1 anbay Provincial Municipal Corporauons Act, 1949, in secuonﬁg?
of Bom, le5 i sub-section 4), for the words “thirty years” the words ° forly years” shall ygg9,

of 1949, be and shali be m:emed always to hsve been substituted.

of spotion 6 .
of Guj. 34 of the words “thirty years” the words” “forty years” shall be and shall .be deemed 1984,

o6t always to have been substituted.

Amandmont 3 In the bujdrat Mumctpahncs Act, 1963 in secuon 6, in su'b'tseémn {4, for G“!f

r;’:fz‘:?k;f 4. Any action taken or anything done in relation fo the reservauou ‘of seats Bom.

and  thingsfor women and for the Scheduled Castes and the Scheduled Tribes in"a municipal T

-Aone, corporation under the Bombay Provincial Muaicipal Corporations Act, 1949 or a Guj.
mumicipality under the Gujarat Municipalities Acl, 1963 after.the 25th Jaouary, “;';6;_’
1980 and before the commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Guj.
fAmendment) Qrdinance, 1980, shall be deemed to have been validly taken or?2 of
done in accordance with law, as if, the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corpora- 1980,
tions Act, 1949, or, as the case may be, the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963°
had been in force as amended by this Act at all material times when such
action was taken or thing was done and accordingly no such action or thing
shall be called in question in any court of law on the ground that there was no
provision for the reservation of seats for women and for the Scheduled Castes
and the Scheduled Tribes in those Acts, at the material time.

" Bopeal and 5. (I) The Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Second Amendment} Ordinance, Guj.
aaving. 1980 is hereby repealed. _ _ _ ?Qdo;
' 1980,

"(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything dome or any action taken under po., -
the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949 as amended by the Lgigc
said Ordinance or, as the case may be, the Gujarat Mumclpahhes Act, 1963 as quj.
amended by the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taker 34 of

' . 1984,
~ under the Bombay Act or the Gujarat Act, as amended by this Act. oot

PRINTED AT THE QOVEANMENT CENTRAL PAESS, OANDHINAGAR



"INARY

runusnfn nv‘Auruom*v

Vol. XXXI] FRIDAY JUHE 29 IWO;ASADHA 8, 1912

Bepm‘ttepa;inglsglventothlsl’aﬂlnordertlm&
--"__maybeﬁledasnsem&eeompﬂaﬂon.
" PART IV |

mumw'wmmommmmﬁ
: Reguhﬂmmdebytbo(;om C

The fol,lowmg Act of the. Gujarat Leglslature havmg been assented to by the

' Governor on the 28th June, 1990-is hereby published for general information.
: C R M. BIEHTA

o Seeretary to the Government of Gu]arat

o o - . Legal Department

o GUJARA‘I‘ACTNO.SOFIM R
o (F‘nst publlshed after havmgs received the assert of the Govemor in the
"‘Gu:amt Govermnem Gazetre" on the 29th June. 1990) :

"AN ACT

w?’mforthemmforapmodoftmng’ Off .

of sealy for women and: for the Scheduled Castes and the Scﬁe&ded
TnbesmoertamlcoalauthoMeesmtkeSmoquJam
' andforthatpurpmtoamendtkelawsfehtw

Tt is hereby enaoted in. the Forby-ﬁmt Yea.r of the Repubhe of In(ha a8
follows*— ' .

1. (}) Thm A.ct may be . called t.he anamt Looal Aut.hontlea Iaws
(Amendment.) -Adt, 1990 - .

(2) T sha.ll be deemed to havs come mto foree on tlm 13{:11 Apnl 1990
L 81 . o
W*Extra,—&—l co

R T




g), for.tho: words “fotty years”, ho. “fift;
depmed always to. have. boen substituted..

"-'(4} fort-ho wordq’“foﬁ,y_ _
‘bo-deomed- alwaya to. liave

Corpoiations {Act,-1949 4w amended by’ 18X of -
Al y; bo, the- Guimb Hﬂmmpalltma_ Am,’ - N
5000188 ' ~“Ordinanoe shall bo deemed-t6- havo boen - of 1084, -
..._-dlt:lne Aor taken under tho Bombay Aot or: the Gujarat. Act, a8 &mon'tled by Philiaty:
this ct o |

* GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR. - .~ .- =




Extra No. 17 REGISTERED No. G/GNR/2

The Gujarat Government Gasette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

- Vol: XLVI]  WEDNESDAY, MARCII 23, 2005/CAITRA 2, 1927
Scparate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation
PART 1V

Acts of the Gujarat Legisiature and Ordinances promulgated
and regniations made by the Governor,

The following Act of the Gujarat [.egislature, having been assented to by the
Governor on the 23rd March, 2005 is hereby published for general information.

5. S. PARMAR,

Secretary 1o the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Aflairs Department.

-

GUJARA'T ACT NO. 17 OF 2005.

{First published, after having received the assent of the Govemor in the
"Cuyjarat Government Gavette", on the 23rd March, 2005).

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949,
the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and
the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993

It 1s hereby cnacted in the Fifty-sixth Year of the Republic of India s
follows:- '

l. (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws gy tite
{Amendmeni) Act, 2005. and
‘ commence-
(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, ment.
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

V-Ex-17-1 17-1



17-2 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX-23-3-2003 [PART-IV

Amendment 2. In the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949, in  Bom.LIX
of section 10 section 10, in sub-section (1), after clause (i), the following clausc shall be ~ ©f 1949
of BomLIX of  pserted, namely:-

1949,

"(j¥has more than two children:

Provided that a person having more than two children -
on the date of commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2005 (hereinafter in  Gul. 17 of

) " w2005,

this clause referred to as "the date of such commencement™),
shall not be disqualified under this clause so long as the
number of children he had on the date of such
commencement does not increasc:

Provided further that a child or more than one child
born in a single delivery within the period of one vear from
the date of such commencement shall not be taken into
consideration for the purpose of disqualification under this
clause.

Explanation — For the purpose of this clause,-

(1) where a couplc has only one child on or after
the date of such commencement, any number of
children born out of single subsequent delivery Shall
be deemed to be one entity;

(i1} 'child’" does wot include an adopicd child or
childrern."
Amt.:mhnmt‘ of 3, Inthe x'l:j( wrat Voo i alities ‘3"' 1963 3, i sgoiion in suh-scction feuj 34 of
section H of (1), after clause (g), the following clausc shall be inser ted, namely - £964.
suj. 34 of 1964,
"(h} who has morc than two children:
Provided that a person having more than two children
on the datc of commencement of the Gujarat Local CuiiT of
uj.17 o

Authoritics Laws (Amendment} Act, 2005 (hercinafter in 5.
this clause referred to as "the date of such commencement"),
shall not be disqualified under this clause, so long as the

. | :
aumber of children he had on the date of ench

commencement does not imcrease:

Provided further that a child or more than one child
born in a single delivery within the period of one year from
the date of such commencement shall not be takeun into



Guij. 18 of
1993,

PART-1V]

4,

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE EX-23-3-2005

consideration for the purposc of disqualification under this
clause.

Explanation — For the purpose of this clause,-

1) where a couple has only one child on or after
the date of snch commencement, any number of
children bom out of single subsequent delivery shall
be deemcd to be one entity;

(11) ‘child' does not includc_an adopted child or
chaldren.".

In the Guyarat Panchayats Act, 1993, in section 34, n sub-section

(1), after clausc (1), the following clause shalf be inserted, namely:-

Guj. 17 of
2005.

"(m) has more than two children:

Provided that a person having more than two children
on the date of commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws {(Amendment) Act, 2005 (hereinafter n
this clause referred to as "the date of such commencement™),
shall not be disqualified under this clause so long as the
nunber of children he had on the date of such
commencement does not increasc: '

Provided further that a child or more than onc child
ooini in a single delivery within the period of onc year froim
the date of such commencement shall not be taken into
consideration for the purposc of disqualification under this
clause,

Explanation,— For the purpose of this clause,-

(1) where a coupte has only one child on or after
the date of such commencement, any number of
children born out of single subsequent delivery shall
be deemed to be one entity;

(1) 'chilid' does not inctude an adopted child or

children "

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR

Amendment of
section 30 of
Guj. 18 of
1993,



Extra No. 21 REGISTERED No. G/GNR/2

The Gujarat Government Gasette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. LII] WEDNESDAY, MAY 4, 201I/VAISAKHA 14, 1933
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART IV

Acts of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and Regulations
made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat legislature, having been
assented to by the Governor on the 3™ May, 2011, is hereby published
for general information.

C.J. GOTHI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 21 OF 2011.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in
the "Gujarat Government Gazette", on the 4th April, 2011)

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the Gujarat Municipalities Act; 1963 and
the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993.

It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-second Year of the Republic of
India as follows:-
1. This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Short title.
(Amendment) Act, 2011.

IV.Ex.,-21-1 21-1



21-2 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, Ex, 4-5-2011 [PART- IV

Amendment of 2, In the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949 Bom.LIX 1945,
Sm{i‘;é g:f;’;;' (hereinafter referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act™), in section
- 2, after clause (34A), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

“(34AA) “mobile tower” means a temporary or permanent structure,
equipment or instrument erected or installed on land or upon any
part of the building or premises for providing telecommunication
services:”.

Insertion of 3, In the Municipal Corporations Act, in Chapter IX, after section

new section
108A in Bom. 108, the following section shall be inserted, namely :-

LIX of 1949,

Auditand “108A. (1) The accounts of the municipal corporation shall be

technical
guidanc: ;“d audited under the provisions of the Gujarat Local Fund Audit Guj. Xsl:tx
G of 196
Supervision
over audit. Act, 1963.
(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the State
Government shall entrust the Comptroller and Auditor General
of India the technical guidance and supervision over the audit of
the municipal corporation.
(3)  The State Government shall cause the audit report under
the Gujarat Local Fund Audit Act, 1963 along with the report of G;a\li%!?lﬂ
¥ S
the Comptroller and Auditor General of India on technical
guidance and supervision as referred to in sub-sections (1) and
(2), to be laid before the State Legislature.”™.
Amendment of 4, In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 127, in sub-section
section 127 of : A
Bom. LIX of (1), after clause (b), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-
1949,

“(c)  atax on mobile towers:".



PART-1IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, Ex, 4-5-2011

Tax on

5 In the Municipal Corporations Act, after section 145, the
following sub-heading and section shall be inserted, namely :-

“Tax on Mobile Towers

145A. (1) A tax at the rates not exceeding those prescribed by

mobile order in writing by the State Government in this behalf from time

towers.

Guj. 34 of

to time shall be levied on mobile towers from the person engaged
in providing telecommunication services through such mobile
towers.

(2)  The Corporation shall from year to year, in accordance with
section 99, determine the rates at which the tax shall be levied.”,

6. In the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 (hereinafter referred to
as “the Municipalities Act”), in section 2, after clause (12A), the
following clause shall be inserted, namely :-

“(12B) “mobile tower” means a temporary or permanent structure,
equipment or instrument erected or installed on land or upon any part of

the building or premises for providing telecommunication services;”.

2 In the Municipalities Act, in section 33, for sub-section (1), the

following sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1y (a) The term of office of the President and Vice-President of
a municipality shall be two and half years.

(b)  Subject to the other provisions of this section, the
President or the Vice-President shall be eligible for re-
election.

(c) Subject to the other provisions of this section, the Vice-
President of a municipality who has completed the term
of two and half years on or before the commencement of

Guj. 21 of 2011. the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act,

2011, shall continue to hold the office of the Vice-
President till the expiry of the term of that municipality.”.

21-3

Insertion of new
section 1454 in
Bom. LIX of
1949,

Amendment of
section 2 of Guj.
34 of 1964.

Amendment of
section 33 of Guj.
34 of 1964.



21-4

Amendment of
section 77 of
Guj. 34 of 1964,

Amendment of
section 99 of Guj.
34 of 1964.

Amendment of
section 2 of Guj.
18 of 1993,

Amendment
of section 121

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, Ex, 4-5-2011 [PART- IV

3. In the Municipalities Act, in section 77, after sub-section (3), the

following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“4) Notwithstanding anything contained in the preceding sub-
sections, the State Government shall entrust the Comptroller and
Auditor General of India the technical guidance and supervision over the

audit of the municipality.

(5)  The State Government shall cause the audit report under the
Gujarat Local Fund Audit Act, 1963 referred to in sub-section (1)
alongwith the report of the Comptroller and Auditor General of India on
technical guidance and supervision as referred to in sub-section (4), to

be laid before the State Legislature.”.

9, In the Municipalities Act, in section 99, in sub-section (1), after

clause (xiv), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

*(xiv-a) a tax on mobile towers to be levied from the person
engaged in providing telecommunication services through such
mobile towers;”.

10.  In the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as
“the Panchayats Act™), in section 2, after clause (12), the following

clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(12A) “mobile tower” means a temporary or permanent structure,
equipment or instrument erected or installed on land or upon any part of

the building or premises for providing telecommunication services;”.

11.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 121, after sub-section (1), the

of Guj. 18 of following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely :-

1993.

Guj. ¥
of 1964,

Guj. XLIX
of 1963.

Guj. 18 of 1993,



PART-1IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, Ex, 4-5-2011

of 1963,

Guj. XLIX
of 1963,

Guj. XLIX
of 1963,

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the State
Government shall entrust the Comptroller and Auditor General of India
the technical guidance and supervision over the audit of the village

panchayat.

(1B) The State Government shall cause the audit report under the
Gujarat Local Fund Audit Act, 1963 referred to in sub-section (1)
alongwith the report of the Comptroller and Auditor General of India on
technical guidance and supervision as referred to in sub-section (1A), to

be laid before the State Legislature.”.

12.  Inthe Panchayats Act, section 143 shall be numbered as sub-
section (1) of that section and after sub-section (1) as so renumbered, the

following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“(2)  Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), the State
Government shall entrust the Comptroller and Auditor General of India
the technical guidance and supervision over the audit of the taluka
panchayat.

(3) The State Government shall cause the audit report under the
Gujarat Local Fund Audit Act, 1963 referred to in sub-section (1)
alongwith the report of the Comptroller and Auditor General of India on
technical guidance and supervision as referred to in sub-section (2), to

be laid before the State Legislature.”.

13.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 166, after sub-section (2), the

following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“(3) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2), the State
Government shall entrust the Comptroller and Auditor General of India
the technical guidance and supervision over the audit of the district

panchayat.

(4)  The State Government shall cause the audit report under the

Gujarat Local Fund Audit Act, 1963 referred to in sub-section (2)

21-5

Amendment

of section 143
of Guj. 18 of
1993,

Amendment
of section 166
of Guj. 18 of
1993,



21-6 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, Ex, 4-5-2011 [PART- IV

alongwith the report of the Comptroller and Auditor General of India on
technical guidance and supervision as referred to in sub-section (3), to
be laid before the State Legislature.”.

Amendmentof 14, In the Panchayats Act, in section 200,-
section 200 of

Guj. 18 of 1993,
(1) in sub-section (1), after clause (i), the following clause shall be

inserted, namely:-
“(i-a) atax on mobile towers;";

(2) after sub-section (4), and the proviso thereunder, the following

sub-section shall be inpserted, namely:-

“(4A) a tax on mobile towers referred to in clause (i-a) of sub-
section (1) shall be levied from the person engaged in providing

telecommunication services through such mobile towers.”.

GOYERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.



Extra No. 23 REGISTERED No. L2/RNP/G/GNR/84

ARl @Al €3 31 3000)-

The Gujarat @;;?mment Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

Vol. LV] WEDNESDAY, NOVEMBER S, 2014/KARTIKA 14, 1936
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART 1V

Acts of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regulations made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented to by the
Governor on the 4™ November, 2014, is hereby published for general information.

C. J. GOTHI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 21 OF 2014.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in the
"Gujarat Government Gazette", on the 5™ November, 2014).

AN ACT

further to amend the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949,
the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and
the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993.

It is hereby enacted in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic of India as
follows:-

1. (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Short title and
(Amendment) Act, 2009. commencement.

2) This section shall come into force at once and the remaining provisions
shall come into force on such date as the State Government may, by notification in
the Official Gazette, appoint and different dates may be appointed for different
provisions of the Act.

IV Ex.-23 23-1



23-2

Amendment
of section 5 of
Bom.LIX of
1949.

Insertion of new
sections in Bom.
LIX of 1949.

Obligation
to vote.

Declaration
of a voter to
be a
defaulter
voter.

Valid and
sufficient
reasons for
not voting.

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014 [PART v

2. In the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949 Bom. LIX

(hereinafter referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”), in section 5, -
)
2
©)

in sub-section (5), for the word “One-third”, the words “As nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted:;
in sub-section (6), for the words “one third”, the words “as nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted;
in sub-section (7), for the word “One-third”, the words “As nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted.

3. In the Municipal Corporations Act, after section 16, the following
sections shall be inserted, namely:-

“OBLIGATION TO VOTE

16A. (1) It shall be the duty of a qualified voter of the Municipal
Corporation to vote at the election of the Municipal Corporation, however,
he will be free to cast his vote in favour of none of the candidates contesting
election as indicated in sub-section (2).

2 The qualified voter shall cast his vote in favour of none of the
candidates contesting election, in the manner as may be prescribed by rules,
in case where he does not want to cast his vote in favour of any candidate.

16B. (1) The election officer, as may be designated by the State Election
Commission, may declare the voter to be the defaulter voter who failed to
vote at the election of a Municipal Corporation after giving him a notice in
the form prescribed by rules.

(2)  The State Government shall be competent to prescribe by rules to be
laid before the State Legislature, the disadvantages or consequences to be
suffered by a defaulter voter.

16C. A qualified voter shall be exempted to vote at the election of the
Municipal Corporation —

(1) if he is physically incapable due to illness to vote or other bodily
infirmity to come and discharge his obligation, or

(2) if he is absent on the date of election from the country or State of
Gujarat, or '
(3) for such other valid and sufficient reasons as may be prescribed by

rules by the State Government in consultation with the State
Election Commission.

of 1949.



PART IV ] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014

Guj. 34
0f 1964.

23-3

16D. (1) An election officer shall issue a notice to the voter who failed to Notice.

vote at the election of the Municipal Corporation.

(2)  The election officer shall by a notice inform the voter that he
appears to have failed to vote at the election and that it is the duty of voter
to vote at election. The voter may within a period of one month inform the
valid and sufficient reasons, if any, for not voting alongwith supporting
documents such as medical certificate, a copy of passport, etc.

(3)  If no reply to the notice referred to in sub-section (1) is received
within a period of one month or where the voter writes to the election
officer reasons for not voting and where the election: officer is not satisfied
with the reasons given by voter as valid and sufficient, the election officer
shall by an order in writing containing reasons declare him a defaulter voter.

16E. (1) The voter who is aggrieved by the order of the election officer
under section 16D may prefer an appeal in the form prescribed by rules,
within a period of one month, to the Appellate Officer designated as such
by the State Election Commission.

(2)  The Appellate Officer after providing an opportunity of being heard
to the appellant may pass an appropriate order. The order of the Appellate
Officer shall be final.”.

4. In the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 (hereinafter referred to as
“the Municipalities Act”), in section 6,--

(1)  in sub-section (2), -

(i) in clause (a), for the figure “21”, the figure “24” shall be
substituted;

(1) in clause (b), for the figure “27”, the figure “28” shall be
substituted;

(iii) in clause (d), for the figure “42”, the figure “44” shall be
substituted;

(iv) in clause (e), for the figure “51”, the figure “52” shall be
substituted;

(2)  in sub-section (3),-
() in clause (b), for the word “One-third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (c), for the word “one-third”, the words “as nearly as
may be one-half’ shall be substituted;

(iii) in clause (d), for the word “one-third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted.

Appeal.

Amendment of
section 6 of
Guj. 34 of 1964.



23-4 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014 [ PART IV

Insertion of new 3. In the Municipalities Act, after section 15, the following sections
sections in Guj. 34 shall be inserted, namely:-
of 1964.
“OBLIGATION TO VOTE

Obligation 15A. (1) It shall be the duty of a qualified voter of the Municipality to

to vote. vote at the election of the Municipality, however, he will be free to cast his

vote in favour of none of the candidates contesting election as indicated in
sub-section (2).

2) The qualified voter shall cast his vote in favour of none of the
candidates contesting election, in the manner as may be prescribed by rules,
in case where he does not want to cast his vote in favour of any candidate.

?iﬁ)‘;rra:i"; of 15B. (1) The election officer, as may be designated by the State Election

def:ul:e?' Commission, may declare the voter to be the defaulter voter who failed to

voter. Vote at the election of a Municipality after giving him a notice in the form
prescribed by rules.

(2)  The State Government shall be competent to prescribe by rules to be
laid before the State Legislature, the disadvantages or consequences to be
suffered by a defaulter voter.

Validand 15C. A qualified voter shall be exempted to vote at the election of the

sufficient Municipality —
reasons for

not voting. (1) if he is physically incapable due to illness to vote or other bodily

infirmity to come and discharge his obligation, or

(2) ifheis absent on the date of election from the country or State of
Gujarat, or

(3) for such other valid and sufficient reasons as may be prescribed
by rules by the State Government in consultation with the State
Election Commission.

Notice. 15D. (1) An election officer shall issue a notice to the voter who failed to
vote at the election of the Municipality.

(2)  The election officer shall by a notice inform the voter that he
appears to have failed to vote at the election and that it is the duty of voter
to vote at election. The voter may within a period of one month inform the
valid and sufficient reasons, if any, for not voting alongwith supporting
documents such as medical certificate, a copy of passport, etc.



PART IV ] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014

Guj. 18 of
1993.

(3)  If no reply to the notice referred to in sub-section (1) is received
within a period of one month or where the voter writes to the election
officer reasons for not voting and where the election officer is not satisfied
with the reasons given by voter as valid and sufficient, the election officer
shall by an order in writing containing reasons declare him a defaulter voter.

1SE. (1) The voter who is aggrieved by the order of the election officer
under section 15D may prefer an appeal in the form prescribed by rules,
within a period of one month, to the Appellate Officer designated as such
by the State Election Commission.

(2)  The Appellate Officer after providing an opportunity of being heard
to the appellant may pass an appropriate order. The order of the Appellate
Officer shall be final.”. )

6. In the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as “the
Panchayats Act”), in section 9,-

(1)  in sub-section (4), for the word “seven”, occurring at two places, the
word “eight” shall be substituted;

(2)  in sub-section (5),-

() in clause (b), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (c), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted.

Y In the Panchayats Act, in section 10,-

(1)  in sub-section (4), for the word “fifteen”, occurring at two places,
the word “sixteen” shall be substituted;

(2)  in sub-section (5),-

(i) in clause (b), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted;

(i) in clause (c), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted.

8. "In the Panchayats Act, in section 11,-

.(1) in sub-section (4), for the word “seventeen”, occurring at two
places, the word “eighteen” shall be substituted;

23-5

Appeal.

Amendment
of section 9 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 10 of
Guj. 18 of 1993.

Amendment
of section 11 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.



23-6 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014 [ PART IV

(2) in sub-section (5),-

() in clause (b), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted;

(ii) in clause (c), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly as
may be one-half” shall be substituted.

Insertion of new 9. In the Panchayats Act, after section 34, the following sections shall
sections in Guj.  be inserted, namely:-
18 of 1993.
“OBLIGATION TO VOTE

Obligation  34A. (1) It shall be the duty of a qualified voter of the Panchayats to vote
tovote. 4t the election of the Panchayat, however, he will be free to cast his vote in
favour of none of the candidates contesting election as indicated in sub-

section (2).

(2)  The qualified voter shall cast his vote in favour of none of the
candidates contesting election, in the manner as may be prescribed by rules,
in case where he does not want to cast his vote in favour of any candidate.

Declaration 34B. (1)  The election officer, as may be designated by the State
of avoterto Election Commission, may declare the voter to be the defaulter voter who
bea fajled to vote at the election of a Panchayat after giving him a notice in the
defaulter f .
orm prescribed by rules.

voter.
(2)  The State Government shall be competent to prescribe by rules to be
laid before the State Legislature, the disadvantages or consequences to be

suffered by a defaulter voter.

Valid ‘fmd 34C. A qualified voter shall be exempted to vote at the election of the
sufficient q p

reasons for Panchayat — .

not voting.

(1) if be is physically incapable due to illness to vote or other bodily
infirmity to come and discharge his obligation, or

(2) ifheis absent on the date of election from the country or State of
Gujarat, or

(3) for such other valid and sufficient reasons as may be prescribed
by rules by the State Government in consultation with the State
Election Commission.

Notice. 34D, (1) An election officer shall issue a notice to the voter who failed to
vote at the election of the Panchayats.



PART IV]

Bom. LIX of 1949.

Guj. 34 of 1964.
Guj. 18 of 1993.

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX., 05-11-2014

(2)  The election officer shall by a notice inform the voter that he
appears to have failed to vote at the election and that it is the duty of voter
to vote at election. The voter may within a period of one month inform the
valid and sufficient reasons, if any, for not voting alongwith supporting
documents such as medical certificate, a copy of passport, etc.

(3)  If no reply to the notice referred to in sub-section (1) is received
within a period of one month or where the voter writes to the election
officer reasons for not voting and where the election officer is not satisfied
with the reasons given by voter as valid and sufficient, the election officer
shall by an order in writing containing reasons declare him a defaulter voter.

34E. (1) The voter who is aggrieved by the order of the election officer
under section 34D may prefer an appeal in the form prescribed by rules,
within a period of one month, to the Appellate Officer designated as such
by the State Election Commission.

(2)  The Appellate Officer after providing an opportunity of being heard
to the appellant may pass an appropriate order. The order of the Appellate
Officer shall be final.”.

10.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 51, in sub-section (2), in clause (b),
in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted. '

11.  Inthe Panchayats Act, in section 63, in sub-section (2), in clause (b),
in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted.

12. In the Panchayats Act, in section 77, in sub-section (2), in clause (b),
in sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for the words “One third”, the words “As nearly
as may be one-half” shall be substituted.

13. Notwithstanding anything contained in this Act, the Municipal
Corporation, the Municipality or, as the case may be, the Panchayat
constituted immediately before the commencement of the provisions of this
Act, amending the Bombay Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949,
the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993
shall continue till the expiration of its duration or till it is dissolved before
its duration.

GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR.

23-7

Appeal.

Amendment
of section 51
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment
of section 63
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment
of section 77
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Continuance of
existing
municipal
corporations,
municipalities
and panchayats.



REGISTERED NO.L2/RNP/G/GNR-84
alils qarsHAl € 31. 3000/-

Extra No. 26

© e
The Gujarat Government Gazette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY -
Vol. LV FRIDAY, NOVEMBER 28, 2014/AGRAHAYANA 7, 1936

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART 1V

Acts of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and Regulations
' made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented
to by the Governor on the 27™ November, 2014, is hereby published for

general information.

C.J. GOTHI, -\
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 23 OF 2014.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in the
"Gujarat Government Gazette", on the 28™ November, 2014)

AN ACT

further to amend the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949,
the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993.

It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-fifth Year of the Republic of India
as follows:-

Short title and
commencement.

1. (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2014.

2) It shall come into force on such date as the State
Government may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

\

IV-Ex., 26-1 26-1



26-2 GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX, 28-11-2014 [PART- IV

1949.

Amendment of 2. In the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949 Bom.LIXof
section 10 of Bom.  (hereinafter referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”), in section 10,
LIX of 1949. in sub-section (1), after clause (h), the following clause shall be inserted,

namely:-

“(hh) has no facility of water closet or privy accommodation at the
place of his ordinary residence:

Provided that a sitting Councillor shall be deemed to have incurred
disqualification if he does not submit to the Municipal
Commissioner, within six months from the date of commehcement
of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2014, a
certificate issued by the concerned Deputy Municipal
Commissioner of the Corporation in whose jurisdiction his ordinary
residence is situated, to the effect that he is having facility of water
closet or privy accommodation at the place of his ordinary
residence;”.

Amendment of 3. In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 15, in sub-section (1),

ie&' (::l'. }; 4°9f Bom. ¢ +he words “three months”, the words “six months” shall be substituted.

Amendmentof In the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963, in section 11, in sub-
section 11 of Guj.

34 of 1964. section (1), after clause (£), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(ff) has no facility of water closet or privy accommodation at
the place of his ordinary residence :

Provided that a sitting Councillor shall be deemed to have
incurred disqualification if he does mnot submit to the District
Collector, within six months from the date of commencement of the
Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2014, a
certificate issued by the Chief Officer of the concerned
Municipality in whose jurisdiction his ordinary residence is
situated, to the effect that he is having facility of water closet or
privy accommodation at the place of his ordinary residence.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this clause, “water closet or privy
accommodation” shall have the same meaning as is given to the
term “water closet” in Explanation to section 167A of the Act;”.

Amendment 5. In the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as “the
05_5(‘;*‘.‘01“87 : Panchayats Act”), in section 7, in sub-section (1), for the words “fifteen
of Guj. 18 of ,55and”, the words “twenty-five thousand” shall be substituted.

1993.

Amendment 6, In the Panchayats Act, in section 9,-

of section 9

‘1’;;;3"]' LBt (a) in sub-section (4), for the words “one thousand”, the words

“three thousand” shall be substituted;

Guj. 23 of 2014.

Guj. 34 of 1964.

Guj. 23 of 2014.

Guj. 18 of
1993.



26-3 GUJARAT _GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX, 28-11-2014 [PART- IV

(b)  to sub-section (4), the following proviso shall be added,
namely:-

«provided that the amendment made in this sub-section by
the Guijarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2014 shall Gl 23 ot A
not have effect till the expiration of duration of any village
panchayat, unless sooner dissolved.”.

7 In the Panchayats Act, in section 30, in sub-section (1), after Amendment of
clause (K), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- section 30 of
Guj. 18 of 1993.
“(kk) has no facility of water closet or privy accommodation at the
. place of his ordinary residence:

Provided that a sitting member shall be deemed to have
incurred disqualification if he does not submit to the Taluka
Development Officer of the taluka, within six months from the date
of commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2014, a certificate issued by the Gram Panchayat L
Mantri of the panchayat in whose jurisdiction his ordinary residence
is situated, to the effect that he is having facility of water closet or
privy accommodation at the place of his ordinary residence.

Explanation.- For the purpose of this clause, “water closet or privy
accommodation” shall have the same meaning as is given to the
term “water closet” in Explanation to section 107 of the Act;”.

Government Central Press, Gandhinagar.



Extra No. 15 allls qaesu-l €2 31 3400/

The Gujarat Government Gasette

EXTRAORDINARY
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

B e s e
Vol. LVI ! FRIDAY, APRIL 10, 2015/CAITRA 20, 1937

Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a Separate Compilation.

PART 1V

Acts of Gujarat Legislature and Ordinances promulgated and
Regulations made by the Governor.

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature, having been assented to by the
Govemor on the 10" April, 2015, is hereby published for general information.

C.J. GOTHI,
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat,
Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department.

GUJARAT ACT NO. 15 OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor, in the "Gujarat
Government Gazette", on the 10" April, 2015).

AN ACT

further to amend the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act,
1949, the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 and the Gujarat Panchayats
Act, 1993.
It is hereby enacted in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of
India as follows:-

(i (1) This Act may be called the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws Shg” title
an
(Amendment) Act, 2015. ' commencement.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government
may, by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

Bom. LIX 2. In the Gujarat Provincial Municipal Corporations Act, 1949
of 1949. (hereinafter referred to as “the Municipal Corporations Act”), in
section 20, -

IV Ex.-15 15-1



15-2

Amendment
of section 21
of Bom. LIX
of 1949,

Amendment
of section
25 of Bom.

LIX of 1949.

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

(1) sub-sections (3), (4), (5) and (6) shall be deleted;

(2)  after sub-section (6), the following sub-sections shall be
inserted, namely :-

“(7) (i) The term of the members appointed under sub-
section (2) shall be two and a half years;

(i)  the members shall be eligible for re-
appointment.”.

(8) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (7),
the term of the existing members of the Standing Committee
shall be governed in accordance with the relevant provisions as
in force prior to the coming into force of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 as if such relevant
provisions have not been omitted by the Amending Act of
2015, till a new Standing Committee is constituted upon the
general elections ~f the Corporations held after the date of the
commencement o! the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015.”.

3. In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 21, for sub-
sections (1) and (2), the following sub-sections shall be substituted,
namely :-

“(1)  The members of the Standing Committee shall appoint
one of its members to be the Chairman on the same day on which they
are appointed under sub-section (2) of section 20. The term of the
Chairman shall be two and a half years.

(2)  The Chairman shall be eligible for re-appointment.

(2A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1)
and (2), the term of the Chairman shall be governed in accordance with
the relevant provisions as in force prior to the comir.g into force of the
Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 as if such
relevant provisions have not been amended by the Amending Act,
2015, till a new Chairman is appointed upon the general elections of
the Corporations held after the date of the commencement of the
Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015.”.

4. In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 25, -

(1) for sub-sections (5), (6), (7) and (8), the following sub-sections
shall be substituted, namely :-

“(5) The term of the members of the Transport Committee
shall be two and a half years :

Provided that such term shall not extend beyond the
term of the Corporation.

[ PART IV

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of.
2015.



PART 1V] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 34 of
1964.

(6) The members shall be eligible for re-appointment.

(7) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (5)
and (6), the term of the existing members of the Transport
Committee shall be governed in accordance with the relevant
provisions as in force prior to the coming into force of the Gujarat
Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 as if such
relevant provisions have not been amended by the Amending Act,
2015, till a new Transport Committee is constituted upon the
general elections of the Corporations held after the date of the
commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015.”.

5 In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 27, for sub-
sections (1) and (2), the following sub-sections shall be substituted,
namely:-

118 The Transport Committee shall at its first meeting which
shall be held on the same day of its constitution appoint one of its
member to be the Chairman. The term of the Chairman shall be two
and a half years.

(2) The Chairman shall be eligible for re-appointment.

(2A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections (1)
and (2), the term of the existing Chairman shall be governed in
accordance with the relevant provisions as in force prior to the
coming into force of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015 as if such relevant provisions have not
been omitted by the Amending Act, 2015, till a new Chairman is
appointed upon the general elections of the Corporations held after
the date of the commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities
Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015.”.

6. In the Municipal Corporations Act, in section 30, -

(1)  after sub-section (3), the following sub-section shall be inserted,
namely :- :

“(3A) The term of the members of every Special Committee
appointed by the Corporation upon the general elections held after
the date of the commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities
Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 shall be two and a half years.”;

(2) sub-section (7) shall be deleted.
% In the Gujarat Municipalities Act, 1963 (hereinafter referred to

as “the Municipalities Act”), in section 53, -

(1) existing sub-section (1) shall be renumbered as clause (1) of that
sub-section;

(ii) to clause (1), as so renumbered, the following proviso shall be
mserted, namely :-

15-3

Amendment
of section

27 of Bom.
LIX of 1949,

Amendment
of section

30 of Bom.
LIX of 1949.

Amendment
of section
53 of Guj.
34 of 1949.



15-4

Amendment
of section
55 of Guj.
34 of 1964.

Amendment of
section 59 of
Guj. 34 of
1964.

Amendment of
section 51 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 55 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 61 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Substitution
of section 67
of Guj. 18 of

1993.

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

“Provided that the term of the Executive Committee constituted
upon the general elections held after the date of commencement
of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015
shall be two and a half years.”;

(iii)  after clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted, namely :-
“@i) the members shall be eligible for re-appointment.”.
8 In the Municipalities Act, in section 55, to sub-section (2), the

following proviso shall be inserted, namely :-

“Provided that the term of such committees constituted
upon the general elections held after the date of commencement
of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015
shall be two and a half years.”.

9, In the Municipalities Act, in section 59, to sub-section (2), the
following proviso shall be inserted, namely :-

“Provided that the term of Chairman of any such committee
appointed by the municipality upon the general elections held after the
date of commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015 shall be two and a half years.”.

10.  In the Gujarat Panchayats Act, 1993 (hereinafter referred to as
“the Panchayats Act”), in section 51, in the marginal note, the words
“Sarpanch and” shall be deleted.

11. In the Panchayats Act, in section 55, in sub-section (2), in
clause (iii), for the words “fifty rupees”, the words “five hundred
rupees” shall be substituted.

12.

(D (i) in proviso to sub-section (1), for the words “four months”,
the words “twelve mont_hs” shall be substituted;

(ii) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

In the Panchayats Act, in section 61, -

"Provided, however, that vacancy in the office of a member, if
any, existing on the date of commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015, may not be filled till the
general election is held for re-constituting the panchayat immediately
after coming into force of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015.";

(2) in sub-section (2), the words “Sarpanch or” occurring at two
places shall be deleted.

13. In the Panchayats Act, for section 67, the following section
shall be substituted, namely :-

“67. (1) Save as otherwise provided in the Act, the term of office of
members of a Taluka Panchayat shall be co-extensive with the duration
of the Panchayat.

(2)  The term of office of the President and the Vice-President of a
Taluka Panchayat, save as otherwise provided in this Act, shall be two
and a half years.

[ PART

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj.15
of 2015.

Guj.15
of 2015.

Guj. 18
of 1993.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

IV



PART IV] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-20%5

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

(3)  There shall be called a meeting of the elected members of the
Taluka Panchayat by the competent authority within thirty days before
the expiry of the term of two and a half years for the election of
President and the Vice-President from amongst such elected members.
4) Subject to the other provisions of this section, the President or
the Vice-President shall be eligible for re-appointment.

(5) If, during the term of his office under sub-section (2), the
President or the Vice-President, ceases to be a member of the
Panchayat, he shall vacate the office held by him.

(6)  Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2), the
President or the Vice-President who has completed a period of two-and
a half years on the date of the commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015, shall continue to hold the
office till the remainder term of the Panchayat.”.

14.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 75, -

(1) (1) in proviso to sub-section (1), for the words “four months”,
the words “twelve months” shall be substituted;

(ii) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

"Provided, however, that vacancy in the office of a member, if
any, cxisting on the date of commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015, may not be filled till the
general election is held for re-constituting the panchayat immediately
after coming into force of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015.";

(2)  in sub-section (2), for the word and figures “section 627, the
word and figures “section 63” shall be substituted.

15. In the Panchayats Act, for section 81, the following section
shall be substituted, namely :-

Termof office  “81, (1) Save as otherwise provided in the Act, the term of

of mem:i"s:ii:f office of the members of a District Panchayat shall be co-

panchayatand  e€xtensive with the duration of the Panchayat.

of President _ ’ .
and Vicee (2) ~ The term of office of the President and the Vice-

President.  President of a District Panchayat, save as othérwise provided in

this Act, shall be two and a half years.

(3)  There shall be called a meeting of the elected members
of the District Panchayat by the competent authority within
thirty days before the expiry of the said term of two and a half
years for the election of President and the Vice-President from
amongst such elected members.

(4)  Subject to the other provisions of this section, the
President or the Vice-President shall be eligible for re-election.

(5) If, during the term of his office under sub-section (2),
the President or the Vice-President, ceases to be a member of
the Panchayat, he shall vacate the office held by him.

15-5

Amendment
of section 75
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Substitution of
section 81 in
Guj. 18 of
1993.



15-6

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Amendment of
section 87 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 89 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 91 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment of
section 98 of
Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment
of section 100
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment
of section 123
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

(6)  Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (2),
the President or the Vice-President who has completed a period
of two and a half years as such on the date of the
commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015, shall continue to hold the office till
the remainder term of the Panchayat.”.

16. In .the Panchayats Act, in section 87, in the marginal note, the
word “education” shall be deleted.

17. In the Panchayats Act. in section 89,
(i) in the proviso to sub-section (1), for the words “four

months”, the words “twelve months™ shall be substituted;

(ii) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely:-

"Provided, however, that vacancy in the office of a member, if
any, existing on the date of commencement of the Gujarat Local
Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015, may not be filled till the
general election is held for re-constituting the panchayat immediately
after coming into force of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws
(Amendment) Act, 2015." .

18.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 91, after the existing proviso
the following proviso shall be added, namely :-

“Provided further that in case where such meeting is not called
by the Sarpanch within a period of one month from the date of receipt
of such written request, it shall be competent for the Taluka
Development Officer to call such meeting on such date as may be
specified by him.”.

19.
(1)

In the Panchayats Act, in section 98, —

in sub-section (1), the words “who are not related to any of the
members or the Sarpanch, as the case may be, of the village
panchayat” shall be added at the end;

after sub-section (1), the following Explanation shall be
inserted, namely :-

“Explanation.- For the purposes of this sub-section, the
parents, brother, sister, father-in-law, mother-in-law, husband,
wife, son, daughter, son-in-law, daughter-in-law shall be
deemed to be related to a member or the Sarpanch, as the case
may be, of the village panchayat.”.

20. In the Panchayats Act, in section 100, in sub-section (3), in the
proviso, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand
rupees” shall be substituted. '

(2)

21. In the Panchayats Act, in section 123, in sub-section (9), for
clause (b) and the proviso thereto, the following clause and provisos
thereunder shall be substituted, namely :-

“(b) the term of the Executive Committee and the Social Justice
Committee, shall be two and a half years :

[ PART IV

Guj. 15 of
2015.

Guj. 15 of
2015.



PART 1V] GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj. 15
of 2015.

Guj.15
of 2015.

Provided that the term of the existing Executive Committee which has
not completed a term of two years on the date of commencement of
the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 shall be
two and a half years or till the remainder period of duration of the
Panchayat, whichever is earlier :

Provided further that the term of the existing Social Justice
Committee which has completed a term of two and a half years on the
commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment)
Act, 2015 shall be co-extensive with the duration of the Panchayat.”.

22.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 131, in the proviso to sub-
section (4), for the words “two hundred rupees”, the words “fifteen
thousand rupees™ shall be substituted.

23. In the Panchayats Act, in section 145, -

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (vi), for the word and figures
“section 2417, the word and figures “section 243" shall be
substituted;

(2) for sub-section (9), the following sub-section shall be
substituted, namely :-

“9) @) The term of the committees constituted under sub-
section (1) shall be two and a half years :

Provided that the term of the existing Social Justice Committee
and Education Committee which have completed a term of two and a
half years on the commencement of the Gujarat Local Authorities
Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 shall be co-extensive with the duration
of the Panchayat :

Provided further that the term of the Committees other than the
Social Justice Committee and the Education Committee which have
not completed a term of two years on the date of the commencement
of the Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act, 2015 shall
be two and a half years or till the remainder period of duration of the
Panchayat, whichever is earlier.

(i)  The term of the committee or committees constituted under
sub-section (2) shall not exceed one year.”.

24.  In the Panchayats Act, in section 200, -

(1) in sub-section (1), in clause (xvi), after the word “premises”,
the words “including shops and stalls™ shall be inserted:

(i)  after sub-section (1), the following sub-section shall be
inserted, namely :-

“(1A) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1),
it shall be compulsory for a village panchayat to levy taxes and
fees as referred to in clauses (i), (viii) and (ix) of said sub-
section.”.

15-7

Amendment
of section 131
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment

of section 145
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

Amendment
of section 200
of Guj. 18 of
1993,



15-8

Amendment
of section 243
of Guj. 18 of
1993.

25.

@

(i)

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 10-04-2015

In the Panchayats Act, in section 243, -

in sub-section (1), for the words and figures “sections 104, 200
and 2417, the words and figures “sections 104, 200 and 242~
shall be substituted;

in sub-section (3), for the words “two years”, the words “two
and a half years” shall be substituted.

Government Central Press, Gandhinagar.

[ PART IV



	1962GUJARAT16.pdf
	Guj-1962-The Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act-16.pdf
	Guj-1980-The Gujarat Local Authorities laws (Amendment) Act-13.pdf
	Guj-1990-The Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act-5.pdf
	Guj-2005-The Gujarat Local Authorities Laws (Amendment) Act-17.pdf




