
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act, 1973 
 

31 of 1973 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Judicial Courts, Laws, Civil Courts, Small Cause Courts 
 
Amendment appended: 20 of 1979



M a  Ho. 37 ~~ No. G44U 

EXTRAORDMARY 
- - . . 

Vol. XIVj PRIDAY, DECEMBER 21, 1973]AGRAHAYANB. 30, 18% 

Separate pagiiig Is given to this Part i~ oder tsat i t  mag 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legislature having been assented to by, the 
president on the 14th Decembr 1973, is hereby published for general 

S. S. SHAH, 
Secretary to the Government . of Gujarat, 

Legal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 31 OF 1973. 

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in the 
Gujmat Government Gazette on the 21st Dece~ber, 1973). 

An Act to amend certain laws relating to Judicial courts for 
purposes hereinafter appearing 

It is hereby emdad in the Twenv-fourbb Year of the Republic. of India as , . I  

fouows :- 

I. Thia Act m y  be called the &jarat Judioial Co- Lawn (hndmsnt) 8 h o ~  title, : , 
got, 1973. 

Born. 8. For seofiop 36 of the Bombay Civil Co- A&, - 1889 h d  Bnwtutbh 

xw "ths Civil Courta Ad'), tbe f01Iowbg~ ~eotion shall be a u b s t ! k - I y : -  2r2a6. 
of Bom. rn 1869. of 1869, 

304 
Iv-Esbm-M . . :  , > ,  

. , '  



805 GUS. GOVT. GAZ., EX., DECEMBER 21, lB73IAGRAHAYANA 30, 18D5 [PART IV 

Tsmporarg "35. (1) Where tba offim of the District Judge in a didict fdh or remains 
-my Of mmnt fmm any cause or the District Judge ie prevented from performing offioe of 
D M C ~  hia duties due ta  iUnese or other caw,-- 
s u b  (i) if there is a Joint Judge in such digtrict, the Joint, Judge &U 

assume charge of the Diptrict Court without intomuption to  his o m  duties 
and shall, while so in oharge, exercise all the powers of a District Judge; 

(iq if there is no Joint Judge in the district or if there is s Joint Judge, 
but he is unable to amume charge of the District Court due t o  hia absence 
from the district or my other, reason, the first in rank of the Assidant 
Judges in the didrich &all amume oharge of the Dihrict Court withauk 
intempion to hia ordinary jun'adiction and if there is no h i h t  Judge 
or the Aaaisbnt Judge is m U e  to atlsume cbargo for any reason as afore- 
said, the fir& in rank of the Civil Judgos in the ditrtrict ahall so a m  
sooh charge. 

{2) The Mstant Judge or, as the may be, the Civjl Judge holding ch- 
arge of the Diatrict Court under 8ub-section ( I )  shall, whils so in charge, pr- 
form the duties of e District Judge with respect to  the filing of suits and q p e -  
ah, receiving ~leadings, exemtion of processes, raturn of writa and like 
matters and exercise such powers of a &tdct Judge as may be specified by a 
pneml or special order made by the High Court. 

(3) The Joint Judge, Basistank Judge, orp as the case may be, the CivjI Judge, 
while holding such charge ahall be deignatad 88 Joint Judge, ilssi&nt Juds 
or, as the mse' m y  be, Civil Judge, in charge of tbe didrich. 

(4) The Joint Judge, the Assjhnt Judge, or, as the GW may be, the C i ~ l  
Judge in charge of fhe district ahall continue in such charge until the ofiw 
of the Distxict. Judp may be resumed or assumed by an offiwr duly appointed 
thereto and in -8 other thm those where such officer m resumes or m-~ 
guch charge, tho h i s tant  Judge or, a8 the mae may be, the Civil Judp 
in c h m  shall continue fo be in such charge until the Joint Judge, or aa the - may b, the hidan6 Judge Bhau awum such charge.". 

-4mendmmt 3. Id ~ c t i o n  36 of the Civil Gouda Act,- 
.. of seotion 

as of 
Born. XIVof (or) for the words " m y  delepte to an h&tmt Judge, or in the absence 
1869. -of an Aseidmt Judge, to Civil Judge" the words "may delegab to a ~ o i ~ t  

JU~S, if any, or in the absenm of a Joint Judge, to an A*stant Ju%e or in 
the e k n m  of an hiidant JudgeI to  a civil Judge" sbalI be 8ubat;ituted; 

(Q) for tihe worda "shall be designated histant  or Civil Judge" the words 
'c&ll be deaipted Joint OX Asshbnt or Civil Judge" &sII be mb&itufed, 

Tnmrtion 4; $I the Al&dabad my Courts u, 1961 (hereinhr referred to "the an. 
City &&. A&"), after saction 6 the fohwing section sW bs im&d, namely:- X& 

w- of 
of l#i; t : f r;(: 

1901. 

bwe- t  *46A. (1) In the event of tbe ofice of the Principal Judge falling rema- " inin(l earn* from any or in the event of big being prevenkd 
oh*rp4at'.; ome of , I '  $6- du&s due to iheas or otbe. cam,  the first in m& of the o tbr  

Jiid$kr of the City Court shall, without inbmption to hie o m  duties, assume 

ddng , 
of the office of the Principal Judge and while so in charge 

I v-0~. ' ~ r f ~ m  dl the duties and exmi= the powem of the PrjncipJ Judge 
d r  this Act or my other law for the time being in force. 



P a ~ r  IT] GUJ. QOVT. CIA%, EX., DECEMBER 21, 1973IAGRARAYANA 30, 1896 308 

(2) The Judge so assuming charge ahall continue in such charge uhtil tb 
oioe o f t  he Prinoi pal Judge m y  be resumed or agsumed by an dcer duly app- 
ointed thereto.". 

I L 

ad. 61 In neation 11 of the city Courts A&, &r sub-eection (81, the fobwing Amsndmant 
XI" iub-motion ahall be added, mmly:- of section of 11 of auj. 
1981. XIX of 

Isst. 

' "(8) The Judge specified in sub-seotion ( I )  may, with the approval of the 
' Hi& Court, mske any cba'nge in the days to  be so okrved aa holidxtya lor 

vaoation, if at any bime &r the publication of such lid; eitcumstances render 
if newasary foi him to do so and suoh change b U  be published in +he 
offkid crcxaelle.". 

6. h mction 14 of the City &U*B Act, afbr mb-section~(4), the fohwing sub- Amendment XIX 
,f wotion s h d  be added, mme1y:- of motion 
IQfil. 14 of 

Uuj. XIX 
of 1M1. 

"(5) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-sections ( I ) ,  (2) and (4), 
where a public notification under article 237 of the Constitution has been i m d  
in relation to such class of Magietrates, the power t o  appoint Magidrates under 
this wction shall be exercised subject to  the terma of the said notifiation and 
in a cat3e where, in view of the isaue of suub notification, the power to appoint 
any Magistrate veda in the High Court, the term of appointment of such 

&a11 be such as the High Court may diract.". 

Gum 7. In the City Courts Act, after section 14, the following aedion shall be Ineertiond 
X" inserted, namsly:- @&ion 14A 
of 18 Gnj. XIX 
1061. of LOBL. 

"14 8. ( I )  h the event of the offim of the Chief &gi~trah falling or rema- ~ m w e r o e n t  

idng vaosnt from any came or in the event of hia being praventsd fmm par- ziFmB 
forming his duties due to  illness or other muse, the firat in rank of the other charge of 
Magistrabes for the City of Ahmedabad shall, without interruption to his own offioa of 

the Chief dutiea, aasumo charge of the office of the Chief Magmtrate and while so in figiatrats 
oharge shall perform all the dutiea and exercise all the powem of the Chief duria 
BlqgBtmta under the Criminal Procedure Code or any other law for the time y'Lmnoy. 
b ing  in form. 

(2) The Magistnib so asauming charge aha11 continue in such charge until the 
offica of the Chief Magiatrate may be resumed or a m e d  by an offiwr duly 
appointed thereto.". 

Xv of 8. In the Pmaidenoy Small Cause Court8 Ad,  1882, in its apfioation t o  the '"" City of Abmedabad, after section 8A the fallowing section aball be inserted, of in aection ~ o t  xv 8B 
namely:- of 1882. 



307 GUJ.. GOVT. GB. , .  BX, DECEMBER 21, 19731AaRAHAYANA 30, 1805 [ Pam ,m 

Arrangement 
-to 
m w  
% E m  or 
Chlef Judge 
ddng 
vwsnqi 

I "BB.(I) In the 0-t of the office of the Chief Judge fdhg or lemaining vacrat I - ,b any ~ n a e  or in thesevent of his b e i i  prevenkd from perforping his I 
dutiea due to illneaa or other o a w ,  the firat in rank of the other Judgw of 
the Court of b a l l  Cauaea of Ahmdabad &U, without inhrruption ta I 

awn duties, a;saume b r $ e  of trhe d c a  of the Chief Judge' d w h h  t m:ia . 
h r g e  shall p&form d the duties and exem& dl the powdm of, t l i e~cmi~  
Judge under this ht or any other law for the time being in fom, . I 

I 

(8). The. Judge- m wqming oharge ahall conthue~in mob. & r g e . u ~ M ~ ~  
o@w of. @- QhieE Jude may be resumed or wumed by t)~! ofioes: ..dqlJ 

. . 
! 

appointed th~rntam"., 
, . , 

. . ,. 1 -- : :  
1 



Extra Ho. 24 REGISTERED NO. G/GNR/Z. 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY -- 

- - - - - - - -. - - - - - .. ? 

lrol. XT;] PHlDAlr? AUGUST 31 ! 19i9/13IJXDRd 9: 1901 
. .. -. - - -- - . " - - +--- __.___m- e -:-- 

&ah paging ts ptbcn to ihb ~a i order tbrl II mm, 

Acts of the Gojarat kgblafure and Winances promulgated and 

'Yhe followink Act of the Gujarat Legislature having k e n  ;~ssel~ted to by tile 
President on the 13th August, 1979 is hereby published for general ir~formation. 

N. B. PATEI,, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

1,cgal Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 20 OF 1979. 

 first published, after having received the asscnt of the Presidei~t iu fie 
'iC;irj(/rflt Government Guzette" on the 31 st August, 1979). 

AN ACT 

further to amend the Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869. and the Presiderlcy Smzll 
Cause Courts Act, 1882, in its application to the City of Ahmedabad, 

for the purposes hereafter appearing. 

It is hereby enacted in the Thirtieth Year of the Republic of India as follows :-- 

1. ( I )  This Act may be called the Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amend- short title 

ment) Act. 1979. n nd 
wmmenm- 
n~nnt.  

<?) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may by 
notification in the Official G~zeite,  appoint 



Ameridm~zlb 2. In the Bombay Civil a u r t s  Act, 1869 (hereinafter referred to i d s  "thc Civil R,,, 
of spctiou 
16 ,,f R,,~,,. Courts Act''), in section 16,- XIV 

t r f  
XII' I)I' 1889 . 
1869. 

( I )  for the words "does not amount to fifteen thousand rupees in" the 
words "is 0$ any" shall be substituted; and 

(2) for the words "ten thousand rupees" the words "twenty thousa~ld 
rupees" shall be substituted. 

Amolldmrnt 3. 111 the Civil Courts Act, in ssction 24,- 
of aectiw~ 
g4 of 
Bcm. XIV ( I )  for the words ."ten thousand rupcs" the words "twcnly thousa~id 
of 1869. rupees" shall he substituted; 

(2) the proviso shaH be deleted. 

h , , , r .  4. h the Civil Courts Act, in section 26, for the words "ten thousiknd rupees" 
merit the words "twenty thousand rupees" shall be substituted. sootiotl 26 
of Bnm. 
XIV r r f  
1869. 

A r n ~ ~ l r l ~ ~ ~ u t  5, In the Civil Courts Act, in section 28A, in sub-section (2), for the words 
of w C+,~OII 

ZBA uf "ten thousand rupees" the words "twenty thousand rupees" shall IK scbslituted 
Bon~.  XIV 
of 186P. 

A w r i d -  6. In the Presidelicy Small Cause Courts Acl, 1 882, in its applicati:)~~ to the xv f 
mcnt of  
8po,io11 ls City of Ahmedabad (hereinafter referred lo as "tlie Small Cause Courts Act''?, 1g82m 

of ~ i o t  in section 18, for the words "three thousand rupees" wherever they occur, the 
Xv 1 88-2. Of words "live thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 

Anwndmor:t, 7. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 20, for the words "three thousand 
4 rf st*ctil)n 

of rupes" wherever they occur, the words "five thousand rupzes" shall be substituted. 
Aot XV 
r r f  1882. 

Xlurrldnl~lit 8. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 22, in clause (b), for the words 
4' aeotion 
2 2  of ACL "three tholi~and rupees" the words "five thousand rupees" shaH be substituted. 
XV of 
1882. 

Amorillrurrkt 9. In the Small Cause Courts Act, in section 41, for the words "rhree 
-nf eeot ia~n 
-41 ~ c t  thousand rupees" the words "five thousarld rupes" shall be substituted. 
-XV of  
I8B2. 

AmPndmer't 14). I n  the Small &use Courts Act, in the Fourth Schedule, \he follotving of Fnurtl~ 
Schrdidr entries shall be added at the end, namely : - 



PART I \ ]  GUJ. (;V\'T. GAZ., EX., dUI;U8T XI, 19i?I/IIHAUK,I 9, 1901 1 9P 

11. N~twithsfandiig anything contained in the Bombay Civil Courts Ad, hdngs* 
of 1869 or the Presidency Small Cause Courts Act, 1882, as amend4 by this Act,- 
1889. 
XV of 
1882. ( I )  all suits and proceerlings of a civil nature pending, immediately before 

the date on which this Act conies into Eorce, in the specified court sllall he 
continued in that court as i f  this Act bad not been passed and Illat specified 
court sball have for thc purpose of the said sui~s and proceedings all jurisdic- 
tion and pwers  which i t  had immediately bercw the day on which this Act 
conles into force; 

(2) ao appeal or applicatiori for revision in respect of any suils or proceed- 
ings so continued under clause ( I )  in any specifier1 court shall lie to ~hr:  court 
which would have appellate or, as the case may bc, revisional jurisdit:tion and 
that court shall entertain and dispose of the appeal or applicatio~l as if the 
proceedings were instituted in that court before the date on which this Act 
comes into force; 

(3) all applications for the executio~~ or enforcement of a decree or order 
of a specified court passed immediately before the day on which this Act 
conies into force and all other applicatior~s arising out of such decrre or order 
shall be made to and disposed of by that court as if this Act had nor been 
passed. 

Explonatio~~.-The expression "specified court" means the caul-t of the Civil 
Iudge (Junior Division) or that of the Civil Judge (Senior Division) nr the 
Ahmedabad City Civil Court. 

PRINITD AT THE GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, GANDHINAGAR. 


	1973GUJARAT31.pdf
	Guj-1973-The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act-31.pdf
	Guj-1979-The Gujarat Judicial Courts Laws (Amendment) Act-20.pdf




