
 

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS 
Legislative Research (PRS).  The contents of this document have been obtained from sources 
PRS believes to be reliable.  These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS 
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness.  In 
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available.  Principal Acts 
may or may not include subsequent amendments.  For authoritative text, please contact the 
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the 
gazette notification.  Any person using this material should take their own professional and 
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document.  PRS or any persons 
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document.  PRS or any 
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress 
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document. 

 

 
 

 
 

The Bombay Aerial Ropeways (Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2004 
 

20 of 2004 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Keyword(s): 
Aerial Ropeways, Compensation 
 



Extra No. 22 . , REGISTERED NO. GIGMU2 

EXTRAORDINARY 
PUlBILISHJ3D BY AUTHOmY 

Vol.XLV1 FRIDAY, JUNE IS, 2004IJYAISTHA 28,1926 

Separate paging is given to tbis Part in order that it 
may bi' Hed as a w t e  Compbht .  

PART-  I V  
~ c t s  ofthe ~darat Legislature aod Ordinances promulgated 

and Regulations made by the C;overno~. 

The following Act of the Gujarat Legisfature, having been assented 
to by the Governor on the 1 7 ~ ~  June, 2004 is hereby published for general 
information. 

S. S. PARMAR, 
Secretary to the Government of Gujarat, 

Legislative and Parliamentary Affairs Department. 

GUJARAT ACT NO. 20 OF 2004. 
. ., 

(First published, after having received the assent of the Governor in 
the "Gujarat Government Gazetfe", on the 18' June, 2004). 

AN ACT 

further to amend the Bombay Aerial Ropeways Act, 1955. 

It is hereby enacted in the ~ift~afth Year of the Republic of hdis 
as follows:- 

1. ( I )  This Act may be called the Bombay Aerial Ropeways Short title and 

{Gujarat Amendment) Act, 2004. commencement. 

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State 

Government may, by nbtification in the Oflciial 

Gmerte, appoint. 
XV- EX-%. I 



Amendment of 
section 3 of 
Bom.111 of 1956. 

Amendment of 
section 5 of 
Boln.III of 1956. 

Amendment of 
section 7 of " 

Born.111 of 1956. 

G U J A R A T G O V E R N M E N T G ~ ,  EX. 18-6-2004 kPhK1 1 V  

In the Bombay Ael-in1 Ropeways Act, 1955 (hereinafter Eom.lII of 1956. ; 

referred to as "the principal Act") , in section 3 ,  for 
sub-section (21, the following shall be substituted, 

namely:- 

"(2) The Advisory Board shall consist of a 

Chairperson who shall be the Chief Electrical Inspector 

and seven other members to be appointed by the State 

Government amongst the persons hauin'g know ledge or 

experience in the fields of ropeway, structural, 

mechanical, electrical and metallurgical engineering: 

Provided that the.Board rnay invite an expert in the 

meeting of the Board and such invitce may take part i n  

thc mncetiiigs but shall not have right to vote irr the 

meeting.". 

3. Xn the principal Aci, in sectioii 5 ,  the following words 

shall be added at the end, namely:- 

"and the rules made thereunder and in co~lforrnity with 

the provisions of the relevant code of practice of the 

Rurenu of  Indian S:andxd.". 

In llle pl-iilcipal Act, in sccticn '7, after clause (0, the 

following clauses shall be added, namely:- 

"(gj a description of basic engineering design and 

risk analysis of rnpeway. scllernes for safety 

recluirements and crnergerlcy plan for rescue 

operations; 

(h) drawings showing the electrrcal layouts control 

circuits, lighting circuits and earthing systems; 
. . 

( i )  such other inforn~alio~l and documents as rnay 

prescl-i bed.". 



PART IV GUJARA.~ G O ~ ~ N M E N T  GAZETIT., EX. 18-6-2004 

Period~ca) 

inspecllon 

nfler 

opening of 

ncrinl 

m l ~ w a v .  

In the principal Act; im section 9, in sub-section (4), in Anlend~nent or 
c n r t i r ~ n  O ?f 

clause (vi). the foliowine words shall be added at the ki;l;;;;of 11)5(> :; 
end, namely:- 

"and the requirement of the certificate of a recogniscd 

resting laboratory of the midjor materials to be used and 
essential for the safety of the inskallatjon.". 

. - 

In the principal Act, after section 14, the following ncw Insertion of new 
section 14A in 

section shall be inserted, namely:- Rom.lII of 1956. 
"14A. (1) Every aerial ropeway shall be inspected by 

the Inspector at least once in a year. 

(2) nefore the .~nit ial  inspection is c a ~ r i e d  out by the 

Inspector under section 14 or the periodical inspection 

under sub-section ( I ) ,  the promoter shall also submit a 
report of inspection oillried out by an agency 

authorlscd hy the Advisory Board in this behalf.". 

7. In the principal Act. after section 19, the following new [nsertiut) of rlew 
sections 19A and 

sections shall be inserted, namely:- I9B in Bom.lll 

lllsurance "19A ( I )  The promoter of every aerial ropeway sha~i '  obtain a 
against 
the third policy of insurance in respect of the aerial ropcway 
party risk. from an authorised insurer recognised under the 

relcvan: instirancc law. 

(2) 'The policy of insurance obtained by the promoter 

under sub-section (1) shall cover the insurance of the 

person traveling in  the aerial ropeway including those 
persons employed by the promoter in cunnectlun wick 

the operation of such aerial ropeway against any 
liability which may be incurred by him in respect of 

the death of or bodily injury to any person including of 
t le g o d s  or his authorized I-epresentatives carried in 

the aerial ropcway or darn& to any propel-fy of third 
party caused by or arjsing out of the use of aerial 

ropcway. 



22-4 GUJARAT GOW3NMENT G m ,  EX. 18-6-2004 PART TV 

Liability .19B. ( I  ) Where death or pamment disablement of any person 
to Pay 
compensa h e  E S Q ! ~ ~  frm. 8n arxirlent arising out of the use of 
tioa on aerial ropeway, the promoter or promoters of the aerial 
the 
principles ropeway shaii jointly and severaiiy, te liable to pay 
of no 
fault. 

compensation in respect of such death or disablement 
of any person. 

(2) The amount of compensation to b paid under sub- 
section (1) shall be a fixed sum of rupees two lacs in 
case of death of any person and rupees fifty thousand 
in case of permanent disablement of any person and in 

the case of minor injuries such sum not exceeding 
rupees twenty-five thousand as may be determined by 
the Advisory Board, 

(3) A claim for compensation under sub-section (1) shall 
neither be defeated by reason of any wrongful act, 

neglect or default of the person in respect of whose 
death or permanent disablement, the claim has k e n  

made nor shdl k quantum of cornpensahon 
recoverable in respect of such death or pernlanent 

disablement be reduced on the basis 'of the share of 

such person in the responsibility for such death ar 

permanent disablement. 

(4) The right to claim compensation under this section in 

respect of death or ' peimanent disabIement of any 
person shall k in addrtson to the right of any such 
person to claim compensation in respect thereof under 
any other I aw for the time being in force: 

Provided ihat the amount of compensation 

payable under any other law for the death or bodily 
I .  

injury shall be reduced from the amount of 

compensation payable under !his section.". 



PART 1V GUJARATGOVERNMENT GAZETT'i:!. EX. 18-6-2004 - 73-5 - 

8. In the prirlcipal Acl. in  section 20.- Amcadmcnt oT 
section 10 of 
Bom.IH of 1956. 

1 fol-the111ords"sendnotice of the a c c i d e ~ ~ ~ l o r h e S t a ~ e  

Government and to the Inspector", rhe wol-ds "give 

intimation to the State C;ovei-~~~nent i t t~d to the 

Inspector and send rt notice of rhc accident to  he Stale 

Govelnment and to the Inspector. i n  such form and 

within such period as may be prescribed " shall be 

(2) for the words "Greater Bombay, to the Cornmissionel- 

of Police", the words "Commissioner of Police in the 

City area" shall be substituted. 

9. In the prir~cipal Act, in section 29, for the words Amendment of 
section 29 of ROIII. 

"~,evision by the District Jtrdge", the words "revision by 11, 1956, 
n judge of the City Clivil Courl in the city of 

Ahmedabad and elsewhere by thc District Judge" shall 

be substituted. 

10, In the principal Act, in section 30, in the E- planation, Amendmentof 

for the words and figures "the Indian Companies Act, section 30 of Bom. 
111 of 1956. 

1913", the words and figures "the Companies Act, 

1956" shall be substituted. . .  

11. In the principal Act, in section 33, i n  sub-section (2),- Amendment of 
section 33 of Born. 

(1) after clause (c), the following clause shall be af 1956. 
inserted, namely:- 
"(cc) fails to carry out inspection under sub- 

section-(2) of section 14A,or"; 

(2) after clause (e), the following clauses shall be 
inserted, name1 y:- 

"(ee) fails to obtain policy of insurance under 

sub- section(1) of section 1 PA; or 

(eee) fails to pay within reasonable time, 

compensation payable under section 19I3, or"; 



Amendment 
u l  section 34 
of Bonl. 111 
of 1956. 

Amendment 
of section 35 
of Born. I11 
of 1956. 

Amendment 
of section 42 
of Bam.ltI of 
1956. 

GUJARAT WVERNhlENT GAZEJTE, EX. 1 8-6-2004 

(3) for the words "two hundred rupees", the words 
"ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted: 

(4) for the words "fifty rupees". the words "two 

thousand five hundred rupees" shall be 

substituted; 

( 5 )  for the words "one thousand rupees". the 

words "fifty thousand rupees" shall be 
substituted. 

12. In principal Act, in section 34, for the words "two 

hundred rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall 

be substituted. 

13. In the principal Act, in section 35, for the words "two 

hundred rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall 

bc substituted. 

14, In the principal Act, in section 42, in sub-scction ( I ) ,  

for the figures "14, 15, 16, 17", the figures and letters 

" 14, 14A, 15, 16, 17, 19A, 19B" shall be substituted, 

[PART IV 

15. In the principal Act, in section 45, in sub-section (2)- 
A mendmen t 
of sect ion 45 
of hmr1I OF 
1956. 

(1) after clause (a), the following clauses shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

"(aa) construction, opening, maintaining and 
working of aerial ropeway under section 5 ;  

(aaa) other information and documents which 

shall contain with the application under section 7 ;  "; 

(2) in clause (d), for sub-clause (vi), the following 

sub-clauses shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(vi) the conduct of the employees of the promoter and 

the requirements, qualifications and experience of such 
employees; 



PART TV 

.- 

GUJARAT GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, EX. 1 8-6-2004 

"(vi-a) the provision regarding emergency plan 

covering risk assessment connected with such 

operation :"; 

(3) in clause (g). for the vI!ords "the accidents of 

which", the words "form in wl-tich, the period within 

which and the accident of which" shall be substituted. 




