The Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam, 2012

Act 11 of 2013

Keyword(s):
Shram Kalyan Nidhi, Labour, Welfare, policy

Amendment appended: 20 of 2014

DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.




T IR WWWw.govtpressmp.nic.in
Y off TRA e fFar o g R,

HHE 45] Nurer, 9faR, feqie 2 wEd 2013—H 13, 36 1934

fafy six faurht = favm
o, feaiw 2 wad 2013

. 746-42-FFhG-31- (1. )-3ify. —aemyeyr faum wwr o fr=fafea sfufem g w s 28 swadt
2013 ! HEMEH THI™ H ATAM TR B FH ¢, TWGEN TAEHERY F el F fdd weive e
S R

TGRS & TSI & A9 9 ql STRUNER,
TAYT ATET, AR Fiedl.

HeAYeoT Affam
A R WY 023
TeEAWSIT STH ShodTuT T (Honed ) rfuf=m, 2093

[ Tiier 3¢ STall, R0¢3 T TaITE Sht STTAT AT §2 ; STFHIT ' HeayeyT Treus ( 3rarerr )", ¥ famiew 3 wiad, R0e3
T YT S WeRTITE &t 7%, |

TEAWRYT W Shoaror iy arfufam, ¢ WY of viifim A ¥ erfufmm.

s TR 3 e o 4 meARw faum-vtee g Frerffan w1 9 ERERT @

% (%) 38 stfufrm B Wi T Aoy an wean fify (dee) s, 02 8w A ol
(R) I8 WTH ¥ 3HF YHRE & a@ ¥ JII ML

. AEYSY g9 weam fafy sifufrm, 9243 (. 38 W 2R¢3) (SN TUY THUH UVEN U e R w1 EEiEE.
sfufra & w9 e ®) &ty R # wue (3) ¥ Su-wve (W) ¥, I YUF E9R BF 9
TR F WE R, I T TR T wiyg feu W,

3. 7o stfufwm =t uw R °,— &I { T HTE.
(TH) 399N (R) & wF |, Frafafaa sogm wnfim w5t S, su9iq —

“(R) it e wEER # A TR TR & R # fed Fever ad # (s1ufq
Sl ¥ feger a%) dw B feadl @ oo wan €, @ i yEE wHE N
o e W H (g 30 S e 3% femRR @) < sifwe @l WH Hed

89



90 Heqyey Teas, fedie 2 wadt 2013

TH T Tl iR Tow @ wHuR % fau feee g T9E B8 WM W 23
AT #T @HH 9 TS BT e

T TOF BT A9 H e F ofiem & W % T9R UY O T8 9 wH el
@Tﬂﬂn;

(@) SuEw (3) # T W ¥ W W, wen wife fF W sk Se% g
FrrefafEa W ST WY, sfeffq i—

Y gy O SR gy SEE W OEHTW B O B AW Sk Y8 AUSd &I & A S
FrAEy F SEE # fM JraH FH W, FEISE # 9 giewa @ g
ufr § SCh dW ITH BT UG H FEEYE GG FH F IR AR W
I g A, S 5 <w wiea @ et & €, eifvdifue feen smom Sk
o 59 XN g, SAfuge gr, stauiia feran s, '

ORI 3% &T ¥, qa Afufag = ¥’y 38 H,—
(T&) 39U (R) H,—
(F) w9 (&) ¥ 7= ‘U= 9 v % WE W, T ‘U9 geR w98’ Tifia
e S,
(B) @ug (W) ¥ v ‘T BR T ¥ W W, v ''T9 geR w9 wfud
[ELESII® |
(M TWFE o' ‘te@ @ R F OF R I 'Y e v wfim few Sg;
(B STEW (R) H v YD TR TR % W W, v C'eg R T’ i
[EL SIS
are, e 2 wad 2013

. 747-42-3FhIH-3- (1) -3 —Ra & If9um F STt 348 & WU (3) & ST H, HEASY 49
weam Aty (Eiem) sfafem, 2012 (GFHE 11 9§99 2013) &1 ST SIER TR % WYUHR 9 Taagl SRR
IERIASIGIES

TAYY % TIUE & M 9 q STRLER,
YT e, TR gfed.

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 11 or 2013

THE MADHYA PRADESH SHRAM KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2012.

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 28th January, 2013; assent first published in the “Madhya Pradesh
Gazette (Extra-ordinary)’’, dated the 2nd February, 2013.]

An Act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the Sixty-third year of the Republic of
India as follows :—

Short title and 1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan)
Commencement. -
Adhiniyam, 2012.

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.



YRy e, faqie 2 wEd 2013 90 (1)

2. In Section 2 of the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982 (No. 36 of 1983) gm?ﬂdlzneﬂf of
(hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), in clause (3), in sub-clause (b), for the words “one thousand ection 2.
and six hundred rupees” , the words “ten thousand rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In Section 9 of the Principal Act,— Amendment of
Section 9.

(i) for sub-section (2), the following sub-section shall be substituted, namely :—

“2) If the name of the employee stands on the register of an establishment on
thirty working days in a calendar year (that is January to December), the
amount of contribution payable every six months, (that is on 30th June and
on 31st December) by every employee shall be ten rupees only and by an
employer for each such employee shall be thirty rupees payable every six
months :

Provided that the employer’s contribution payable every six months shall not be less
than one thousand five hundred rupees.”;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for full stop, the colon shall be substituted and thereafter the
following proviso shall be added, namely :—

“Provided that an incentive amount of five percent shall be given to employer on
advance payment of two or more period of contribution before six months
ending of 15th day of July and 15th day of January to the Board and such
percentage of fine shall be imposed as determined by the State Government,
by notification, which shall not exceed ten percent, on payment after ending
of said six months period.”.

4. In Section 31 of the Principal Act,— Amendment of
Section 31.
(1) in sub-section (1),—

(a) in clause (a), for the words “five hundred rupees”, the words “five thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(b) in clause (b), for the words “one thousand rupees”, the words “ten thousand rupees”
shall be substituted;

(c) in the proviso, for the words “one hundred rupees”, the words “two thousand
rupees” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “two thousand rupees”, the words “twenty thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

Trrei=reh, WIS EW Qo EH WREH, WERY ER YNEN S qRned, s 9 g a9 weiem—2013.



EREERIEC www.govtpressmp.nic.in q
off T=7 @re fFan s gk B

FHF 637] rare, TR, e 30 femgmer 2014—diw 9, 31 1936

fafy ok faurh =d faum
ofrare, famie 30 fewmar, 2014

. 7512-347-3FRIG-31- (1) -, — ey foum e @ frefafeg sfufem fg w few 20 fEwR 2014
T TSI HEIGT H1 STIAM I €1 GH ¥, TACGR WAMER B NHbN o yehifa oA s .

TAYT F TSI F AH F q7 SRR,
TSYT 9qEd, TR gied,

[eayuayT Aty

HHE R0 HH 0¥

TEYSIT STH HedTuT A ( |9ier ) 1, 209%

[feier 29 femm, 2014 1 TooU T STIHa W g8, STAf ¢ meyee IS (erareme) N s
30 fe@mr, 2014 ®1 9aW IR YHIE & . ]

HeAUQYT $T swearor fafir sifufem, ¢kex w3 weifum e B erfufem.
IR TORST & Yued ad # memew faum-dea g frefafed v § uw stfufafe 81—
2. () 39 Afufrag @ dfea am aegyey 9| e ffy (Feie) erfafiem, 09% ®.
(R) T TEAYSR TS H 3HF RN K1 GRIG T Jg9 . WA,

R. WEAUCY g9 Fedml Aty sfafamd, 02¢’ (FHIF 38 U 2%¢3) (ST TUH THH YYOI Yol 4T -
gfufsa & 7w 9 ffde 8) @ 4/ -7 F uvem, eng-3 H, frefafea o ora s @i Sy, s
EJQﬁH\ = '
“oy-T, T afufad % R o sudy A sfafdy fRE O ¥ TN gu o, W, omiw g, (el g
ot Fremsten =1 Toran gR1 Aol &I Huifta i 31 gfaded aen faeRfom W wvip forraified
H % ford gAfea wwy wwfead (feamsa) & gt @ erfergfaa o g g g PRt

1273



1274 ey TSiTE, feAiw 30 fewwr 2014
W] TR IR 3l sifyer@ &1 sregelira o1 fesfiea wife # duif@ &0 & ol 139
EagEcTi
T R¢ T . 3. qo IfufEm il ur j¢ & i W, frefafea g i s, stfd -
2. “R¢ (R) @ afufrm A o @ off 9, s, oy oIk weaw 3w faw sifufrm, Jo0g
(Ro0€ T 9) & T YeH ST F Y H Fiiiha Foret e A it ww
EIRSIUNE L
() SUYR () & SUEHl & B gU off, 75T WFR, A SHH TuieM 81 o § fF e
F feq § o &N omewasw €, fordl §ad SEm a1 ga| el % O A 9SH
T w1 e, AR ®Y Y A YOl wY QA A GHM,
Freaeragta. ¥, () HEAUS #9 weare iy Heiea e, oy (FHIE ¢ W Roe¥) Taggn Frfdd

IERIBSIGI

(R) T AARY % FRIGT T/ g o, T 212y & 1t &) 7 g 919 A1 T HIE HRAE
9 iy & qoorh Sysl & o1 WY S WG A Sl TS HRAE wHsh Smu.

g9, feqim 30 faamr 2014

. 7513-347-3RRIG-3A(Y1. ) 3AY..— IRA & WauH % STwET 348 % @UE (3) & AT H, FEAYRLY 9 HeAl
e (gene) sifafem, 2014 (FH1 20 T 2014) 1 SIS STER TSI & MHR ¥ Taggrt yeifem fhan s 2.

Short title and
commencement.

Insertion of sec-
tion 14-D.

Consolidated
forms to maintain
registers  and
records and fur-
nishing of report
and returns by
employers.

TGRS & oI & 9 § g1 STCHER,
THAIT ATed, TR giea,

MADHYA PRADESH ACT
No. 20 oF 2014

THE MADHYA PRADESH SHRAM KALYAN NIDHI (SANSHODHAN) ADHINIYAM, 2014

[Received the assent of the Governor on the 29th Decemeber 2014; assent first published in
the “Madhya Pradesh Gazette (Extra-ordinary)”’, dated the 30th December, 2014].

An act further to amend the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyam Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982.

Be it enacted by the Madhya Pradesh Legislature in the sixty-fifth year of the Republic of India
as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhiniyam,
2014,

(2) It shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Madhya Pradesh Gazette.

2. After section 14-C of the Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi Adhiniyam, 1982
(No. 36 of 1983) (hereinafter referred to as the Principal Act), the following section shall be inserted,
in Chapter III, namely:—

“14-D. Notwithstanding anything contained in any other provision of the Act, Gvoernment may,
by order, devise or notify consolidated forms for maintaining registers and furnishing reports and
returns by an employer or establisement :



Heyey TS, feAiew 30 fewrer 2014

1274 (1)

Provided that the Government may allow the registers and records to be maintained in
computerised or digital formats.”.

3. For section 28 of the principal Act, the following section shall be substituted, namely:—

“28. (1) Nothing in this Act shall apply to an establishment or industrial entity classified
as 'Micro Industry’ under the Micro, small and Medium Enterprises Development
Act, 2006 (No. 27 of 2006).

(2) Notwithstanding the provisions of sub-section (1), the State Government may withdraw,
partially or fully, any exemption granted to any Micro Industry or category of
Micro Industries, if it is satisfied that it is so required in the interest of workers.”.

4. The Madhya Pradesh Shram Kalyan Nidhi (Sanshodhan) Adhyadesh, 2014 (No. 8 of 2014)
is hereby repealed.

(2) (1) Notwithstanding the repeal of the said Ordinance, any thing done on any action
taken under the said Ordinance shall be deemed to have been done or taken under the
corresponding provisions of this Act.

Substitution of
section 28.

Exemption

Repeal and
saving.

FeiTen, RIS R QT e S, BTy g Ve S qeuner, i § qigd aen w2014



