
DISCLAIMER: This document is being furnished to you for your information by PRS
Legislative Research (PRS). The contents of this document have been obtained from sources
PRS believes to be reliable. These contents have not been independently verified, and PRS
makes no representation or warranty as to the accuracy, completeness or correctness. In
some cases the Principal Act and/or Amendment Act may not be available. Principal Acts
may or may not include subsequent amendments. For authoritative text, please contact the
relevant state department concerned or refer to the latest government publication or the
gazette notification. Any person using this material should take their own professional and
legal advice before acting on any information contained in this document. PRS or any persons
connected with it do not accept any liability arising from the use of this document. PRS or any
persons connected with it shall not be in any way responsible for any loss, damage, or distress
to any person on account of any action taken or not taken on the basis of this document.

The Bombay Civil Courts Act, 1869

Act 14 of 1869

Keyword(s):
Appointment of Judges, Alteration and Creation of Dstricts, District Courts,
Joint Judges, Assistant Judges, Civil Judges

Amendment appended: 44 of 2011, 22 of 2015





































XIV of
1869.

MAHARASHTRA ACT No. XXII OF 2015.

(First published, after having received the assent of the President in
the “ Maharashtra Government Gazettee ”, on the 29th July 2015).

An Act further to amend the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act.

WHEREAS it is expedient further to amend the Maharashtra Civil
Courts Act, for the purposes hereinafter appearing ; it is hereby enacted
in the Sixty-sixth Year of the Republic of India as follows :—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Maharashtra Civil Courts
(Amendment) Act, 2015.

Short title
and
commencement.

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ
+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö

´É¹ÉÇ 1, +ÆEò 46] ¤ÉÖvÉ´ÉÉ®úúú, VÉÖ±Éè 29, 2015/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 1937 [ {ÉÞ¹`äö 2, ËEò¨ÉiÉ : ¯û{ÉªÉä 27.00

+ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ Gò¨ÉÉÆEò 84

|ÉÉÊvÉEÞòiÉ |ÉEòÉ¶ÉxÉ

¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ Ê´ÉvÉÉxÉ¨ÉÆb÷³ýÉSÉä +ÊvÉÊxÉªÉ¨É ´É ®úÉVªÉ{ÉÉ±ÉÉÆxÉÒ |ÉJªÉÉÊ{ÉiÉ Eäò±Éä±Éä +vªÉÉnäù¶É ´É Eäò±Éä±Éä Ê´ÉÊxÉªÉ¨É +ÉÊhÉ

Ê´ÉÊvÉ ´É xªÉÉªÉ Ê´É¦ÉÉMÉÉEòbÚ÷xÉ +É±Éä±ÉÒ Ê´ÉvÉäªÉEäò (<ÆOÉVÉÒ +xÉÖ́ ÉÉnù).

In pursuance of clause (3) of article 348 of the Constitution of India, the following
translation in English of the Maharashtra Civil Courts (Amendment) Act, 2015 (Mah. Act
No. XXII of 2015), is hereby published under the authority of the Governor.

By order and in the name of the Governor of Maharashtra,

M. A. SAYEED,

Principal Secretary and
Remembrancer of Legal Affairs to Government,

Law and Judiciary Department.

——————---------------

RNI No. MAHENG/2009/35528

¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö--84-----1
(1)



¨É½þÉ®úÉ¹]Åõ ¶ÉÉºÉxÉ ®úÉVÉ{ÉjÉ +ºÉÉvÉÉ®úhÉ ¦ÉÉMÉ +É`ö, VÉÖ±Éè 29, 2015/¸ÉÉ´ÉhÉ 7, ¶ÉEäò 19372

XIV of
1869.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In section 16 of the Maharashtra Civil Courts Act (hereinafter
referred to as “the principal Act”), for the words “ten lakh rupees” the
words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

3. In section 26 of the principal Act, for the words “ten lakh rupees”
the words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

4. In section 28A of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), for the
words “ten lakh rupees” the words “one crore rupees” shall be substituted.

5. After section 28B of the principal Act, the following section shall
be inserted, namely :—

“28C. On the commencement of the Maharashtra Civil Courts
(Amendment) Act, 2015, all appeals in which the amount or value of
the subject matter does not exceed one crore rupees and pending
before the High Court immediately before such commencement, shall
stand transferred to the concerned District Court and such District
Court may deal with such appeal from the stage which was reached
before such transfer or from any earlier stage or de-novo as such court
may deem fit:

Provided that, this section shall not apply to any appeals which
are pending before the High Court, which are statutorily provided
under the relevant enactment before such Court.”.

 Amendment of
section 16 of
XIV of 1869.

 Amendment of
section 26 of
XIV of 1869.

 Amendment of
section 28A  of

XIV of 1869.

Transfer of
pending
appeals.

Mah.
XXII of
2015.

 Insertion of
section 28C

in XIV of
1869.

ON BEHALF OF GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERYAND PUBLICATION, PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY SHRI PARSHURAM JAGANNATH GOSAVI,
PRINTED AT GOVERNMENT CENTRAL PRESS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004 AND PUBLISHED AT DIRECTORATE OF
GOVERNMENT PRINTING, STATIONERYAND PUBLICATIONS, 21-A, NETAJI SUBHASH ROAD, CHARNI ROAD, MUMBAI 400 004,  EDITOR : SHRI PARSHURAM
JAGANNATH GOSAVI.


	1869MH14
	2011MH44



